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based on the closing price of $4.42 per share as reported on the New York Stock Exchange. (For purposes of calculating this amount, all
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PART I

Item 1. Business
General

The Registrant, The Colonial BancGroup, Inc. (BancGroup, Colonial or the Company) is a Delaware corporation organized in 1974 as a bank
holding company under the Bank Holding Company Act of 1956, as amended (the BHCA). BancGroup was originally organized as Southland
Bancorporation, and its name was changed in 1981. Pursuant to the Riegle-Neal Interstate Banking and Branching Efficiency Act of 1994,
BancGroup consolidated its various banking subsidiaries into Colonial Bank. Pursuant to the Gramm-Leach-Bliley Financial Services
Modernization Act (Gramm-Leach), BancGroup elected to become a financial holding company which allows it to affiliate with securities firms
and insurance companies and to engage in other activities that are financial in nature, incidental to such financial activities, or complementary to
such activities.

The principal activity of BancGroup is to supervise and coordinate the business of its subsidiaries and to provide them with capital and services.
BancGroup derives substantially all of its income from dividends received from Colonial Bank. Various statutory provisions and regulatory
policies limit the amount of dividends Colonial Bank may pay without regulatory approval. In addition, federal statutes restrict the ability of
Colonial Bank to make loans to BancGroup.

At December 31, 2008, BancGroup and its subsidiaries had 4,808 full-time equivalent employees. BancGroup�s principal offices are located at
100 Colonial Bank Blvd., Montgomery, Alabama 36117, and its mailing address is: P.O. Box 241148, Montgomery, Alabama 36124.
BancGroup�s telephone number at its principal office is (334) 676-5000.

Subsidiary Bank

Colonial Bank was converted into an Alabama state-chartered non-member bank on June 10, 2008. Its legal name was changed to �Colonial
Bank.� As of December 31, 2008, Colonial Bank had a total of 347 branches, with 197 branches in Florida, 90 branches in Alabama, 19 branches
in Georgia, 21 branches in Texas and 20 branches in Nevada. Colonial Bank conducts a general commercial banking business in its respective
service areas and offers a variety of demand, savings and time deposit products as well as extensions of credit through personal, commercial and
mortgage loans within each of its market areas. Colonial Bank also provides additional services to its markets through wealth management
services, electronic banking services and credit card services. Through its wealth management area, Colonial Bank�s wholly owned subsidiaries,
Colonial Investment Services, Inc., Colonial Investment Services of Florida, Georgia, Nevada and Tennessee offer various insurance products
and annuities for sale to the public. These subsidiaries are regulated by each state�s department of insurance.

Colonial Bank encounters intense competition in its commercial banking business, generally from other banks located in its respective
metropolitan and service areas. Colonial Bank competes for interest bearing funds with other banks and with many non-bank issuers of
securities. Competition also exists with banks in other metropolitan areas of the United States, many of which are larger in terms of capital
resources and personnel. In the conduct of certain aspects of its commercial banking business, Colonial Bank competes with savings and loan
associations, credit unions, mortgage banks, factors, insurance companies and other financial institutions. At December 31, 2008, Colonial Bank
accounted for approximately 99.3% of BancGroup�s consolidated assets.

Other Financial Services Operations

BancGroup�s subsidiary Colonial Brokerage, Inc., a Delaware corporation, provides full service and discount brokerage services and investment
advice and is a member of and is regulated by the Financial Industry Regulatory Authority.
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Executive Overview of Operations and Condition

The financial services industry in the United States is operating today in an exceptionally difficult, uncertain and rapidly changing environment
presenting risks that are difficult to assess and quantify. As of December 31, 2008, BancGroup and Colonial Bank met all applicable regulatory
requirements relating to capital. For the year ended December 31, 2008, however, BancGroup reported a net loss of $880.5 million (including a
net goodwill impairment charge of $534.4 million) compared to net income of $180.9 million in 2007. During 2008, Colonial charged off $642.8
million of loans and recorded a provision for loan losses of $728.9 million, representing substantial increases over the 2007 net charge-offs of
$54.1 million and a loan loss provision of $106.5 million. The results of operations and financial condition of BancGroup and Colonial Bank led
to increased regulatory scrutiny during the fourth quarter.

Because of continued economic uncertainty, the Company elected to apply for participation in the U.S. Treasury Department�s Capital Purchase
Program (TARP). During the fourth quarter of 2008, the Company received preliminary approval to issue a maximum of $553 million of TARP
preferred stock to the U.S. Treasury Department. The preliminary approval is subject to certain conditions, including the raising of $300 million
in additional capital from unaffiliated parties. As of December 31, 2008, the maximum amount of TARP preferred stock the Company could
issue would be approximately $536 million.

Since receiving preliminary approval, the Company has pursued a number of capital-raising alternatives. On January 27, 2009, SunTx Capital
Partners (SunTx) of Dallas, Texas, signed a non-binding letter of intent with BancGroup relating to a potential investment by SunTx and
prospective co-investors of up to 24.9% of the Company�s proforma capitalization, subject to the negotiation of a definitive agreement,
completion of due diligence and obtaining the necessary approvals. In addition, BancGroup is currently in discussions with other third parties
regarding potential investments in or other transactions with the Company. The current condition of the banking industry and the overall
uncertainty in financial markets have negatively impacted Colonial�s capital raising efforts. No assurances can be given that the Company will be
able to raise the capital necessary to satisfy the conditions of the TARP preliminary approval or as to the price, terms or structure of any such
transactions.

BancGroup�s common stock has recently traded below $1 per share. Raising $300 million of additional capital through the sale of common
equity interests at current prices would therefore dilute existing shareholders to a minority position. Moreover, in the event BancGroup is not
successful in raising additional capital in the near term, both Colonial Bank and BancGroup would likely become subject to even greater
regulatory supervision, which could result in additional restrictions. Although the New York Stock Exchange, on which BancGroup�s stock is
traded, has recently announced a proposed temporary suspension through June 30, 2009 of its stock-price rule, the Exchange�s existing rules
require that a listed company�s stock trade at or above $1 per share.

The preceding discussion is only a brief summary of the Company�s condition, results of operations and regulatory categorization and should be
read in conjunction with Risk Factors, Legal Proceedings, Management�s Discussion and Analysis of Financial Condition and Results of
Operations, Consolidated Financial Statements and the Notes to Consolidated Financial Statements.

Segment Information

The Company has six reportable segments for management reporting � five regional bank segments located in Florida, Alabama, Georgia, Nevada
and Texas, and the mortgage warehouse segment headquartered in Orlando, Florida. Each regional bank segment consists of commercial lending
and full service branches in its geographic region. The branches provide a full range of traditional banking products as well as wealth
management and mortgage banking services. The mortgage warehouse segment provides financing collateralized by residential mortgage loans
and other services to mortgage origination companies. Corporate functions not included in these reportable segments include treasury and parent
activities, back office operations and intercompany eliminations. These functions are reported together as Corporate/Treasury/Other. For
additional information related to segments, see Note 27, Segment Information, in the Notes to Consolidated Financial Statements.
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Available Information

BancGroup makes available, free of charge through its Internet website (www.colonialbank.com), the Annual Report on Form 10-K, Quarterly
Reports on Form 10-Q, Current Reports on Form 8-K, and amendments to these reports filed or furnished pursuant to Section 13(a) of the
Exchange Act as soon as reasonably practicable after electronically filing or furnishing such material with the Securities and Exchange
Commission.

Regulatory Environment

The following is a brief summary of the regulatory environment in which BancGroup and Colonial Bank operate and is not designed to be a
complete discussion of all statutes and regulations affecting such operations, including those statutes and regulations specifically mentioned
herein. Changes in the laws and regulations applicable to BancGroup and Colonial Bank can affect the operating environment in substantial and
unpredictable ways. BancGroup cannot accurately predict whether legislation will ultimately be enacted, and if enacted, what the ultimate effect
that legislation would have on BancGroup or its subsidiaries� financial condition or results of operations. While banking regulations are material
to the operations of BancGroup and Colonial Bank, it should be noted that supervision, regulation and examination of BancGroup and Colonial
Bank are intended primarily for the protection of depositors, not security holders.

BancGroup is a registered bank holding company and a financial holding company subject to supervision and regulation by the Board of
Governors of the Federal Reserve System (Federal Reserve). As such, it is subject to the Bank Holding Company Act (BHCA) and many of the
Federal Reserve�s regulations promulgated thereunder. The Federal Reserve has broad enforcement powers over bank holding companies,
including the power to impose substantial fines and civil money penalties.

Colonial Bank converted from a national banking association subject to supervision and examination by the Office of the Comptroller of the
Currency (OCC) to an Alabama state-chartered bank on June 10, 2008, subject to supervision and examination by the Alabama State Banking
Department and the Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation (FDIC). To the extent provided by law, the deposits of Colonial Bank are insured by
the FDIC. The FDIC assesses deposit insurance premiums, the amount of which may, in the future, depend in part on the condition of Colonial
Bank. Moreover, the FDIC may terminate deposit insurance of Colonial Bank under certain very limited circumstances. The bank regulatory
agencies have broad enforcement powers over depository institutions under their jurisdiction, including the power to terminate deposit
insurance, to impose fines and other civil and criminal penalties and to appoint a conservator or receiver if any of a number of conditions are
met.

Current Regulatory Matters

Due to their current condition and results of operations, BancGroup and Colonial Bank are operating under heightened regulatory scrutiny and
have been and will be taking steps which are expected to improve their asset quality and capital. Colonial Bank entered into an informal
Memorandum of Understanding (the Bank MOU) with the FDIC and the Alabama State Banking Department on December 15, 2008, and
BancGroup entered into an informal Memorandum of Understanding (the BancGroup MOU) with the Federal Reserve Bank of Atlanta on
January 6, 2009. Neither the Bank MOU nor the BancGroup MOU is considered to be a �written agreement� pursuant to Section 8 of the FDI Act.

Key elements of the Bank MOU include: improvement of regulatory capital ratios to an 8% Tier I leverage ratio and a 12% total risk-based
capital ratio by March 31, 2009; reduction in classified asset levels by dates beginning June 30, 2009; enhancement of the Company�s credit
process and prior regulatory approval for the payment of dividends on Colonial Bank common stock.

Key elements of the BancGroup MOU include: utilization of holding company resources to support Colonial Bank in meeting the requirements
of the Bank MOU and prior regulatory approval for the issuance of debt, payment of BancGroup dividends, or purchase or redemption of
treasury stock.
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As of December 31, 2008, Colonial Bank maintained capital sufficient to meet the minimum capital levels to be categorized as �well capitalized�
under the regulatory framework for prompt corrective action.

The attainment of the targeted capital ratios included in the Bank MOU will require either (1) a significant increase in Colonial Bank�s capital, or
(2) a substantial decrease in Colonial Bank�s asset levels. One means of achieving the significant increase to Colonial Bank�s capital is the
issuance of preferred stock under the U.S. Treasury Department�s Capital Purchase Program. As discussed under Risk Factors, Colonial�s final
approval to sell preferred stock to the U.S. Treasury Department is contingent upon Colonial raising additional capital of $300 million and the
closing conditions set forth in the final definitive agreements.

These matters are a major focus of the attention and efforts of the Board of Directors and management.

Mergers, Acquisitions and Changes in Control

One limitation under the BHCA and the Federal Reserve�s regulations requires that BancGroup obtain prior approval of the Federal Reserve
before BancGroup acquires, directly or indirectly, more than 5% of any class of voting securities of another bank. Prior approval also must be
obtained before BancGroup acquires all or substantially all of the assets of another bank, or before it merges or consolidates with another bank
holding company. Because BancGroup is a registered bank holding company, persons seeking to acquire 25% or more of any class of its voting
securities must receive the prior approval of the Federal Reserve. Similarly, under certain circumstances, persons seeking to acquire between 5%
and 25% also may be required to obtain prior Federal Reserve approval.

The Riegle-Neal Interstate Banking and Branching Efficiency Act of 1994, among other things, amended the BHCA to permit bank holding
companies, subject to certain limitations, to acquire either control or substantial assets of a bank located in states other than that bank holding
company�s home state regardless of state law prohibitions. In addition, this legislation also amended the Federal Deposit Insurance Act to permit
the merger of insured banks with banks in other states, subject to certain limitations.

FDIC Improvement Act

As a result of enactment of the FDIC Improvement Act (FDICIA) in 1991, banks are subject to increased reporting requirements and more
frequent examinations by the bank regulatory agencies. The agencies also have the authority to dictate certain key decisions that formerly were
left to management, including, but not limited to, compensation standards, loan underwriting standards, asset growth and payment of dividends.
Failure to comply with these standards, or failure to maintain capital above specified levels set by the regulators, could lead to the imposition of
penalties or the forced resignation of management. If a bank becomes critically undercapitalized, the banking agencies have the authority to
place the institution into receivership.

Consumer Protection Laws

There are a number of laws that govern the relationship between Colonial Bank and its customers. For example, the Community Reinvestment
Act (CRA) is designed to promote the offering of products and services to low and moderate income persons and to businesses within the Bank�s
assessment areas. The Home Mortgage Disclosure Act and the Equal Credit Opportunity Act attempt to minimize lending decisions based on
impermissible criteria, such as race or gender. The Truth-in-Lending Act and the Truth-in-Savings Act require banks to provide certain
disclosure of relevant terms related to loans and deposit accounts, respectively. Anti-tying restrictions (which prohibit, for instance, conditioning
the availability or terms of credit on the purchase of another banking product) further restrict Colonial Bank�s relationships with its customers.

Gramm-Leach-Bliley Financial Services Modernization Act (GLBA)

GLBA became effective in March 2000. The primary purpose of GLBA was to eliminate barriers between investment banking and commercial
banking and to permit, within certain limitations, the affiliation of financial service providers. Generally, GLBA: (i) repealed the historical
restrictions against, and eliminated many federal
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and state law barriers to affiliations among banks, securities firms, insurance companies and other financial service providers; (ii) provided a
uniform framework for the activities of banks, savings institutions and their holding companies; (iii) broadened the activities that may be
conducted by and through national banks and other banking subsidiaries of bank holding companies; (iv) provided an enhanced framework for
protecting the privacy of consumers� information; (v) adopted a number of provisions related to the capitalization, membership, corporate
governance and other measures designed to modernize the Federal Home Loan Bank System; (vi) modified the laws governing the
implementation of the CRA; and (vii) addressed a variety of other legal and regulatory issues affecting both day-to-day operations and long-term
activities of financial institutions.

More specifically, under GLBA, bank holding companies, such as BancGroup, that meet certain management, capital and CRA standards, are
permitted to become financial holding companies and, by doing so, to affiliate with securities firms and insurance companies and to engage in
other activities that are financial in nature, incidental to such financial activities or complementary to such activities. A bank holding company
may become a financial holding company if each of its subsidiary banks is well capitalized under the FDICIA prompt corrective action
provisions, is well managed and has at least a satisfactory rating under the CRA. The required filing is a declaration that the bank holding
company wishes to become a financial holding company and meets all applicable requirements. BancGroup became a financial holding
company on May 12, 2000.

Generally, no prior regulatory approval will be required for a financial holding company to acquire a company, other than a bank or savings
association, engaged in activities permitted under GLBA. Activities cited by GLBA as being financial in nature include:

� securities underwriting, dealing and market making;

� sponsoring mutual funds and investment companies;

� insurance underwriting and agency;

� merchant banking activities; and

� activities that the Federal Reserve has determined to be closely related to banking.
Privacy Laws

In 2000, the federal banking regulators issued final regulations implementing certain provisions of GLBA governing the privacy of consumer
financial information. The regulations limit the disclosure by financial institutions, such as BancGroup, Colonial Bank and certain of their
subsidiaries, of nonpublic personal information about individuals who obtain financial products or services for personal, family or household
purposes. Subject to certain exceptions allowed by law, the regulations cover information sharing between financial institutions and nonaffiliated
third parties. More specifically, the regulations require financial institutions to (i) provide initial notices to customers about their privacy
policies, describing the conditions under which they may disclose nonpublic personal financial information to nonaffiliated third parties and
affiliates; (ii) provide annual notices of their privacy policies to their current customers; and (iii) provide a reasonable method for customers to
opt-out of disclosures to nonaffiliated third parties.

The Fair Credit Reporting Act (FCRA) governs the ability of a financial institution to share customer financial information with its affiliates.
The FCRA requires financial institutions to provide their customers with notice and an opportunity to opt-out before sharing certain information
with its affiliates. In December 2003, the Fair and Accurate Credit Transactions Act of 2003 (FACTA) was enacted. FACTA includes a
provision further limiting a financial institution�s ability to share customer information with its affiliates for marketing purposes by requiring
financial institutions to provide their customers with the ability to opt-out of such sharing of customer information. Regulations implementing
this provision of FACTA had a mandatory effective date of October 1, 2008. FACTA section 114, which requires institutions to develop and
implement a written program to detect, prevent and mitigate identity theft for certain new and existing accounts, was required to be in place by
November 1, 2008.
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Protection of Customer Information

In February 2001, the federal banking regulators issued final regulations implementing the provisions of GLBA relating to the protection of
customer information. The regulations, applicable to financial institutions, like Colonial Bank, and certain of their nonbank subsidiaries, and to
bank holding companies, like BancGroup, and certain of their nonbank subsidiaries, relate to administrative, technical, and physical safeguards
for customer records and information. These safeguards are intended to: (i) ensure the security and confidentiality of customer records and
information; (ii) protect against any anticipated threats or hazards to the security or integrity of such records; (iii) protect against unauthorized
access to or use of such records or information that could result in substantial harm or inconvenience to any customer; and (iv) ensure the proper
disposal of such information.

In March 2005, the federal banking agencies jointly issued Interagency Guidance on Response Programs for Unauthorized Access to Customer
Information and Customer Notice. The guidance requires all financial institutions to implement a response program to address security breaches
involving customer information. The guidance requires a financial institution�s response to include, among other things, procedures for notifying
customers about incidents of unauthorized access when certain criteria are met.

Bank Secrecy Act

The Bank Secrecy Act (BSA) is a tool the U.S. government uses to fight drug trafficking, money laundering and other crimes. Under the BSA,
financial institutions are required to file certain reports, including suspicious activities reports and currency transaction reports, with the
Financial Crimes Enforcement Network under certain circumstances. Financial institutions are also required to have policies and procedures in
place to ensure compliance with the BSA. If a financial institution fails to timely file a report or fails to implement its BSA policies and
procedures, it could subject the institution to enforcement action or civil money penalties. In July 2007, federal banking regulators issued the
Interagency Statement on Enforcement of Bank Secrecy Act/Anti- Money Laundering Requirements to provide greater consistency among the
agencies in enforcement decisions in BSA matters and to offer insight into the considerations that form the basis of such BSA enforcement
decisions.

On October 26, 2001, the Uniting and Strengthening America by Providing Appropriate Tools Required to Intercept and Obstruct Terrorism Act
of 2001 (USA PATRIOT Act) was signed into law. The USA PATRIOT Act amended the BSA and broadened the application of anti-money
laundering regulations to apply to additional types of financial institutions, such as broker-dealers, and strengthened the ability of the U.S.
government to detect and prosecute international money laundering and the financing of terrorism. The principal provisions of Title III of the
USA PATRIOT Act require that regulated financial institutions: (i) establish an anti-money laundering program that includes training and audit
components; (ii) comply with regulations regarding the verification of the identity of any person seeking to open an account; (iii) take additional
required precautions with non-U.S. owned accounts; and (iv) perform certain verification and certification of money laundering risk for their
foreign correspondent banking relationships. The USA PATRIOT Act also expanded the conditions under which funds in a U.S. interbank
account may be subject to forfeiture and increased the penalties for violation of anti-money laundering regulations. Failure of a financial
institution to comply with the USA PATRIOT Act�s requirements could have serious legal and reputational consequences for the institution.
BancGroup has adopted policies, procedures and controls to address compliance with the requirements of the USA PATRIOT Act under the
existing regulations and will continue to revise and update its policies, procedures and controls to reflect changes required by the USA
PATRIOT Act and implementing regulations.

Safety and Soundness Standards

Pursuant to FDICIA, the federal banking regulatory agencies have adopted a set of guidelines prescribing safety and soundness standards for
depository institutions such as Colonial Bank. The guidelines establish general standards relating to internal controls and information systems,
internal audit systems, loan documentation, credit underwriting, interest rate exposure, asset growth, asset quality, earnings and compensation,
fees and benefits. In general, the guidelines require, among other things, appropriate systems and practices to identify and manage the risks and
exposures specified in the guidelines. The guidelines prohibit
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excessive compensation as an unsafe and unsound practice and describe compensation as excessive when the amounts paid are unreasonable or
disproportionate to the services performed by an executive officer, employee, director or principal shareholder. In addition, the agencies adopted
regulations that authorize an agency to order an institution that has been given notice by an agency that it is not satisfying any of such safety and
soundness standards to submit a compliance plan. If the institution fails to submit an acceptable compliance plan or fails to implement an
accepted plan, the agency must issue an order directing action to correct the deficiency and may issue an order directing other actions be taken,
including restricting asset growth, restricting interest rates paid on deposits, and requiring an increase in the institution�s ratio of tangible equity
to assets.

Payment of Dividends and Other Restrictions

BancGroup is a legal entity separate and distinct from its subsidiaries, including Colonial Bank. There are various legal and regulatory
limitations on the extent to which BancGroup�s subsidiaries can, among other things, finance, or otherwise supply funds to, BancGroup. There
are legal restrictions under federal and state law on the payment of dividends by banks. The relevant regulatory agencies also have authority to
prohibit BancGroup and Colonial Bank from engaging in what, in the opinion of such regulatory body, constitutes an unsafe or unsound banking
practice. The payment of dividends could, depending upon the financial condition of BancGroup and Colonial Bank, be deemed to constitute
such an unsafe or unsound practice. As previously discussed, both Colonial Bank and BancGroup are required to receive prior regulatory
approval for the payment of dividends on common stock.

In addition, Colonial Bank and its subsidiaries are subject to limitations under Sections 23A and 23B of the Federal Reserve Act with respect to
extensions of credit to, investments in, and certain other transactions with, BancGroup and its other subsidiaries. Furthermore, loans and
extensions of credit are also subject to various collateral requirements. The Federal Reserve has adopted Regulation W, which combines the
Federal Reserve�s interpretations and exemptions relating to Sections 23A and 23B of the Federal Reserve Act.

Capital Adequacy

The Federal Reserve has adopted regulations which provide for minimum risk-based and leverage capital guidelines for bank holding
companies. The minimum required ratio of total capital to risk-weighted assets (including certain off-balance sheet items, such as standby letters
of credit) is 8%, of which 4% must consist of Tier I capital. The minimum required leverage capital ratio is 3% for bank holding companies that
meet certain specified criteria, including that they have the highest regulatory rating. A minimum leverage ratio of 4% is required for bank
holding companies not meeting these criteria. Generally, bank holding companies are expected to operate well above the minimum capital ratios.
Higher capital ratios may be required for any bank holding company if warranted by its particular circumstances or risk profile. Failure to meet
capital guidelines can subject a bank holding company to a variety of formal and informal enforcement remedies, including restrictions on its
operations and activities.

Regarding depository institutions, the prompt corrective action provisions of the federal banking statutes establish five capital categories (�well
capitalized�, �adequately capitalized�, �undercapitalized�, �significantly undercapitalized� and �critically undercapitalized�), and impose significant
restrictions on the operations of an institution that is not at least adequately capitalized. To be considered �well capitalized,� an institution must
maintain a ratio of total capital to risk weighted assets of at least 10% of which 6% must consist of Tier I capital as well as a Tier I leverage ratio
of at least 5%. To be considered adequately capitalized, the institution must maintain those same capital ratios at levels equal to or exceeding
8%, 4% and 4%, respectively. Under certain circumstances, an institution may be downgraded to a category lower than that warranted by its
capital levels and subjected to the supervisory restrictions applicable to institutions in the lower capital category. As of December 31, 2008,
Colonial Bank met the minimum capital levels to be categorized as �well capitalized� under the regulatory framework for prompt corrective
action. See specific discussion of Colonial Bank�s and BancGroup�s capital adequacy as previously discussed under Current Regulatory Matters.
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An undercapitalized depository institution is subject to restrictions in a number of areas, including capital distributions, payments of
management fees and expansion. In addition, an undercapitalized depository institution is required to submit a capital restoration plan. A
depository institution�s holding company must guarantee the capital plan up to an amount equal to the lesser of 5% of the depository institution�s
assets at the time it becomes undercapitalized or the amount needed to restore the capital of the institution to the levels required for the
institution to be classified as adequately capitalized at the time the institution fails to comply with the plan. A depository institution is treated as
if it is significantly undercapitalized if it fails in any material respect to implement a capital restoration plan.

Significantly undercapitalized depository institutions may be subject to a number of additional significant requirements and restrictions,
including requirements to sell sufficient voting stock to become adequately capitalized, to improve management, to restrict asset growth, to
prohibit acceptance of correspondent bank deposits, to restrict senior executive compensation and to limit transactions with affiliates. Critically
undercapitalized depository institutions are further subject to restrictions on paying principal or interest on subordinated debt, making
investments, expanding, acquiring or selling assets, extending credit for highly-leveraged transactions, paying excessive compensation,
amending their charters or bylaws and making any material changes in accounting methods. In general, a receiver or conservator must be
appointed for a depository institution within 90 days after the institution is deemed to be critically undercapitalized.

Support of Subsidiary Bank

Under Federal Reserve policy, BancGroup is expected to act as a source of financial strength to, and to commit resources to support, Colonial
Bank. This support may be required at times when, absent such Federal Reserve policy, BancGroup might not otherwise be inclined to provide
it. In the event of a bank holding company�s bankruptcy, any commitment by the bank holding company to a federal bank regulatory agency to
maintain the capital of a subsidiary bank will be assumed by the bankruptcy trustee and entitled to priority of payment.

FDIC Insurance Assessments

The FDIC is an independent federal agency established originally to insure the deposits, up to prescribed statutory limits, of federally insured
banks and to preserve the safety and soundness of the banking industry. The FDIC has adopted a risk-based assessment system for insured
depository institutions that takes into account the risks attributable to different categories and concentrations of assets and liabilities.

Colonial Bank�s deposit accounts are insured by the FDIC to the maximum extent permitted by law. Colonial Bank pays deposit insurance
premiums to the FDIC based on a risk-based assessment system established by the FDIC for all insured institutions. Institutions considered
well-capitalized and financially sound pay the lowest premiums, while those institutions that are less than adequately capitalized and of
substantial supervisory concern pay the highest premiums. During 2008, assessment rates for insured institutions ranged from 5 cents per $100
of assessable deposits for well-capitalized institutions with minor supervisory concerns to 43 cents per $100 of assessable deposits for
undercapitalized institutions with substantial supervisory concerns. In 2009, assessment rates are expected to range between 12 and 50 cents per
$100 of assessable deposits for the first quarter and 8 and 77.5 cents per $100 of assessable deposits for the remainder of the year. The large
premium increase is due to the Emergency Economic Stabilization Act of 2008 and the Temporary Liquidity Guarantee Program, both of which
increased the deposit insurance coverage available to Colonial�s depositors.

Emergency Economic Stabilization Act of 2008.    In October 2008, the Emergency Economic Stabilization Act of 2008 (EESA) was signed into
law. The EESA temporarily revises the federal deposit insurance laws by increasing the basic deposit insurance coverage from $100,000 to
$250,000 per depositor. This revision is currently effective through December 31, 2009.
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Temporary Liquidity Guarantee Program.    In order to promote financial stability in the economy, the FDIC adopted the Temporary Liquidity
Guarantee Program (TLGP) on October 13, 2008. Participation in the program is voluntary. However, once participation is elected, it can not be
revoked. Colonial has chosen to participate in the Transaction Account Guarantee Program component of the TLGP. Under the Transaction
Account Guarantee Program, the FDIC will fully insure funds held in noninterest-bearing transaction accounts. Noninterest-bearing transaction
accounts are ones that do not accrue or pay interest and for which the institution does not require an advance notice of withdrawal. Also covered
are interest on lawyers� trust accounts (IOLTA) and negotiable order of withdrawal (NOW) accounts with interest rates lower than 50 basis
points. These revisions are only effective through December 31, 2009.

Federal Deposit Insurance Reform Act of 2005.    In February 2006, the Federal Deposit Insurance Reform Act of 2005 and the Federal Deposit
Insurance Reform Conforming Amendments Act of 2005 (collectively, the Reform Act) were signed into law. The Reform Act revised the laws
concerning federal deposit insurance by making the following changes: (i) merging the Bank Insurance Fund and the Savings Association
Insurance Fund into a new fund, the Deposit Insurance Fund (DIF), effective March 31, 2006; (ii) increasing the deposit insurance coverage for
certain retirement accounts to $250,000 effective April 1, 2006; (iii) beginning in 2010, deposit insurance coverage on individual accounts may
be indexed for inflation; (iv) the FDIC will have more discretion in managing deposit insurance assessments; and (v) eligible institutions will
receive a one-time initial assessment credit.

The Reform Act authorized the FDIC to revise the risk-based assessment system. Accordingly, insurance premiums are based on a number of
factors, including the risk of loss that insured institutions pose to the DIF. The Reform Act replaced the minimum reserve ratio of 1.25% with a
range of between 1.15% and 1.50% for the DIF, depending on projected losses, economic changes and assessment rates at the end of each
calendar year. In addition, the FDIC is no longer prohibited from charging banks in the lowest risk category when the reserve ratio premium is
greater than 1.25%.

In November 2006, the FDIC adopted changes to its risk-based assessment system. Under the new system, the FDIC will evaluate an institution�s
risk based on supervisory ratings for all insured institutions, financial ratios for most institutions and long-term debt issuer ratings for certain
large institutions.

In addition to deposit insurance assessments, the FDIC is authorized to collect assessments against insured deposits to be paid to the Finance
Corporation (FICO) to service FICO debt incurred during the 1980�s. The FICO assessment rate is adjusted quarterly. The average annual
assessment rate in 2008 was 1.12 cents per $100 for insured deposits. For the first quarter of 2009, the FICO assessment rate for such deposits
will be 1.14 cents per $100 of assessable deposits.

Alabama State Banking Department Assessment

The Alabama State Banking Department imposes a quarterly assessment on all state banks under its supervision. The amount of the quarterly
assessment is based on the bank�s total assets at the end of the prior quarter. Colonial Bank�s state assessment expense for the year ended
December 31, 2008 was $1.2 million. Prior to Colonial Bank converting to a state-chartered bank on June 10, 2008, Colonial paid assessments to
the OCC totaling $1.6 million for the first half of 2008. No assessment was paid to the OCC for the second half of the year.

Other Subsidiary Regulation

Certain subsidiaries of BancGroup and Colonial Bank are regulated by other governmental agencies. Where material, such regulation is
disclosed with the disclosure of the subsidiary.
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Additional Information

Additional information, including statistical information concerning the business of BancGroup, is set forth herein. See Selected Financial Data
and Selected Quarterly Financial Data 2008-2007 and Management�s Discussion and Analysis of Financial Condition and Results of
Operations.

Executive Officers and Directors

Pursuant to general instruction G, information regarding executive officers of BancGroup is contained herein at Item 10.

Item 1A. Risk Factors
Industry Factors

As a financial services company, our business and earnings are significantly affected by general business and economic conditions,
particularly in the real estate industry, and accordingly, our business and earnings could be further harmed in the event of a continuation or
deepening of the current U.S. recession or further market deterioration or disruption.

Our business and earnings are sensitive to general business, economic and market conditions in the United States. These conditions include
changes in short-term and long-term interest rates, inflation, deflation, fluctuation in the real estate and debt capital markets, developments in
national and regional economies and changes in government policies and regulations.

Our business and earnings are particularly sensitive to economic and market conditions affecting the real estate industry because most of our
loan portfolio consists of commercial real estate, construction and residential loans. While generally containing lower risk than unsecured loans,
commercial real estate and construction loans generally involve higher credit risk than conventional single-family residential loans. Such loans
also generally involve larger individual loan balances. In addition, real estate construction loans may be affected to a greater extent than
residential loans by adverse conditions in real estate markets or the economy because many real estate construction borrowers� ability to repay
their loans is dependent on successful development of their properties, as well as the factors affecting residential real estate borrowers. Risk of
loss on a construction loan depends largely upon whether the initial estimate of the property�s value at completion of construction equals or
exceeds the cost of property construction (including interest) and the availability of permanent take-out financing. During the construction phase,
a number of factors can result in delays and cost overruns. Construction and commercial real estate loans also involve greater risk because they
may not be fully amortizing over the loan period, but have a balloon payment due at maturity. A borrower�s ability to make a balloon payment
may depend on the borrower being able to refinance the loan, timely sell the underlying property or liquidate other assets.

The current U.S. recession has resulted in a reduction in the value of the real estate assets securing a large portion of the loans that we hold. An
increasing number of borrowers have become delinquent or defaulted on their loans, thereby adversely affecting our results of operations and
financial condition, including the value of our intangible assets. A further increase in the number of delinquencies or defaults would result in
higher levels of nonperforming assets, net charge-offs and provision for loan losses, adversely affecting our results of operations and financial
condition.

The condition of the residential mortgage and related markets and the economy may deteriorate further and adversely affect our business.

Recently, the residential mortgage market in the United States has experienced a variety of worsening economic conditions that have adversely
affected the performance and market value of our residential construction and mortgage loans. Across the United States, delinquencies,
foreclosures and losses with respect to residential construction and mortgage loans generally have increased and may continue to increase. In
addition,
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housing prices and appraisal values in most markets have declined or stopped appreciating. An extended period of flat or declining housing
values may result in additional increases in delinquencies and further losses on residential construction and mortgage loans.

Our earnings are significantly affected by the fiscal and monetary policies of the federal government and its agencies.

The Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve System regulates the supply of money and credit in the United States. Its policies determine in
large part our cost of funds for lending and investing and the return we earn on those loans and investments, both of which impact our net
interest margin, and can materially affect the value of financial instruments we hold, such as debt securities. Its policies also can affect our
borrowers, potentially increasing the risk that they may fail to repay their loans. Changes in Federal Reserve Board policies are beyond our
control and difficult to predict or anticipate.

The financial services industry is highly competitive.

We operate in a highly competitive industry which has become even more competitive as a result of legislative, regulatory and technological
changes and continued consolidation. Banks, securities firms and insurance companies can now merge by creating a financial services company
called a �financial holding company,� which can offer virtually any type of financial service, including banking, securities underwriting, insurance
(both agency and underwriting) and merchant banking. A number of foreign banks have acquired financial services companies in the United
States, further increasing competition in the U.S. market. Also, technology has lowered barriers to entry and made it possible for nonbanks to
offer products and services traditionally provided by banks, such as automatic transfer and automatic payment systems. Many of our competitors
have fewer regulatory constraints and some have lower cost structures. Many nonbanks have converted to bank holding companies in order to
receive government assistance under the U.S. Treasury Department�s Capital Purchase Program (TARP). The newly formed bank holding
companies are expected to increase competition for deposits and other business traditionally pursued by banks.

The financial services industry is heavily regulated by federal and state agencies.

The Company, its subsidiary bank and certain nonbank subsidiaries are heavily regulated by federal and state agencies. This regulation is to
protect depositors, federal deposit insurance funds and the banking system as a whole, not security holders. Congress and federal regulatory
agencies continually review banking laws, regulations and policies for possible changes. Changes to statutes, regulations or regulatory policies,
including changes in interpretation or implementation of statutes, regulations or policies, could affect us in substantial and unpredictable ways
including limiting the types of financial services and products we may offer and/or increasing the ability of nonbanks to offer competing
financial services and products. Failure to comply with laws, regulations or policies could result in sanctions by regulatory agencies and damage
to our reputation. For more information, refer to discussions of regulatory considerations contained in Item 1 � Business and Note 19, Regulatory
Matters and Restrictions.

The Emergency Economic Stabilization Act of 2008 (EESA) and the American Recovery and Reinvestment Act of 2009 (ARRA) may not
stabilize the financial services industry or the U.S. economy.

The EESA was signed into law on October 3, 2008. The legislation was intended to alleviate the financial crisis affecting the U.S. banking
system. A number of programs have been and are being developed and implemented under EESA. The EESA may not have the intended effect
and therefore the condition of the financial services industry may worsen instead of improve. The failure of the EESA to improve the condition
of the U.S. banking system could significantly adversely impact our business, our financial condition, our financial results, our access to funding
or capital as well as the trading price of our common stock or other instruments.
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The ARRA was signed into law on February 17, 2009. The legislation was intended to provide immediate and long-term solutions to the current
U.S. recession. The ARRA may not have the intended effect; therefore, the current U.S. recession and the condition of the financial services
industry may worsen instead of improve. The failure of the ARRA to improve the current U.S. recession and/or improve the condition of the
U.S. banking system could significantly adversely impact our business, our financial condition, our financial results, or our access to funding or
capital, as well as the trading price of our common stock or other instruments.

Current market volatility and industry developments may adversely affect our business and financial results.

The volatility in the capital and credit markets along with the housing declines during the last year have resulted in significant pressure on the
financial services industry. We have experienced a higher level of foreclosures and higher losses upon foreclosure than we have historically. If
current volatility and market conditions continue or worsen, there can be no assurance that our industry, results of operations or our business will
not continue to be significantly adversely impacted. We may have further increases in loan losses, deterioration of capital or limitations on our
access to funding or capital, if needed.

Further, if other financial institutions fail to be adequately capitalized or funded, it may negatively impact our business and financial results. We
routinely interact with numerous financial institutions in the ordinary course of business and are therefore exposed to operational and credit risk
to those institutions. Failures of such institutions may significantly adversely impact our operations.

Strategies to manage interest rate risk may yield results other than those anticipated.

Changes in the interest rate environment are difficult to predict. Net interest margins can expand or contract which can significantly impact our
overall earnings. Changes in interest rates can also adversely affect how we apply critical management estimates, our projected returns on
investments, as well as the determination of fair values of certain assets.

Events such as natural disasters, acts of terrorism or war occurring in the U.S. could affect our business and financial results.

Our business and earnings are sensitive to general business, economic and market conditions occurring in the U.S. and particularly in our
primary markets. Events such as natural disasters, a terrorist attack or war could result in prolonged business disruption and/or materially impair
the value of collateral securing loans, which could adversely impact our business.

Company Factors

The impact on us of recently enacted legislation, in particular the Emergency Economic Stabilization Act of 2008 (EESA), the American
Recovery and Reinvestment Act of 2009 (ARRA), and their implementing regulations, and actions by the FDIC, cannot be predicted at this
time.

The programs established or to be established under the EESA, ARRA and Troubled Asset Relief Program are evolving and may have adverse
effects on us. We may face increased regulation of our industry. Compliance with such regulation may increase our costs and limit our ability to
pursue business opportunities. Also, participation in specific programs may subject us to additional restrictions. For example, participation in the
Troubled Asset Relief Program will limit (without the consent of the U.S. Treasury Department) our ability to pay a dividend on common stock
or to repurchase our common stock for so long as any securities issued under such program remain outstanding. It will also subject us to
additional executive compensation restrictions. Similarly, programs established by the FDIC under the systemic risk exception of the Federal
Deposit Act, may have an adverse effect on us, whether or not we participate in the programs. Participation in the FDIC Temporary Liquidity
Guarantee Program requires the payment of additional insurance premiums to the FDIC based upon the increased deposit coverage afforded
thereunder. Further, we will be required to pay significantly higher Federal
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Deposit Insurance Corporation premiums because market developments have decreased the insurance fund of the FDIC and reduced the ratio of
reserves to insured deposits. The full effects of these various programs cannot reliably be determined at this time.

Failure to receive final approval for participation in the U.S. Treasury Department�s Capital Purchase Program (TARP) or our inability to
raise additional capital on terms and conditions that are satisfactory to us could have a significant impact on our Company.

During the fourth quarter of 2008, we received preliminary approval from the U.S. Treasury Department to participate in its Capital Purchase
Program subject to raising additional capital of at least $300 million. The amount of TARP preferred stock to be issued is subject to a maximum
of 3% of our latest bank holding company total risk weighted assets. As of December 31, 2008, if all conditions are satisfied the maximum
amount of TARP preferred stock we would expect to issue to the U.S. Treasury Department is approximately $536 million. The preliminary
approval also includes provisions concerning the timely completion of the preferred stock agreements by Colonial, which time has since elapsed.
BancGroup has been informed by a representative of the U.S. Treasury Department that the Company will be allowed additional time to satisfy
the conditions contained in the preliminary approval. The preliminary approval also contains other provisions which, along with the time
constraints, would allow the U.S. Treasury Department to modify or revoke the preliminary approval. While we are actively pursuing a variety
of capital raising alternatives to satisfy the preliminary approval conditions to issue TARP preferred stock, we cannot guarantee our success, and
therefore we may not receive additional third party capital or issue TARP preferred stock, and could therefore be subject to increased regulatory
oversight pursuant to the MOUs discussed in Item 1 and in these Risk Factors below. Failure to adequately address the regulatory concerns in
these informal MOUs may result in actions by our banking regulators under the prompt corrective action provisions ranging from a formal
written agreement pursuant to Section 8 of the FDIC Improvement Act which would preclude Colonial Bank from being considered well
capitalized to the restriction or prohibition of certain activities by BancGroup or Colonial Bank. If Colonial Bank were to be deemed an
undercapitalized institution, the banking regulators could require the Bank to submit a plan for restoring Colonial Bank to an acceptable capital
category and our failure to adequately comply could eventually allow the banking regulators to appoint a receiver or conservator of Colonial
Bank�s net assets.

The issuance of preferred stock and convertible warrants to the U.S. Treasury Department as well as any additional capital raised from the
private sector would dilute the Company�s existing common shareholders.

As discussed above, if the Company is successful in raising additional capital and issues TARP preferred stock and warrants to the U.S.
Treasury Department, existing common shareholders will experience significant dilution to their current ownership in the Company.

The holding company and Colonial Bank are subject to heightened regulatory scrutiny and oversight.

Due to their current condition and results of operations, BancGroup and Colonial Bank are operating under heightened regulatory scrutiny and
have been and will be taking steps which are expected to improve their asset quality and capital. Colonial Bank entered into an informal
Memorandum of Understanding with the FDIC and the Alabama State Banking Department on December 15, 2008, and BancGroup entered into
an informal Memorandum of Understanding with the Federal Reserve Bank of Atlanta on January 6, 2009, addressing, among other items,
management of asset quality and increased capital for Colonial Bank. Colonial Bank has agreed to increase its Tier I leverage ratio to 8% and its
total risk-based capital ratio to 12% by March 31, 2009 and to improve asset quality by dates beginning June 30, 2009. While management is
attempting to comply with these deadlines through the capital raising transactions described in Item 1 under Executive Overview of Operations
and Conditions, failure to do so may result in the consequences described in the following paragraph. Colonial Bank may not pay dividends on
its common stock owned by BancGroup without the prior written consent of the FDIC and the Alabama State Banking Department. BancGroup
has agreed to use its resources to support Colonial Bank. BancGroup will not pay dividends on its common or preferred stock, purchase or
redeem treasury stock, or incur additional debt or refinance existing debt without prior written consent of the Federal Reserve and the Alabama
State Banking Department. Additionally, if BancGroup receives the U.S. Treasury
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Department�s Capital Purchase Program funds, we will be required to receive approval from the U.S. Treasury Department prior to the payment
of any dividend on common stock or the repurchase of any common stock so long as any securities issued under such program remain
outstanding. These matters are a major focus of the attention and efforts of the Board of Directors and management.

Failure to adequately address the regulatory concerns in these informal memoranda may result in actions by our banking regulators against
BancGroup and/or Colonial Bank such as the imposition of a written agreement or a cease and desist order pursuant to Section 8 of the FDIC
Act. Such actions could preclude Colonial Bank from being considered well capitalized and/or impose other restrictions or prohibitions of
certain activities by BancGroup or Colonial Bank. If Colonial Bank were to be deemed an undercapitalized institution, the banking regulators
could require the Bank to submit a plan for restoring Colonial Bank to an acceptable capital category, and our failure to adequately comply could
eventually allow the banking regulators to appoint a receiver or conservator of Colonial Bank�s net assets.

Any current or future litigation, regulatory investigations, proceedings, inquiries or changes could have a significant impact on our
Company.

The financial services industry, including BancGroup, has experienced unprecedented market value declines caused primarily by the current
U.S. recession and real estate market deterioration. As a result of the current market perceptions of shareholder advocacy groups as well as the
new U.S. Administration in Washington, D.C., litigation, proceedings, inquiries or regulatory changes are all distinct possibilities for financial
institutions. We are, and will in the future be, the subject of shareholder litigation. Such actions or changes could result in significant costs. See
Legal Proceedings in Item 3 for more information.

The concentration of our assets in Florida makes us sensitive and more susceptible to changes in the economic, demographic and regulatory
conditions in that state.

A significant portion of the loans in our portfolio are secured by residential and commercial properties in Florida. Deteriorating real estate
market conditions and a significant economic downturn in Florida have negatively impacted our business. Worsening conditions in the Florida
real estate markets could continue to adversely affect our borrowers� ability to repay as well as impact the value of the collateral underlying our
loans. Real estate values are impacted by various factors, including general economic conditions, governmental rules or policies and natural
disasters. The occurrence of a natural disaster, such as a hurricane, could result in a decline in the value or destruction of mortgaged properties
and an increase in the risk of delinquencies, foreclosures or loss on the uninsured portions of these loans. These factors may adversely impact
our borrowers� ability to make required payments, which in turn, may negatively impact our results.

Negative public opinion could damage our reputation and adversely impact our business and revenues.

As a financial institution, our earnings and capital are subject to risks associated with negative public opinion. Negative public opinion could
result from our actual, alleged or perceived conduct in any number of activities, including lending practices, the failure of any product or service
sold by us to meet our customers� expectations or applicable regulatory requirements, corporate governance, acquisitions, as a defendant in
litigation, or from actions taken by government regulators or community organizations. Negative public opinion can adversely affect our ability
to attract and/or retain customers and can expose us to litigation or regulatory action. Negative public opinion could also affect our credit ratings,
which are important to our access to certain sources of wholesale borrowings, thereby increasing the cost or reducing, or eliminating, the
availability of these sources of funding.

Disruptions in our ability to access capital markets may negatively affect our capital resources and liquidity.

In managing our consolidated balance sheet, we depend on access to capital markets to provide us with sufficient capital resources and liquidity
to meet our commitments and business needs, and to accommodate the transaction and cash management needs of our customers. Other sources
of funding available to us, and upon
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which we rely as regular components of our liquidity risk management strategy, include deposits, inter-bank borrowings, repurchase agreements
and borrowings from the Federal Home Loan Bank of Atlanta and the Federal Reserve discount window. Any occurrence that may limit our
access to the capital markets, such as a decline in the confidence of depositors, debt purchasers, or counterparties participating in the capital
markets, or a downgrade of our debt ratings, may adversely affect our borrowing costs and our liquidity.

Deposit pricing may continue to negatively impact our net interest margin and earnings.

Intense competition for liquidity during 2008 resulted in elevated rates being paid on time deposits, thereby compressing net interest margin and
reducing net interest income. A continuation or exacerbation of such competition for time deposits would continue to adversely impact our
earnings and financial condition.

Maintaining or increasing our market share depends on market acceptance and regulatory approval of new products and services.

Our success depends, in part, on our ability to adapt our products and services to evolving industry standards. There is increasing pressure on
financial services companies to provide products and services at lower prices. This can reduce our net interest margin and revenues from our
fee-based products and services. In addition, the widespread adoption of new technologies, including internet-based services, could require us to
make substantial expenditures to modify or adapt our existing products and services. We might not successfully introduce new products and
services, achieve market acceptance of our products and services and/or develop and maintain loyal customers.

The holding company relies on dividends from its subsidiaries for most of its revenue.

The holding company is a separate and distinct legal entity from its subsidiaries. It receives substantially all of its revenue from its subsidiaries.
Dividends from Colonial Bank are a significant source of funds for BancGroup to pay any future dividends on the holding company�s common
stock. Various federal and/or state laws and regulations limit the amount of dividends that our bank and certain of our nonbank subsidiaries may
pay to the holding company. Colonial Bank may not currently pay dividends on its common stock without prior written consent of its regulators.
Also, the holding company�s right to participate in a distribution of assets upon a subsidiary�s liquidation or reorganization is subject to the prior
claims of the subsidiary�s creditors. For more information, refer to Payment of Dividends and Other Restrictions in Item 1 and Note 19,
Regulatory Matters and Restrictions.

Our accounting policies and methods determine how we report our financial condition and results of operations, and they may require
management to make estimates about matters that are inherently uncertain.

Our accounting policies and methods are fundamental to how we record and report our financial condition and results of operations. Our
management must exercise judgment in selecting and applying many of these accounting policies and methods so that not only do they comply
with accounting principles generally accepted in the United States but also that they reflect management�s judgment as to the most appropriate
manner in which to record and report our financial condition and results of operations. In some cases, management must select the accounting
policy or method to apply from two or more alternatives, any of which might be reasonable under the circumstances yet might result in our
reporting materially different amounts than would have been reported under a different alternative. Note 1, Summary of Significant Accounting
and Reporting Policies and Basis of Presentation, describes our significant accounting policies.

We have identified six accounting policies as being �critical� to the presentation of our financial condition and results of operations because they
require management to make particularly subjective and/or complex judgments about matters that are inherently uncertain and because of the
likelihood that materially different amounts would be reported under different conditions or using different assumptions. These critical
accounting policies relate to: (1) allowance for loan losses; (2) fair value of financial instruments; (3) purchase accounting and goodwill; (4)
income taxes; (5) consolidations; and (6) stock-based compensation. A change in management�s assumptions and estimates
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underlying these critical accounting policies could result in a material change to the Company�s financial position and results of operations. For
more information, refer in this report to Critical Accounting Policies in Management�s Discussion and Analysis.

Our allowance for loan losses may not be adequate to cover actual loan losses, which may require us to take a charge to our earnings and
adversely impact our financial condition and results of operations.

We maintain an allowance for estimated loan losses that we believe is adequate for absorbing the inherent losses in our loan portfolio.
Management determines the provision for loan losses based upon an analysis of general market conditions, credit quality of our loan portfolio,
and performance of our customers relative to their financial obligations with us. The amount of future losses is susceptible to changes in
economic, operating, and other conditions, including changes in interest rates that may be beyond our control and such losses may exceed the
allowance for estimated loan losses. Although management believes that the allowance for estimated loan losses is adequate to absorb any
inherent losses on existing loans that may become uncollectible, there can be no assurance that the allowance will prove sufficient to cover
actual loan losses in the future. Significant increases to the provision for loan losses may be necessary if material adverse changes in general
economic conditions occur or the performance of our loan portfolio deteriorates. Additionally, banking regulators, as an integral part of their
supervisory function, periodically review the allowance for estimated loan losses. If these regulatory agencies require us to increase the
allowance for estimated loan losses, it could have a negative effect on our results of operations and financial condition.

Our financial instruments carried at fair value expose us to certain market risks.

We maintain an available for sale securities portfolio which includes various types of instruments and maturities. In addition, we elected to
record selected loans held for sale at fair value. The changes in fair value of the loans held for sale that we have elected to carry at fair value are
recognized in earnings. The securities and loans held for sale are exposed to market risks related to changes in interest rates, market liquidity,
and market-based credit spreads, as well as to the risk of default by specific borrowers. Changes in the market values of these financial
instruments could have a material adverse impact on our financial condition or results of operations. We may elect to carry additional financial
assets or financial liabilities at fair value in the future.

Our mix of products and customers subjects us to potential concentration risk.

Colonial Bank offers a defined group of products, both retail and commercial, to its customers throughout the branch network. As a result of the
products offered and customers served, BancGroup is subject to concentration risk. See the Concentration discussion within the Risk
Management section of Management�s Discussion and Analysis for further information.

We depend on the expertise of key personnel. If these individuals leave without effective replacements, operations may suffer.

The future success of our business will be dependent to a large degree on the continued services of executive officers and other key personnel
who have extensive experience in the banking industry. If we lose the services of any of these integral personnel and fail to manage a smooth
transition to new personnel, our business could be negatively impacted. Current compensation limits for key personnel at institutions receiving
any government funds may increase the risk of loss of their services and create a competitive disadvantage with non-U.S. peer institutions or
institutions not receiving any government funds.

We may not realize the expected benefits from our Colonial 1st Project.

The Colonial 1st Project, launched in December 2008, is an employee-driven effort to create a more efficient organization that delivers greater
value for our shareholders and an enhanced banking experience for our customers. We are still in the early stages of this project and cannot be
sure what the ultimate increase to annual pre-tax earnings will be, but other financial institutions of comparable size that have gone through this
process
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have reported significant increases. The amounts of efficiency gains and earnings from new revenue growth initiatives are based on estimates
and assumptions regarding future business performance and operating expenses. The anticipated cost savings and revenue enhancements from
the Colonial 1st Project may not be achieved in their entirety or accomplished within our expected time frame. Accordingly, we cannot guarantee
that the anticipated benefits from the Colonial 1st Project will be realized.

Our stock price can be volatile.

Our stock price can fluctuate widely in response to a variety of factors including, but not limited to:

� actual or anticipated variations in our quarterly operating results;

� recommendations by securities analysts;

� short selling of our stock and increased failures to deliver;

� new technology used, or services offered, by our competitors;

� significant acquisitions or business combinations, strategic partnerships, joint ventures or capital commitments by or involving us or our
competitors;

� failure to integrate our acquisitions or realize anticipated benefits from our acquisitions, or, conversely, a more successful integration or
realization of more benefits than anticipated;

� operating and stock price performance of other companies that investors deem comparable to us;

� news reports relating to trends, concerns and other issues in the financial services industry;

� changes in government regulations;

� geopolitical conditions such as acts or threats of terrorism or military conflicts; and

� potential actions of the banking regulators.
The current price of our common stock is below the minimum allowed by New York Stock Exchange (NYSE) listing requirements.

BancGroup�s stock is listed on the NYSE. The NYSE requires that listed stocks trade at or above $1 per share. The closing price of our stock has
recently fallen below $1 per share for a number of days. If the average closing price is below $1 per share for 30 consecutive trading days, the
NYSE may send us a de-listing notification, which we would disclose in a press release. Within ten days after receiving such notification, we
can submit a proposal to the NYSE to bring our stock price above $1 within six months. However, there can be no assurance we will be
successful in implementing such a proposal. If our common stock were to be de-listed from the NYSE, it would be traded over the counter,
unless we were able to list it on another exchange. A de-listing by the NYSE would likely cause trading in our stock to be less liquid.
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On February 26, 2009, the NYSE announced a proposed temporary suspension of the stock-price rule through June 30, 2009. Although effective
immediately, the rule is subject to a 30-day operative delay under Securities and Exchange Commission rules, for which the NYSE has
requested and expects to receive a waiver. As the suspension is currently proposed, if our stock price remains below $1 per share during the
suspension period, the compliance period for the 30 consecutive trading days will resume on July 1, 2009.

General market fluctuations, industry factors and general economic and political conditions and events, such as economic slowdowns or
recessions, interest rate changes or credit loss trends, also could cause our stock price to decrease regardless of our operating results.
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Item 1B. Unresolved Staff Comments
None.

Item 2. Properties
BancGroup owns its corporate offices in Montgomery, Alabama. Operations centers in Birmingham, Alabama and Orlando, Florida are leased.
BancGroup maintains regional executive offices in Alabama, Florida, Georgia, Nevada and Texas.

As of December 31, 2008, Colonial Bank owned 189 and leased 158 of its full-service branches. For additional information, see Note 1,
Summary of Significant Accounting and Reporting Policies and Basis of Presentation, Note 10, Commitments and Contingent Liabilities, and
Note 13, Premises and Equipment.

Item 3. Legal Proceedings
During the first quarter of 2009, BancGroup, certain officers and directors were named as defendants in purported class action lawsuits filed in
the U.S. District Court for the Middle District of Alabama alleging violations of federal securities laws. These lawsuits, brought on behalf of
shareholders who purchased BancGroup securities as early as January 23, 2008 and as late as January 27, 2009, allege primarily that the
defendants engaged in securities fraud by disseminating materially false and misleading statements during the class period. The lawsuits seek
unspecified compensatory damages (including interest), cost and expense, and injunctive relief. The lead plaintiff and class counsel have not
been selected. Colonial has until March 4, 2009 to respond to the claims in the first lawsuit.

On February 24, 2009, BancGroup received notice of a shareholder derivative action filed in the Circuit Court of Montgomery County,
Alabama, seeking to recover damages caused to the Company by its officers and directors. BancGroup�s directors and senior officers are alleged
to have breached their fiduciary obligations to the Corporation in connection with the Company�s participation in the U.S. Treasury Department�s
TARP programs. Colonial has until March 24, 2009 to respond to the claims.

Because these lawsuits were recently filed and there are significant uncertainties involved in any potential class action litigation, management is
unable to predict the outcome of the purported class action or derivative lawsuits and therefore cannot currently reasonably determine the
estimated future impact on the financial condition or results of operations of the Company. BancGroup and its directors and officers intend to
vigorously defend each of the lawsuits.

In the opinion of BancGroup, based on review and consultation with legal counsel, the outcome of all other litigation presently pending is not
anticipated to have a material adverse effect on BancGroup�s consolidated financial statements or results of operations.

Item 4. Submission of Matters to a Vote of Security Holders
None.
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PART II

Item 5. Market for Registrant�s Common Equity, Related Stockholder Matters and Issuer Purchases of Equity Securities
BancGroup�s Common Stock is traded on the New York Stock Exchange under the symbol �CNB.� As of February 18, 2009, BancGroup had
202,449,152 outstanding shares of Common Stock, with 9,959 registered shareholders.

The following table indicates the high and low sales prices for and dividends paid on Common Stock during 2008 and 2007.

Sale Price of
Common Stock

Dividends Declared
On Common Stock

(per share)High Low
2008
1st Quarter $ 16.06 $ 9.57 $ 0.190
2nd Quarter 10.67 3.38 0.095
3rd Quarter 10.50 3.05 0.095
4th Quarter 9.50 1.40 0.000

2007
1st Quarter $ 26.80 $ 23.86 $ 0.1875
2nd Quarter 25.43 23.49 0.1875
3rd Quarter 25.50 19.30 0.1875
4th Quarter 22.47 12.85 0.1875
In the fourth quarter of 2008, BancGroup�s Board of Directors suspended its quarterly dividend. The restrictions imposed upon Colonial Bank in
regard to its ability to pay dividends to BancGroup, which in turn limit BancGroup�s ability to pay dividends, are described further herein as well
as in Payment of Dividends and Other Restrictions in Item 1.

The information required by this item concerning Equity Compensation Plans is included in Item 12 and Note 22, Stock-Based Compensation,
both of which are incorporated herein by reference.

Issuer Purchases of Equity Securities

Period
Total Number of
Shares Purchased

Average Price
Paid per Share

Total Number of
Shares

Purchased as
Part of Publicly
Announced Plans
or Programs

Maximum Number
(or Approximate
Dollar Value) of
Shares that May
Yet Be Purchased
Under the Plans

or
Programs(1)

Cumulative through December 31, 2007 8,606,800 $ 24.26 8,606,800 $ 91,175,000

January 1 � December 31, 2008 � $ � � $ 91,175,000

Cumulative through December 31,2008 8,606,800 $ 24.26 8,606,800 $ 91,175,000

(1) Information is as of the end of the period.
In 2006, the Company publicly announced two share repurchase programs to purchase shares of BancGroup Common Stock not to exceed a
combined total of $150 million. During 2007, both of these repurchase programs were completed. On June 11, 2007, the Company publicly
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announced another share repurchase program to purchase shares of BancGroup Common Stock not to exceed $150 million, of which
approximately $91.2 million has yet to be purchased. This program will terminate on the earlier of its completion or June 8, 2009. BancGroup
did not make any purchases during 2008 and is not expected to make any purchases in 2009.
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Shareholder Performance Graph

Set forth below is a line graph comparing the five-year cumulative return of BancGroup common stock, based on an initial investment of $100
on December 31, 2003 and assuming reinvestment of dividends, with that of the Standard & Poor�s 500 Index (the �S&P 500�) and the S&P 500
Bank Index and the KBW Regional Banks index. The comparisons in this graph are set forth in response to the Securities and Exchange
Commission�s (the �SEC�) disclosure requirements, and therefore are not intended to forecast or be indicative of future performance of the
common stock.
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Item 6. Selected Financial Data
The following table sets forth selected financial data for the last five years:

2008 2007 2006 2005 2004
(In thousands, except per share amounts)

Statement of Income:
Interest income $ 1,385,827 $ 1,556,485 $ 1,455,585 $ 1,162,055 $ 848,017
Interest expense 722,314 795,111 700,318 452,833 280,769

Net interest income 663,513 761,374 755,267 709,222 567,248
Provision for loan losses 728,942 106,450 22,142 26,838 26,994

Net interest income after provision for loan losses (65,429) 654,924 733,125 682,384 540,254
Noninterest income 203,896 186,224 189,222 175,976 153,201
Noninterest expense excluding goodwill impairment 670,262 559,678 519,601 515,255 431,649
Goodwill impairment 575,000 � � � �
Minority interest expense/REIT preferred dividends 21,344 12,984 � � �

Income (loss) before income taxes (1,128,139) 268,486 402,746 343,105 261,806
Income tax expense (benefit) (247,667) 87,561 136,933 114,603 88,929

Net Income (Loss) $ (880,472) $ 180,925 $ 265,813 $ 228,502 $ 172,877

Earnings (loss) Per Common Share:
Net income (loss):
Basic $ (4.71) $ 1.18 $ 1.73 $ 1.53 $ 1.32
Diluted (4.71) 1.17 1.72 1.52 1.31
Average shares outstanding:
Basic 186,897 153,519 153,598 149,053 131,144
Diluted 186,897 154,391 154,810 150,790 132,315
Cash dividends per common share $ 0.38 $ 0.75 $ 0.68 $ 0.61 $ 0.58

2008 2007 2006 2005 2004
(In thousands)

Statement of Condition data at year end:
Total assets $ 25,816,306 $ 25,975,989 $ 22,784,249 $ 21,426,197 $ 18,896,610
Interest bearing deposits in banks and the Federal Reserve 1,534,463 28,993 2,200 9,417 3,828
Securities purchased under agreements to resell 1,556,157 2,049,664 605,937 589,902 221,491
Total securities 3,503,380 3,682,510 3,085,488 2,844,354 3,653,554
Loans, net of unearned income 14,530,018 15,923,178 15,478,889 14,899,864 12,857,811
Loans held for sale 2,082,248 1,544,222 1,474,000 1,097,892 678,496
Non-time deposits 7,989,907 9,771,573 9,092,663 9,012,943 7,546,038
Total deposits 18,673,265 18,544,267 16,091,054 15,483,449 11,863,695
Long-term debt 4,043,807 4,023,836 2,522,273 2,338,831 2,260,957
Shareholders� equity 1,344,978 2,273,571 2,057,335 1,932,691 1,398,291

Average balances:
Total assets 26,761,999 23,845,264 22,237,690 20,682,310 17,433,571
Interest-earning assets 24,308,648 21,636,867 20,409,906 18,943,511 16,173,539
Interest bearing deposits in banks and the Federal Reserve 334,294 10,504 3,887 23,748 7,734
Securities purchased under agreements to resell 2,029,631 1,467,233 592,840 489,688 76,554
Total securities 3,811,537 3,170,823 3,014,453 3,400,782 3,397,000
Loans, net of unearned income 15,454,146 15,290,766 15,339,699 14,139,380 12,148,513
Loans held for sale 2,598,804 1,613,170 1,374,115 823,177 497,315
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Non-time deposits 8,830,863 9,278,950 9,080,151 8,543,542 6,847,334
Total deposits 18,685,112 16,566,120 15,788,319 13,987,525 10,862,040
Shareholders� equity 2,264,692 2,166,296 1,992,772 1,779,081 1,285,772
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2008 2007 2006 2005 2004
Selected Financial Measures:
Net income to:
Average assets NM 0.76% 1.20% 1.10% 0.99%
Average shareholders� equity NM 8.35 13.34 12.84 13.45
Noninterest income/average assets 0.76% 0.78 0.85 0.85 0.88
Noninterest expense/average assets 4.65 2.35 2.34 2.49 2.48
Efficiency ratio(1) 142.17 58.68 54.94 58.11 59.76
Dividend payout ratio NM 64.10 39.53 40.13 44.27
Shareholders� equity to assets 5.21 8.75 9.03 9.02 7.40
Tangible common equity ratio 3.41 4.83 6.26 5.97 5.43
Tangible capital ratio 4.56 6.00 6.26 5.97 5.43
Book value per share $ 6.64 $ 14.44 $ 13.46 $ 12.53 $ 10.45
Tangible book value per share $ 4.26 $ 7.63 $ 9.05 $ 8.02 $ 7.50
Risk-based capital:(2)

Tier I 8.58% 8.22% 9.09% 9.15% 8.80%
Total 12.88 11.01 11.77 12.17 11.39
Tier I leverage(2) 5.90 6.67 7.81 7.77 7.16
Total nonperforming assets to net loans, other real estate and
repossessions(3) 4.83 0.86 0.16 0.21 0.29
Net charge-offs to average loans 4.16 0.35 0.12 0.14 0.19
Allowance for loan losses to total loans (net of unearned income) 2.24 1.50 1.13 1.15 1.16
Allowance for loan losses to nonperforming loans(3) 61 196 1247 662 548
Non-GAAP Measures:(4)

Core noninterest income/average assets(5) 0.75 0.88 0.82 0.85 0.84
Core noninterest expense/average assets(6) 2.46 2.27 2.33 2.42 2.42
Core efficiency ratio(7) 75.52 55.49 55.34 56.58 59.04

(1) Includes a goodwill impairment charge of $575.0 million for 2008. Refer to Note 14, Goodwill and Other Intangible Assets, in the Notes to Consolidated
Financial Statements for additional information.

(2) Refer to Note 19, Regulatory Matters and Restrictions, in the Notes to Consolidated Financial Statements for additional information.
(3) Nonperforming loans and nonperforming assets are shown as defined in the Risk Management section of Management�s Discussion and Analysis.
(4) Management believes that these non-GAAP measures provide information that is useful to investors in understanding the performance of the Company�s

underlying operations and performance trends. Specifically, these measures permit evaluation and comparison of results for ongoing business operations, and
it is on this basis that Management internally assesses the Company�s performance.

(5) Excluded from core noninterest income are securities and derivatives gains (losses), net totaling $3.0 million, $4.0 million, $4.8 million, ($24.7) million, and
$7.5 million for 2008, 2007, 2006, 2005, and 2004, respectively; securities restructuring charges of ($36.0) million for 2007; gain on sale of mortgages and
businesses of $8.8 million and $2.8 million for 2007 and 2006, respectively; gain on sale of branches of $37.0 million for 2005; and changes in fair value of
swap derivatives of ($12.1) million for 2005 and ($0.4) million for 2004.

(6) Excluded from core noninterest expense are severance expense of $786,000, $6.6 million and $413,000 for 2008, 2007 and 2006, respectively; merger related
expenses of $4.0 million, $4.2 million, and $2.0 million for 2007, 2005, and 2004, respectively; net losses related to the early extinguishment of debt of $10.3
million, $6.9 million, $9.6 million and $7.4 million for 2008, 2007, 2005 and 2004, respectively; and goodwill impairment of $575.0 million for 2008.

(7) This ratio utilizes core noninterest income and core noninterest expense as detailed in notes (5) and (6) above.
NM Not meaningful

22

Edgar Filing: COLONIAL BANCGROUP INC - Form 10-K

Index to Financial Statements 29



Index to Financial Statements

Selected Quarterly Financial Data 2008-2007

2008 2007
Dec. 31 Sept. 30 June 30 March 31 Dec. 31 Sept. 30 June 30 March 31

(In thousands, except per share amounts)
Interest income $ 318,133 $ 336,417 $ 347,740 $ 383,537 $ 400,197 $ 395,534 $ 383,874 $ 376,880
Interest expense 177,417 169,668 173,316 201,913 204,996 199,523 193,657 196,935

Net interest income 140,716 166,749 174,424 181,624 195,201 196,011 190,217 179,945
Provision for loan losses 455,000 159,399 79,000 35,543 93,295 4,800 6,105 2,250

Net interest income after provision for loan losses (314,284) 7,350 95,424 146,081 101,906 191,211 184,112 177,695
Noninterest income 44,786 45,640 55,723 57,747 59,266 52,958 58,781 15,219
Noninterest expense excluding goodwill
impairment 179,680 162,439 164,167 163,978 145,102 134,951 141,484 138,141
Goodwill impairment 575,000 � � � � � � �
Minority interest expense/REIT preferred
dividends 5,336 5,336 5,336 5,336 5,336 5,336 2,312 �
Income tax expense (benefit) (204,409) (43,575) (9,400) 9,717 1,762 34,527 32,978 18,294

Net income (loss) $ (825,105) $ (71,210) $ (8,956) $ 24,797 $ 8,972 $ 69,355 $ 66,119 $ 36,479

Earnings (Loss) Per Share:
Net income (loss)
Basic $ (4.11) $ (0.35) $ (0.05) $ 0.16 $ 0.06 $ 0.45 $ 0.43 $ 0.24
Diluted $ (4.11) $ (0.35) $ (0.05) $ 0.16 $ 0.06 $ 0.45 $ 0.43 $ 0.24

Item 7. Management�s Discussion and Analysis of Financial Condition and Results of Operations
This annual report to shareholders, the Annual Report on Form 10-K and the information incorporated by reference contain �forward-looking
statements� within the meaning of the federal securities laws. Words such as �believes�, �estimates�, �plans�, �expects�, �should�, �may�,
�might�, �could�, �outlook�, �potential�, �would�, �anticipates�, the negative of these terms and similar expressions as they relate to
BancGroup (including its subsidiaries and its management), are intended to identify forward-looking statements. The forward-looking
statements in these reports are subject to risks and uncertainties that could cause actual results to differ materially from those expressed in or
implied by the statements.

In addition to factors mentioned elsewhere in this annual report or previously disclosed in BancGroup�s SEC reports (accessible on the SEC�s
website at www.sec.gov or on BancGroup�s website at www.colonialbank.com), the following factors, among others, could cause actual results
to differ materially from forward-looking statements, and future results could differ materially from historical performance. These factors are
not exclusive:

� losses in our loan portfolio are greater than estimated or expected;

� an inability to raise additional capital on terms and conditions that are satisfactory;

� failure to receive final approval for the U.S. Treasury Department�s Capital Purchase Program;
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� the impact of current economic conditions and the impact of our results of operations on our ability to borrow additional funds to meet
our liquidity needs;
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� economic conditions affecting real estate values and transactions in BancGroup�s market and/or general economic conditions, either
nationally or regionally, that are less favorable or take longer to recover than expected;

� changes in the interest rate environment which expand or reduce margins or adversely affect critical estimates as applied and projected
returns on investments and fair values of assets;

� continued or sustained deterioration of market and economic conditions or business performance could increase the likelihood that we
would have an additional goodwill impairment charge;

� deposit attrition, customer loss or revenue loss in the ordinary course of business;

� increases in competitive pressure in the banking industry and from non-banks;

� costs or difficulties related to the integration of the businesses of BancGroup and institutions it acquires are greater than expected;

� the inability of BancGroup to realize elements of its strategic and operating plans for 2009 and beyond;

� natural disasters in BancGroup�s primary market areas result in prolonged business disruption or materially impair the value of
collateral securing loans;

� management�s assumptions and estimates underlying critical accounting policies prove to be inadequate or materially incorrect or are
not borne out by subsequent events;

� the impact of recent and future federal and state regulatory changes;

� current or future litigation, regulatory investigations, proceedings or inquiries;

� strategies to manage interest rate risk may yield results other than those anticipated;

� changes which may occur in the regulatory environment;

� a significant rate of inflation (deflation);

� unanticipated litigation or claims;

� changes in the securities markets;
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� acts of terrorism or war; and

� details of the recently enacted Emergency Economic Stabilization Act of 2008, the American Recovery and Reinvestment Act of 2009
and various announced and unannounced programs implemented by the U.S. Treasury Department and bank regulators to address
capital and liquidity concerns in the banking system, are still being finalized and may have a significant effect on the financial services
industry and BancGroup.

Many of these factors are beyond BancGroup�s control. The reader is cautioned not to place undue reliance on any forward looking statements
made by or on behalf of BancGroup. Any such statement speaks only as of the date the statement was made or as of such date that may be
referenced within the statement. BancGroup does not undertake any obligation to update or revise any forward-looking statements.

Management�s Discussion and Analysis of Financial Condition and Results of Operations is presented on the following pages. The principal
purpose of this review is to provide the reader of the attached financial statements and accompanying notes with a detailed analysis of the
financial results of The Colonial BancGroup, Inc. and subsidiaries.
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EXECUTIVE OVERVIEW

The Colonial BancGroup, Inc. is a $25.8 billion financial services company providing diversified services including retail and commercial
banking, wealth management services, mortgage banking and insurance products through its branch network, private banking offices or officers,
ATMs and the internet as well as other distribution channels to consumers and businesses. At December 31, 2008, BancGroup had 347 branches
in Florida, Alabama, Georgia, Nevada and Texas.

The following chart includes the Company�s assets, deposits and branches by state as of December 31, 2008.

Assets Deposits Branches
Amount % Amount % Number %

(Dollars in millions)
Florida $ 15,949 62% $ 10,770 58% 197 57%
Alabama 4,422 17% 4,224 23% 90 26%
Georgia 1,286 5% 775 4% 19 5%
Texas 1,778 7% 793 4% 21 6%
Nevada 976 4% 833 4% 20 6%
Corporate/Other 1,405 5% 1,278 7% � �

Total $ 25,816 100% $ 18,673 100% 347 100%

Strategy

BancGroup is built upon the foundation of a community banking philosophy that emphasizes local responsibility for customer relationships. The
local market personnel are supported by centralized operations, which allow the local banking officers to concentrate on serving their customers.
Through this structure of local customer relationship responsibility and centralized operations, the local banking officers generally have
customer level decision making capability while at the same time having an operational support structure.

Overview of Financial Condition and Earnings

Earnings

Colonial incurred a net loss for the year ended December 31, 2008 of $4.71 per diluted share, a significant decrease from the $1.17 earned in
2007. Colonial�s net loss for the year was $880 million compared to net income of $181 million for 2007. The 2008 loss was driven by credit
costs and goodwill impairment which are more fully described below.

Colonial�s net interest income decreased 13% from 2007, driven by a 79 basis point compression of net interest margin. The net interest margin
for 2008 was 2.76% compared to 3.55% for 2007. The margin compression was driven by these primary factors: (1) a 35 basis point reduction
from the impact of customer preference for certificates of deposits, which resulted in a mix change to higher cost deposits from low cost deposits
and fierce deposit pricing competition during 2008 which kept deposit rates high compared to other market rates; (2) a 20 basis point reduction
from the impact of credit related reductions on interest income, including interest reversals when loans are placed on nonaccrual status as well as
a lack of income while those loans remain on nonaccrual status and (3) a 16 basis point reduction from a decrease in loans which were replaced
with lower yielding assets. These factors caused yields on interest earning assets to contract by 148 basis points while the cost of deposits only
decreased 69 basis points despite a decrease of 296 basis points in the average Federal Funds rate.

Noninterest income for 2008 increased 9% from 2007. Mortgage warehouse fees decreased by $17.0 million as a result of discontinuing the
sales of assets to the commercial paper conduits in January 2008. Other income
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also declined by $6.2 million due to less income from joint ventures and gains on the sales of assets. These decreases were partially offset by
increases in mortgage banking origination and sales of $15.0 million and wealth management revenues of $1.2 million. Non-core items
increased over 2007 by $26.3 million, primarily due to the securities restructuring charges of $36.0 million recognized in 2007.

Noninterest expense increased in 2008 by 122%, or $685.6 million, compared to 2007. The increase reflects a noncash goodwill impairment
charge of $575.0 million in 2008, increased losses and expenses on other real estate of $27.2 million, increased losses on equity investments of
$13.9 million, increased FDIC insurance and other regulatory fees of $11.8 million as 2007 fees were substantially offset by credits, increased
costs related to the addition of branches through acquisition and de novo expansion and a net loss on early extinguishment of debt totaling $10.3
million. Reductions in severance expense and merger related expenses of $5.8 million and $4.0 million, respectively, partially offset the
increases.

Colonial recorded a noncash charge of $575.0 million in the fourth quarter of 2008 for goodwill impairment. Goodwill recorded on past
acquisitions in Florida and Nevada became impaired in the fourth quarter primarily due to declining bank market valuations and increased credit
costs. Refer to the Goodwill section of Management�s Discussion and Analysis for additional information.

Colonial�s loan loss provision was $728.9 million in 2008 compared to $106.5 million in 2007. The Company provided for net charge-offs of
$642.8 million in 2008 and increased its allowance for loan losses by $86.2 million to $325.0 million, or 2.24% of net loans, at December 31,
2008 compared to $238.8 million, or 1.50% of net loans, at December 31, 2007.

Asset Quality

For the year ended December 31, 2008, Colonial charged off $642.8 million of loans compared to $54.1 million for 2007, and recorded
provision for loan losses of $728.9 million, compared to $106.5 million for 2007. With provision exceeding net charge-offs, the allowance for
loan losses increased to 2.24% of net loans at December 31, 2008, from 1.50% at December 31, 2007. Nonperforming assets were $710.5
million, or 4.83%, of loans, net of unearned income, and other real estate, at December 31, 2008, compared to $137.6 million, or 0.86%, at
December 31, 2007. At December 31, 2008, 79% of Colonial�s nonperforming assets were real estate construction-related. During 2008, Colonial
reduced real estate construction loans to $4.9 billion, a $1.4 billion, or 22%, reduction compared to December 31, 2007.

Liquidity

The Company�s liquidity position at December 31, 2008 exceeded the Company�s forecasted cash uses for 2009.

The Company�s primary source of funding is deposits which funded 72% of total assets at December 31, 2008. During 2008, deposits increased
$129.0 million to $18.7 billion, with retail deposits comprising $17.4 billion of the total. Colonial has chosen to participate in the deposit
insurance component of the Temporary Liquidity Guarantee Program (TLGP) and as such, the FDIC insures up to $250,000 per deposit
relationship and provides unlimited deposit insurance for certain transaction accounts. All banks that participate in the TLGP deposit insurance
program have the same FDIC insurance coverage. Time deposits of $9.4 billion that mature during 2009 are expected to be renewed or
substantially replaced by new originations. Total deposits increased after year end to $19.5 billion on February 28, 2009.

During 2009, only $42.4 million of the Company�s long-term debt will mature. The Company expects to repay the debt as it becomes due.

In response to the significant market and economic uncertainty in the United Sates, Colonial had cash and interest bearing deposits in banks and
the Federal Reserve of over $2.0 billion at December 31, 2008.
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Capital

BancGroup�s total risk-based capital ratio at December 31, 2008 was 12.88%, and its Tier I risk-based capital ratio was 8.58%, exceeding the
regulatory definitional guidelines for �well capitalized� of 10% and 6%, respectively. The Company�s total and Tier I risk-based capital ratios at
December 31, 2007 were 11.01% and 8.22%, respectively. The Company�s Tier I leverage ratios were 5.90% and 6.67% at December 31, 2008
and 2007, respectively, also exceeding the regulatory guidelines for �well capitalized� of 5%.

Dividends

In 2008, the Company paid dividends of $68.4 million, or $0.38 per share to its shareholders, compared to $115.0 million, or $0.75 per share, in
2007. The Company suspended dividend payments in the fourth quarter of 2008.

Business Combinations

While Colonial did not make any acquisitions during 2008, the Company made two acquisitions in 2007 � Miami, Florida based Commercial
Bankshares, Inc. and its subsidiary Commercial Bank of Florida, and Lakeland, Florida based Citrus & Chemical Bancorporation, Inc. and its
subsidiary Citrus & Chemical Bank. For more information about the 2007 acquisitions, refer to Note 4, Business Combinations, in the Notes to
Consolidated Financial Statements.

CRITICAL ACCOUNTING POLICIES

BancGroup�s significant accounting and reporting policies are presented in Note 1, Summary of Significant Accounting and Reporting Policies
and Basis of Presentation. These policies, along with the disclosures presented in the other notes, provide information on how significant assets
and liabilities are valued in the financial statements and how those values are determined. Those accounting policies involving significant
estimates and assumptions by management, which have, or could have, a material impact on the carrying value of certain assets and impact
comprehensive income, are considered critical accounting policies. BancGroup recognizes the following as critical accounting policies:
Allowance for Loan Losses, Fair Value of Financial Instruments, Purchase Accounting and Goodwill, Income Taxes, Consolidations and
Stock-Based Compensation.

Allowance for Loan Losses

Management�s ongoing evaluation of the adequacy of the allowance considers both impaired and unimpaired loans and takes into consideration
the Company�s past loan loss experience, known and inherent risks in the portfolio, existing adverse situations that may affect the borrowers�
ability to repay, estimated value of any underlying collateral, an analysis of existing guarantees and an analysis of current economic conditions.
While management believes that it has exercised prudent judgment and applied reasonable assumptions which have resulted in an allowance
presented in accordance with generally accepted accounting principles, there can be no assurance that in the future, adverse economic
conditions, increased nonperforming loans or other factors will not require further increases in the allowance. A more detailed discussion of
BancGroup�s allowance for loan losses is included in the Risk Management section of Management�s Discussion and Analysis as well as Note 1,
Summary of Significant Accounting and Reporting Policies and Basis of Presentation.
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The table below illustrates BancGroup�s sensitivity to changes in certain factors used in the determination of the allowance for loan losses.

Estimated Effect on
2008 Provision

Expense Assuming the
Following Changes in
Each Determining

Factor(2)
Factors +10% -10%

(In thousands)
Loan portfolio size $ 25,160 $ (25,160)
Net charge-offs 20,625 (20,625)
Criticized loans(1) 9,107 (9,107)

(1) Criticized loans include all loans rated special mention or worse.
(2) These computations do not contemplate any action BancGroup could or would undertake in response to changes in each of these risk factors.
Fair Value of Financial Instruments

A portion of BancGroup�s assets and liabilities are measured at fair value on a recurring basis, including securities available for sale, loans held
for sale for which BancGroup has elected the fair value option, and derivative assets and liabilities. Certain other assets are measured at fair
value on a nonrecurring basis. These adjustments to fair value usually result from application of lower of cost or fair value accounting or
write-downs of individual assets due to impairment. Effective January 1, 2008, the Company adopted Statement of Financial Accounting
Standards (SFAS) 157, Fair Value Measurements, which defines fair value, establishes a framework for measuring fair value, and expands
disclosures about assets and liabilities measured at fair value. SFAS 157 defines fair value as the price that would be received to sell a financial
asset or to transfer a financial liability in an orderly transaction between market participants at the measurement date. SFAS 157 establishes a
three-level hierarchy for disclosure of assets and liabilities recorded at fair value. This classification of assets and liabilities within the hierarchy
is based on whether the inputs to the valuation methodology used in the measurement are observable or unobservable. Observable inputs reflect
market-driven or market-based information obtained from independent sources, while unobservable inputs reflect the Company�s estimates about
market data. These three levels of inputs that may be used to measure fair value are:

Level 1 Quoted prices in active markets for identical assets or liabilities.
Level 2 Directly or indirectly observable inputs other than Level 1 prices, such as quoted prices for similar assets or liabilities

in active markets; quoted prices for identical or similar assets or liabilities in markets that are not active; inputs other
than quoted prices that are observable for the asset or liability (for example, interest rates and yield curves observable
at commonly quoted intervals, volatilities, prepayment speeds, loss severities, credit risks, and default rates); or inputs
that are derived principally from or corroborated by observable market data by correlation or other means.

Level 3 Unobservable inputs that are supported by little or no market activity and that are significant to the fair value of the
assets or liabilities. Level 3 assets and liabilities would include financial instruments whose value is determined using
pricing models, discounted cash flow methodologies, or similar techniques, as well as instruments for which the
determination of fair value requires significant management judgment or estimation.

In accordance with SFAS 157, it is the Company�s policy to maximize the use of observable inputs and to minimize the use of unobservable
inputs when developing fair value measurements. When active markets exist, quoted market prices for identical or similar financial instruments
are used to measure fair value. In the absence of active markets, management determines the fair value of BancGroup�s assets and liabilities using
models which are based on management�s judgment, assumptions and estimates regarding credit quality, liquidity,
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interest rates and other relevant inputs. A substantial portion of the Company�s financial instruments are measured using Level 1 or Level 2
inputs. However, in certain cases, when market observable prices and inputs are not based on actively traded instruments, judgments must be
made about assumptions market participants would use in estimating the fair value of the financial instrument.

The degree of judgment involved in determining the fair value of a financial instrument depends on the availability of quoted market prices or
observable market data from active markets. For financial instruments that trade actively and have quoted market prices or observable market
data, there is minimal subjectivity. When observable market data from active markets is not available, judgment is necessary to estimate fair
value. In addition, changes in market conditions may reduce the availability of quoted market prices or observable market data. For example,
reduced liquidity in the capital markets or changes in secondary market activity could result in observable market data becoming unavailable.
Therefore, when market data is not available, the Company uses valuation methods requiring more management judgment to estimate fair value.

Carrying financial assets and liabilities at fair value inherently results in more financial statement volatility as compared to carrying such assets
and liabilities at historical or amortized cost. At December 31, 2008, $5.1 billion, or 19.6%, of BancGroup�s total assets were measured at fair
value on a recurring basis. Approximately 76.2% of these assets were classified as Level 1 or Level 2 within the fair value hierarchy. At
December 31, 2008, $27.3 million, or 0.1%, of BancGroup�s total liabilities were measured at fair value on a recurring basis. Approximately
1.5% of these liabilities were classified as Level 1 or Level 2 within the fair value hierarchy. The measurement of these financial instruments
therefore is less subjective to judgment than those classified as Level 3 as they are based upon quoted market prices or observable market-driven
or market-based information.

At December 31, 2008, $378.5 million, or 1.5%, of BancGroup�s total assets were measured at fair value on a nonrecurring basis. Approximately
1.9% of these assets were classified as Level 1 or Level 2. At December 31, 2008, there were no liabilities measured at fair value on a
nonrecurring basis.

Level 3 assets measured at fair value on a recurring basis were 23.8% of total assets measured at fair value and 4.7% of total assets at
December 31, 2008. Level 3 liabilities measured at fair value on a recurring basis were 98.5% of total liabilities measured at fair value and 0.1%
of total liabilities at December 31, 2008.

Level 3 assets and liabilities measured at fair value on a recurring basis as of December 31, 2008 include the following: the Company�s call
options related to interests in short-term participations in mortgage loans, interest rate lock commitments and the related forward sales
commitments which were transferred into Level 3 during the second quarter of 2008 due to the significance of unobservable inputs (such as the
probability of funding) to the overall value of these instruments; and, the Company�s non-agency mortgage-backed securities which were
transferred into Level 3 in the third quarter of 2008. The transfer of these securities available for sale into Level 3 was based on a significant
reduction in market liquidity for these securities. In valuing Level 3 assets and liabilities, significant inputs include market interest rates, future
cash flows, the fair value of underlying mortgages (call options, interest rate lock commitments and forward sales commitments) and pull
through rates (interest rate lock commitments and forward sales commitments). For further discussion on Level 3 instruments, see Note 5, Fair
Value Measurements.

Imprecision in estimating unobservable market inputs can impact the amount of income or loss recorded for a particular fair value measurement.
Furthermore, while BancGroup believes its valuation methods are appropriate and consistent with other market participants, the use of different
methodologies or assumptions to determine the fair value of certain financial instruments could result in a different estimate of fair value at the
reporting date. For a detailed discussion of the determination of fair value for individual financial instruments, see Note 5, Fair Value
Measurements.
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Purchase Accounting and Goodwill

For an acquisition, BancGroup is generally required to record the assets acquired, including identified intangible assets, and liabilities assumed
at their fair value, which often involves estimates based on third-party valuations, such as appraisals, or internal valuations based on discounted
cash flow analyses or other valuation techniques, which are inherently subjective. The amortization of identifiable intangible assets is based
upon the estimated economic benefits to be received, which is also subjective. These estimates also include the establishment of various accruals
and allowances based on planned facility dispositions and employee severance considerations, as well as other acquisition-related items.

BancGroup records goodwill in an amount equal to the excess of the cost of an acquisition over the fair value of the net assets acquired.
BancGroup tests goodwill for impairment on an annual basis, or more often if events or circumstances indicate that there may be impairment.
The Company has elected to perform its annual testing as of September 30 each year. The goodwill impairment test is a two-step process, which
requires management to make judgments in determining the assumptions used in the calculations. The first step involves estimating the fair
value of each reporting unit and comparing it to the reporting unit�s carrying value, which includes the allocated goodwill. If the estimated fair
value is less than the carrying value, then a second step is performed to measure the actual amount of goodwill impairment. The second step
initially involves determining the implied fair value of goodwill. This requires the Company to allocate the estimated fair value to all the assets
and liabilities of the reporting unit. Any unallocated fair value represents the implied fair value of goodwill which is compared to its
corresponding carrying value. If the implied fair value is less than the carrying value, an impairment loss is recognized in an amount equal to
that deficit.

Fair values of reporting units are estimated using discounted cash flow models derived from internal earnings forecasts. The key assumptions
used to estimate the fair value of each reporting unit include earnings forecasts for five years, terminal values based on estimated future growth
rates and discount rates that reflect the range of the Company�s market capitalization plus a control premium.

The more significant fair value adjustments in the second step of the impairment test were to loans in each of the reporting units. These
adjustments reflect current market conditions and include significant liquidity discounts. Also, the step two analysis included adjustments to
previously recorded identifiable intangible assets to reflect them at fair value and also included the fair value of additional intangibles not
previously recognized. The adjustments to measure the assets, liabilities and intangibles at fair value are for the purpose of measuring the
implied fair value of goodwill and such adjustments are not reflected in the Consolidated Statements of Condition.

The Company�s annual goodwill impairment test was performed as of September 30, 2008. As a result of the annual impairment test, even
though four reporting units were required to perform a second step analysis, management determined that no goodwill impairment charge was
required at that time, as the implied fair value of goodwill for each tested reporting unit exceeded its carrying value. Due to the decline in market
valuations for financial institutions, including Colonial, and an increase in credit costs during the fourth quarter of 2008, an interim impairment
test was performed as of December 31, 2008. As a result of the interim impairment test, the Company computed and recorded a $575.0 million
goodwill impairment loss in the fourth quarter of 2008, reducing the balance of goodwill to the implied fair value from the second step of the
impairment test. See Note 14, Goodwill and Other Intangible Assets, for additional information.

Due to the ongoing uncertainty in market conditions, which may continue to negatively impact the performance of BancGroup�s reporting units
as well as the market valuations of financial institutions, including Colonial, management will continue to monitor and evaluate the carrying
value of goodwill. Additional goodwill impairment could be recorded in future periods and such impairment could be material to the Company�s
results of operations.
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The table below illustrates BancGroup�s sensitivity to changes in the rates used in discounting the estimated future cash flows. The sensitivity
analysis was based on information available as of the interim test date of December 31, 2008. Further discussion regarding BancGroup�s
accounting for goodwill is included at Note 1, Summary of Significant Accounting and Reporting Policies and Basis of Presentation.

Sensitivity of Goodwill Impairment Analysis
Results Assuming the Following Changes in

Discount Rates(1)
No Change +10% - 10%

(In thousands)
Total goodwill impairment $ 575,000 $ 676,970 $ 416,365

(1) These computations do not take into account changes in the forecasted cash flows and future annual growth rates. Further, the computations do not
contemplate any action BancGroup could undertake in response to changes in the risks associated with the operations of each reporting unit.

Income Taxes

BancGroup uses the asset and liability method of accounting for income taxes. Determination of the deferred and current provision requires
analysis by management of certain transactions and the related tax laws and regulations. Management exercises significant judgment in
evaluating the amount and timing of recognition of the resulting tax liabilities and assets. Those judgments and estimates are re-evaluated on a
continual basis as regulatory and business factors change.

The Company periodically reviews the carrying amount of its deferred tax assets to determine if the establishment of a valuation allowance is
necessary. If, based on the available evidence in future periods, it is more likely than not that all or a portion of the Company�s deferred tax assets
will not be realized, a deferred tax valuation allowance would be established and could be material to the results of operations. Consideration is
given to all positive and negative evidence related to the realization of the deferred tax assets.

In evaluating the available evidence, management considers historical financial performance, expectation of future earnings, the ability to
carryback losses to recoup taxes previously paid, length of statutory carryforward periods, experience with operating loss and tax credit
carryforwards not expiring unused, tax planning strategies and timing of reversals of temporary differences. Significant judgment is required in
assessing future earnings trends and the timing of reversals of temporary differences. The Company�s evaluation is based on current tax laws as
well as management�s expectations of future performance based on its strategic initiatives. Changes in existing tax laws and future results that
differ from expectations may result in significant changes in the deferred tax asset valuation allowance. See Note 25, Income Taxes, for
additional information.

Effective January 1, 2007, the Company adopted Financial Accounting Standards Board (FASB) Interpretation (FIN) 48, Accounting for
Uncertainty in Income Taxes, which establishes a two-step process for recognizing and measuring tax benefits. FIN 48 applies to all tax
positions within the scope of SFAS 109, Accounting for Income Taxes. Under FIN 48, tax benefits can only be recognized in BancGroup�s
financial statements if it is more likely than not that the benefits would be sustained after full review by the relevant taxing authority.

The application of income tax law is inherently complex. Laws and regulations in this area are voluminous, are often ambiguous and are
frequently amended. Colonial is required to make many subjective assumptions and judgments regarding income tax exposures. Interpretations
of and guidance surrounding income tax laws and regulations change over time. As such, changes in the Company�s subjective assumptions and
judgments can materially affect amounts recognized in the consolidated balance sheets and statements of income.
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Consolidations

The Company enters into a variety of financing and investing arrangements in the normal course of business. Financing arrangements are
entered into to meet balance sheet management, funding, liquidity and market or credit risk management needs. Investing arrangements are
entered into in order to earn a return on investment. Because certain financing arrangements are made through legal entities and certain
investments are in separate legal entities, the Company must evaluate whether or not these entities should be consolidated into the Company for
financial reporting. In determining whether the entities involved in these arrangements should be consolidated, the Company first considers the
guidance in Accounting Research Bulletin 51, Consolidated Financial Statements, which requires a company�s consolidated financial statements
to include subsidiaries in which the company has a controlling financial interest. This requirement is usually applied to subsidiaries in which a
company has a majority voting interest. However, for entities that are not controllable through voting interests or in which the equity investors
do not bear the residual economic risks, the Company follows the guidance in FIN 46(R), Consolidation of Variable Interest Entities.
Determining whether a variable interest entity (VIE) should be consolidated requires the Company to make estimates about the VIE�s expected
losses and expected residual returns, as well as the extent to which those expected losses and expected residual returns will be absorbed by the
Company. If the Company absorbs a majority of either, it is considered the primary beneficiary and is required to consolidate the VIE.

Stock-Based Compensation

Effective January 1, 2006, the Company adopted SFAS 123(R), Share-Based Payment, which requires all stock-based payments to employees to
be recognized in the income statement based on their fair values. Prior to January 1, 2006, the Company accounted for stock
based-compensation under the intrinsic value method prescribed by Accounting Principles Board (APB) Opinion 25, which only required the
recognition of compensation cost for the excess, if any, of the quoted market price of the stock at the grant date or other measurement date over
the amount an employee must pay to acquire the stock. As such, under APB 25 the Company generally recognized no compensation expense for
stock options since the exercise prices equaled the market prices of BancGroup common stock on the grant dates. The Company did, however,
recognize compensation cost for restricted stock awards since such awards have no exercise price. Also, under APB 25 the Company accounted
for forfeitures as they occurred. Under SFAS 123(R), the Company is required to estimate forfeitures for awards which are not expected to vest.

The Company adopted SFAS 123(R) using the modified prospective transition method which did not require the restatement of prior periods to
reflect the fair value method of expensing stock-based compensation. SFAS 123(R) did require a cumulative effect adjustment of previously
recognized compensation expense in order to estimate forfeitures for awards outstanding on the adoption date. The cumulative effect adjustment
was immaterial.

The Company estimates the fair value of stock options using the Black-Scholes valuation model, which requires the input of subjective
assumptions including expected option term and expected stock price volatility. Further, the Company now estimates forfeitures for awards
granted which are not expected to vest. Changes in these assumptions and estimates can materially affect the calculated fair value of stock-based
compensation and the related expense to be recognized. As a result of implementing SFAS 123(R), the Company refined its process for
estimating option term and expected stock price volatility.

For options granted during 2008, 2007 and 2006, the expected option term was determined based upon analysis of the Company�s historical
experience with exercise and post-vesting termination behavior of employees. The resulting expected option term was 5.33 years. The expected
volatility was determined based upon historical daily prices of the Company�s common stock over the most recent period equal to the expected
option term, as well as implied price volatility based on the Company�s exchange traded options. The indicated historical and implied volatilities
were weighted 75% and 25%, respectively. Less emphasis was placed on
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implied volatility compared to historical volatility because the volume of exchange traded options is relatively low. The resulting weighted
average expected volatility was 34.9%, 21.4% and 22.8% in 2008, 2007 and 2006, respectively. The expected forfeiture rate was determined
based on analysis of the Company�s historical experience with employees� pre-vesting termination behavior.

As of December 31, 2008, the total unrecognized compensation cost related to nonvested awards was $11.8 million. The unrecognized
compensation cost is expected to be recognized over a weighted average period of 3.1 years.

REVIEW OF RESULTS OF OPERATIONS

The Company reported a net loss of $880.5 million in 2008 compared to net income of $180.9 million for 2007, representing a loss per diluted
share of $4.71 and earnings per diluted share of $1.17 for 2008 and 2007, respectively.

Net Interest Income

Net interest income is the Company�s primary source of revenue. Net interest income represents the difference between interest and fee income
generated from earning assets and the interest expense paid on deposits and borrowed funds. Interest rate volatility, which impacts the volume
and mix of earning assets and interest bearing liabilities as well as their rates, can significantly impact net interest income. The net interest
margin is fully tax equivalent net interest income expressed as a percentage of average earning assets for the period being measured. The net
interest margin is presented on a fully tax equivalent basis to consistently reflect income from taxable and tax-exempt loans and securities.

Beginning in late 2007 and early 2008, the yield curve returned to a more normalized level after remaining flat or inverted since late 2005.
Short-term rates were driven by rate decreases by the Federal Reserve, while long-term rates were driven by market supply and demand for debt
instruments. After remaining constant at 5.25% from June 2006 to September 2007, the Federal Reserve Board lowered the Federal Funds rate
resulting in a Federal Funds rate at December 31, 2008 between zero and 0.25%. Due to intense competition for deposits from financial services
companies, the cost of funds in the financial sector has not declined in tandem or commensurate with the decrease in the Federal Funds rate. The
following table shows the Federal Funds rate and U.S. Treasury yield curve at each quarter end during the past two years.
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For the twelve months ended December 31, 2008, the Company�s net interest income, on a tax equivalent basis, decreased $95.6 million, or
12.5%, as compared to the same period of the prior year. The yield on average earning assets decreased 61 basis points more than the decrease in
the rate on average interest bearing liabilities causing net interest margin to contract 79 basis points. The impact to net interest income caused by
net interest margin contraction was somewhat mitigated by $334.2 million in net proceeds from the issuance of 43.7 million shares of
BancGroup common stock in April 2008.

Net interest income was negatively impacted by a 296 basis point decline in the average Wall Street Journal Prime rate and a 258 basis point
decline in the average 1 Month LIBOR rate for the twelve months ended December 2008, as compared to the same period of the prior year. For
the twelve months ended December 31, 2008 and December 31, 2007, approximately 64% and 63%, respectively, of Colonial�s earning assets
were variable, adjustable, or short-term in nature. In addition, Colonial�s deposit costs did not decline in tandem with the decline in prime and
LIBOR rates due to intense competition for deposits from financial services companies. The average cost of deposits exceeded the average
Federal Funds rate by at least 57 basis points for the twelve months ended December 31, 2008, as compared to the twelve months ended
December 31, 2007, when the average cost of deposits was lower than the average Federal Funds rate by 170 basis points. The spread between
the average Federal Funds rate and the average cost of deposits increased throughout 2008 as the average cost of deposits was 26 basis points
less than the average Federal Funds rate in the first quarter of 2008 and was 155 basis points greater than the average Federal Funds rate for the
fourth quarter of 2008.

In an effort to mitigate the impact to earnings from the Company�s asset sensitive balance sheet, Colonial added interest rate floors on certain
mortgage warehouse assets during 2008 and slowed the decline in Colonial�s base rate. At December 31, 2008, approximately $4.3 billion, or
16.5%, of total assets had a weighted average floor of 5.10%. In addition, Colonial did not reduce its base rate at the same pace as the Wall
Street Journal Prime Rate. Colonial�s average base rate of 8.05% for 2007 equaled the Wall Street Journal Prime Rate while Colonial�s average
base rate of 5.71% for 2008 was greater than the Wall Street Journal Prime Rate by 62 basis points. At December 31, 2008, approximately $2.9
billion, or 12.2%, of earning assets were tied to Colonial�s base rate of 4.5%. The following table shows average rates for selected balance sheet
categories as well as selected market rates:

Analysis of Average Rates

Twelve Months Ended
December 31, Increase/

(Decrease)2008 2007
Loans, net of unearned income 6.02% 7.64% (1.62)%
Loans held for sale 5.12% 6.87% (1.75)%
Securities 5.78% 5.66% 0.12%
Resell agreements & other interest earning assets 4.50% 6.67% (2.17)%
Total interest earning assets 5.74% 7.22% (1.48)%
Interest bearing deposits 3.16% 4.06% (0.90)%
Total deposits 2.66% 3.35% (0.69)%
Wholesale borrowings 4.30% 5.07% (0.77)%
Total interest bearing liabilities 3.45% 4.32% (0.87)%
Federal Funds rate 2.09% 5.05% (2.96)%
1 Month LIBOR 2.67% 5.25% (2.58)%
Wall Street Journal Prime 5.09% 8.05% (2.96)%
Colonial�s base rate 5.71% 8.05% (2.34)%
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Interest Earning Assets

Average earning assets increased $2.7 billion, or 12.3%, from 2007. Average earning assets, as shown below, consisted primarily of loans,
securities, loans held for sale and securities purchased under agreements to resell (included in other earning assets below). Colonial had a larger
proportion of securities, loans held for sale, and securities purchased under agreements to resell for the twelve months ended December 31,
2008, as compared to the same period of the prior year.

Average Funding

Average funding grew $2.9 billion, or 12.2%, for the twelve months ended December 31, 2008, as compared to the same period of the prior
year. While average deposits remained fairly consistent, comprising 70% of total funding at December 31, 2008, compared to 69% at
December 31, 2007, there was a customer shift from interest bearing non-time deposits into time deposits during 2008.
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The �Average Volume and Rates� and �Analysis of Interest Increases (Decreases)� tables present the individual components of net interest income
and the net interest margin.

Average Volume and Rates

2008 2007 2006
Average
Volume Interest

Average
Rate

Average
Volume Interest

Average
Rate

Average
Volume Interest

Average
Rate

(In thousands)
ASSETS:
Interest earning assets:
Loans, net of unearned
income(1)(2)(4) $ 15,454,146 $ 930,972 6.02% $ 15,290,766 $ 1,168,231 7.64% $ 15,339,699 $ 1,165,917 7.60%
Loans held for sale(1)(4) 2,598,804 133,149 5.12% 1,613,170 110,858 6.87% 1,374,115 92,921 6.76%
Held to maturity securities and
securities available for sale:
Taxable(4) 3,245,131 189,198 5.83% 2,701,562 150,951 5.59% 2,823,409 141,918 5.03%
Nontaxable(2)(4) 359,021 22,746 6.34% 267,212 16,482 6.17% 45,497 2,967 6.52%
Equity securities(4) 207,385 8,337 4.02% 202,049 11,977 5.93% 145,547 8,498 5.84%

Total securities(4) 3,811,537 220,281 5.78% 3,170,823 179,410 5.66% 3,014,453 153,383 5.09%
Securities purchased under
agreements to resell 2,029,631 105,833 5.21% 1,467,233 99,602 6.79% 592,840 40,176 6.78%
Federal funds sold 80,236 1,879 2.34% 84,371 4,158 4.93% 84,912 4,283 5.04%
Interest bearing deposits in banks
and the Federal Reserve 334,294 2,183 0.65% 10,504 440 4.19% 3,887 151 3.88%

Total interest earning assets(2) 24,308,648 $ 1,394,297 5.74% 21,636,867 $ 1,562,699 7.22% 20,409,906 $ 1,456,831 7.14%

Allowance for loan losses (252,594) (174,419) (175,060)
Cash and due from banks 377,115 336,814 376,815
Premises and equipment, net 517,874 449,744 362,142
Net unrealized loss on available
for sale securities (194,052) (33,880) (81,613)
Other assets(4) 2,005,008 1,630,138 1,345,500

Total assets $ 26,761,999 $ 23,845,264 $ 22,237,690

LIABILITIES AND
SHAREHOLDERS� EQUITY:
Interest bearing liabilities:
Interest bearing non-time deposits $ 5,461,533 $ 94,005 1.72% $ 5,814,153 $ 184,057 3.17% $ 4,886,875 $ 137,986 2.82%
Savings deposits 406,885 1,428 0.35% 552,270 7,758 1.40% 1,223,991 33,574 2.74%
Time deposits 8,146,815 331,652 4.07% 6,741,839 335,493 4.98% 6,154,774 272,669 4.43%
Brokered time deposits 1,573,889 65,429 4.16% 473,795 24,405 5.15% 509,611 23,161 4.54%
Reciprocal brokered time deposits 133,545 4,509 3.38% 71,536 3,120 4.36% 43,783 1,899 4.34%

Total brokered time deposits 1,707,434 69,938 4.10% 545,331 27,525 5.05% 553,394 25,060 4.53%
Total interest bearing deposits 15,722,667 497,023 3.16% 13,653,593 554,833 4.06% 12,819,034 469,289 3.66%
Repurchase agreements 515,089 10,360 2.01% 600,176 24,773 4.13% 867,534 37,327 4.30%
Federal funds purchased 386,965 11,616 3.00% 645,686 33,169 5.14% 1,079,743 55,331 5.12%
Other short-term borrowings 278,578 5,539 1.99% 201,167 9,971 4.96% 39,426 2,133 5.41%
Long-term debt(4) 4,059,823 197,776 4.87% 3,292,036 172,365 5.24% 2,324,505 136,237 5.86%

Total interest bearing liabilities 20,963,122 $ 722,314 3.45% 18,392,658 $ 795,111 4.32% 17,130,242 $ 700,317 4.09%

Noninterest bearing demand
deposits 2,962,445 2,912,527 2,969,285
Other liabilities(4) 278,682 194,725 145,391
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Total liabilities 24,204,249 21,499,910 20,244,918
Minority interest/REIT preferred
securities 293,058 179,058 �
Shareholders� equity 2,264,692 2,166,296 1,992,772

Total liabilities and shareholders�
equity $ 26,761,999 $ 23,845,264 $ 22,237,690

RATE DIFFERENTIAL 2.29% 2.90% 3.05%
NET INTEREST INCOME AND
NET YIELD ON INTEREST
EARNING ASSETS ON A TAX
EQUIVALENT BASIS(3) $ 671,983 2.76% $ 767,588 3.55% $ 756,514 3.71%

Taxable equivalent adjustments(2):
Loans (726) (830) (325)
Held to maturity securities and
securities available for sale (7,744) (5,384) (922)

Total taxable equivalent
adjustments (8,470) (6,214) (1,247)

Net interest income $ 663,513 $ 761,374 $ 755,267

TOTAL AVERAGE
DEPOSITS:
Total interest bearing deposits $ 15,722,667 $ 497,023 3.16% $ 13,653,593 $ 554,833 4.06% $ 12,819,034 $ 469,289 3.66%
Noninterest bearing demand
deposits 2,962,445 � � 2,912,527 � � 2,969,285 � �

Total average deposits $ 18,685,112 $ 497,023 2.66% $ 16,566,120 $ 554,833 3.35% $ 15,788,319 $ 469,289 2.97%

Total average deposits, excluding
brokered time(5) $ 17,111,223 $ 431,594 2.52% $ 16,092,325 $ 530,428 3.30% $ 15,278,708 $ 446,128 2.92%
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(1) Loans and loans held for sale classified as nonaccrual are included in the average volume calculation. Interest income on loans includes loan fees of $33
million, $38 million and $48 million for 2008, 2007 and 2006, respectively.

(2) Interest earned and average rates on securities and loans exempt from income taxes are reflected on a fully tax equivalent basis using a federal income tax rate
of 35%, net of nondeductible interest expense.

(3) Net yield on interest earning assets is net interest income divided by average total interest earning assets.
(4) Unrealized gains (losses) on available for sale securities and the adjustments for mark to market valuations on hedged assets and liabilities have been

classified in either nonearning assets or other liabilities.
(5) Reciprocal brokered time deposits are not excluded.
Analysis of Interest Increases (Decreases)

2008 Change From 2007 2007 Change From 2006
Attributed To(1) Attributed To(1)

Amount Volume Rate Amount Volume Rate
(In thousands)

Interest income:
Loans, net of unearned income $ (237,259) $ 10,451 $ (247,710) $ 2,314 $ (3,822) $ 6,136
Loans held for sale 22,291 50,521 (28,230) 17,937 16,425 1,512
Taxable securities 38,247 31,763 6,484 9,033 (6,778) 15,811
Nontaxable securities 6,264 5,810 454 13,515 13,674 (159)
Equity securities (3,640) 219 (3,859) 3,479 3,348 131

Total securities 40,871 37,792 3,079 26,027 10,244 15,783
Securities purchased under agreements to resell 6,231 29,413 (23,182) 59,426 59,367 59
Federal funds sold (2,279) (94) (2,185) (125) (32) (93)
Interest bearing deposits in banks and the Federal
Reserve 1,743 2,116 (373) 289 278 11

Total interest income (168,402) 130,199 (298,601) 105,868 82,460 23,408

Interest expense:
Interest bearing non-time deposits (90,052) (5,747) (84,305) 46,071 28,967 17,104
Savings deposits (6,330) (531) (5,799) (25,816) (9,415) (16,401)
Time deposits (3,841) 57,510 (61,351) 62,824 28,973 33,851
Brokered time deposits 41,024 45,715 (4,691) 1,244 (1,865) 3,109
Reciprocal brokered time deposits 1,389 2,090 (701) 1,221 1,212 9
Repurchase agreements (14,413) (1,689) (12,724) (12,554) (11,079) (1,475)
Federal funds purchased (21,553) (7,735) (13,818) (22,162) (22,378) 216
Other short-term borrowings (4,432) 1,543 (5,975) 7,838 8,016 (178)
Long-term debt 25,411 37,590 (12,179) 36,128 50,540 (14,412)

Total interest expense (72,797) 128,746 (201,543) 94,794 72,971 21,823

Net interest income $ (95,605) $ 1,453 $ (97,058) $ 11,074 $ 9,489 $ 1,585

(1) Increases (decreases) are attributed to volume changes and rate changes on the following basis: Volume Change = change in volume times old rate. Rate
Change = change in rate times old volume. The Rate/Volume Change = change in volume times change in rate, and is included in Volume Change above.

Interest income decreased $168.4 million from 2007. Average earning assets increased $2.7 billion while the yield earned on those assets
decreased 148 basis points. The drivers of these changes are more fully described in the following paragraphs.

Interest income on loans decreased $237.3 million compared to 2007. The decrease was primarily due to the decrease in the prime lending rate
and an increase in average nonperforming loans which resulted in the average yield earned on loans decreasing 162 basis points.
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Interest income on loans held for sale increased $22.3 million compared to 2007. The average volume of loans held for sale increased $985.6
million, or 61.1%, primarily from an increase in loans held for sale in the Company�s mortgage warehouse division. The increase in volume was
partially offset by a decrease in the yield on loans held for sale, which decreased 175 basis points to 5.12% from 6.87% in the same period of the
prior year. The yield is driven by the prevailing market rates which were significantly lower in 2008 than in 2007. Certain of the loans held for
sale contain floors which prevented the yield on these assets from decreasing further.

Interest income on securities increased $40.9 million compared to 2007. The increase was primarily the result of a $640.7 million, or 20.2%,
increase in average volume, as well as a 12 basis point increase in yield on the average balances.

Interest income from securities purchased under agreements to resell increased $6.2 million from 2007. The average volume of securities
purchased under agreements to resell increased $562.4 million, or 38.3%, primarily from growth in the Company�s mortgage warehouse division.
The yield on securities purchased under agreements to resell decreased 158 basis points to 5.21% from 6.79% in the prior year. The yield is
driven by the prevailing market rates which were significantly lower in 2008 than in 2007. Certain of the securities purchased under agreements
to resell contain floors which prevented the yield on these assets from decreasing further.

Interest expense decreased approximately $72.8 million from 2007. The decrease in interest expense was driven primarily by an 87 basis point
decrease in the cost of average interest bearing liabilities which was partially offset by a $2.6 billion, or 14.0%, increase in average interest
bearing liabilities. The drivers of the decrease in funding costs are described in the following paragraphs.

Interest expense on interest bearing non-time deposits decreased $90.1 million compared to 2007. The decrease in interest expense was due to a
rate reduction of 145 basis points and an average volume decrease of $352.6 million, or 6.1%. During 2008, customer preference shifted away
from interest bearing non-time deposits towards time deposits, thereby reducing the average balances in these accounts.

Interest expense on savings deposits decreased $6.3 million from 2007. The decrease in interest expense was primarily due to an interest rate
decrease of 105 basis points and an average volume decrease of $145.4 million, or 26.3%. During 2008, customer preference shifted away from
savings deposits towards time deposits, thereby reducing the average balances in these accounts.

Interest expense on time deposits decreased $3.8 million compared to 2007. The decrease in interest expense was due to an interest rate decrease
of 91 basis points which was partially offset by an average volume increase of $1.4 billion, or 20.8%. The growth of time deposits is attributable
to customer preference for higher rate products and increased competition for deposits as a funding source.

Interest expense on brokered time deposits increased $42.4 million compared to 2007. The increase in interest expense was due to an increase in
average volume of $1.2 billion, or 213.1%, which was partially offset by an interest rate decrease of 95 basis points. The volume increase was
due to the Company�s increased use of brokered time deposits as a funding source.

Interest expense on short-term borrowings decreased $40.4 million from 2007. The decrease in interest expense was primarily due to an interest
rate decrease of 236 basis points and an average volume decrease of $266.4 million, or 18.4%. As the Company has continued to deleverage its
balance sheet, it has reduced the need for short-term borrowings.

Interest expense on long-term debt increased $25.4 million compared to 2007. The increase in interest expense was primarily caused by an
increase in average long-term debt of $767.8 million, or 23.3%, partially offset by an interest rate decrease of 37 basis points. Colonial issued
$250 million in subordinated debt during the
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first quarter of 2008 causing average long term debt to increase $205.6 million over 2007. Average Federal Home Loan Bank of Atlanta (FHLB)
borrowings increased $628.2 million over 2007 as the Company increased its use of FHLB borrowings as a funding source.

Loan Loss Provision

The provision for loan losses for the year ended December 31, 2008 was $728.9 million compared to $106.5 million for 2007. The provision for
loan losses exceeded net charge-offs by $86.2 million and $52.4 million for the years ended December 31, 2008 and 2007, respectively. Net
charge-offs were $642.8 million and $54.1 million for the years ended December 31, 2008 and 2007, respectively. During 2008, approximately
$427 million of troubled assets were sold at a 58% discount, which was a significant driver of the increase in net charge-offs for the year.

At December 31, 2008, BancGroup�s allowance for loan losses was $325.0 million, up $86.2 million over December 31, 2007. The allowance for
loan losses represented 2.24% of period end net loans at December 31, 2008 compared to 1.50% at December 31, 2007. For more information,
refer to the Allowance for Loan Losses discussion presented in the Risk Management section of Management�s Discussion and Analysis.

Noninterest Income

The following charts detail the Company�s core noninterest income by category for the years ended December 31, 2008 and 2007:
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The following table shows the dollar and percentage change in noninterest income by category for 2008 as compared to 2007, and 2007 as
compared to 2006. Core noninterest income decreased $8.6 million, or 4%, in 2008 as compared to 2007.

Increase (Decrease)
Year Ended December 31, 2008

Compared
to 2007 %

2007
Compared
to 2006 %2008 2007 2006

(In thousands)
Service charges on deposit accounts $ 76,058 $ 75,466 $ 65,071 $ 592 0.8% $ 10,395 16.0%
Electronic banking 20,363 18,815 17,212 1,548 8.2 1,603 9.3
Other retail banking fees 9,417 12,275 14,436 (2,858) (23.3) (2,161) (15.0)

Retail banking fees 105,838 106,556 96,719 (718) (0.7) 9,837 10.2
Mortgage banking origination and sales 29,951 14,923 13,540 15,028 100.7 1,383 10.2
Wealth management services 17,930 16,734 14,054 1,196 7.2 2,680 19.1
Mortgage warehouse fees 5,235 22,240 25,323 (17,005) (76.5) (3,083) (12.2)
Bank-owned life insurance 19,395 20,230 15,954 (835) (4.1) 4,276 26.8
Other income 22,504 28,750 16,031 (6,246) (21.7) 12,719 79.3

Core noninterest income 200,853 209,433 181,621 (8,580) (4.1) 27,812 15.3
Securities and derivatives gains (losses), net 3,043 4,047 4,772 (1,004) (24.8) (725) (15.2)
Securities restructuring charges � (36,006) � 36,006 100.0 (36,006) (100.0)
Gain on sale of mortgages and businesses � 8,750 2,829 (8,750) (100.0) 5,921 209.3

Total noninterest income $ 203,896 $ 186,224 $ 189,222 $ 17,672 9.5% $ (2,998) (1.6)%

Service charges on deposit accounts increased 1% over 2007. Service charges on deposit accounts are comprised of nonsufficient funds fees and
service charges on consumer and commercial deposit accounts. Noninterest income from service charges on deposit accounts increased, as
compared to the prior year, primarily due to an increase in the number of customer accounts as well as customers maintaining lower balances in
those accounts.

Electronic banking includes fees from Colonial�s ATM network, business and personal check card services and internet banking. Noninterest
income from electronic banking services increased 8% from 2007 to 2008 primarily due to an increase in the number of Colonial customer
accounts as well as the Company�s focused efforts to increase customer check card usage and ATM network fees.

Other retailing banking fees decreased from 2007 to 2008 by $2.9 million. Official check commissions represent $2.4 million of the decrease
from prior year primarily due to a decrease in rate. The remainder of the decline from 2007 to 2008 is the result of a decline in merchant services
revenue due to the Company�s sale of its merchant services contracts in April 2007 and the subsequent agent bank agreement with a third party
service provider of merchant services. The outsourced relationship lowers Colonial�s inherent risk of providing merchant services while enabling
the Company to continue to offer those services to its customer base. The referral fees for new contracts are less than the previous fee income,
but the Company�s expenses and risks are also reduced. As part of the sale, Colonial recognized a $4.9 million gain in 2007 as noted separately in
the table above.

Mortgage banking origination and sales revenue is derived from mortgage loans originated and subsequently sold in the secondary market. The
Company does not retain any servicing rights related to these loans. Mortgage banking origination and sales income increased 100.7% from
2007 to 2008, with a 39% increase in sales volume,
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primarily due to a team of mortgage originators hired in late 2007. In addition, profit margins improved due to a shift to higher margin FHA and
VA products from other products and enhanced controls over pricing and delivery.

Wealth management services include discount brokerage, investment sales, asset management, trust services and insurance sales including term,
universal, whole life and long-term care. Wealth management services increased $1.2 million from 2007 to 2008 primarily due to increased
volumes in fixed annuity products sold, partially offset by a decline in the volume of variable annuities and securities sold and in trust revenues.
The increased volumes of fixed annuities were driven by customer demand and uncertainty in the financial markets.

Mortgage warehouse fees are comprised of three revenue streams: custodial fees associated with mortgage document services for mortgage
warehouse customers, syndication fees paid to the Company as agent or participant in mortgage warehouse syndicated loans and servicing and
other fees associated with interests in mortgage warehouse assets sold to third-party commercial paper conduits (conduits). The decrease of
$17.0 million in mortgage warehouse fees from 2007 to 2008 was primarily related to lower servicing and other fees associated with interests
sold because Colonial discontinued the sales of assets to the conduits in early January 2008.

Income from bank-owned life insurance (BOLI) decreased from 2007 to 2008 primarily due to lower crediting rates.

Other income reflects revenues from joint ventures, letter of credit fees, condo association coupon fees, gains on the sales of bank premises and
other assets and several other small items. The decrease from 2007 to 2008 was primarily the result of a $10.0 million decline in revenue from
joint ventures as well as a $2.7 million decrease in gains related to the sale of bank premises, partially offset by a $2.1 million gain on the sale of
Visa, Inc. stock from the initial public offering, a $1.5 million increase in equity investment income and a $526,000 increase in the fair value of
retail mortgage forward sale commitments.

The Company�s decision to buy and sell securities is based on its management of interest rate risk and projected liquidity and funding needs.
During 2008, the Company recorded gains of $6.1 million in the first quarter from the sale of approximately $217 million in securities, a $3.0
million gain in the second quarter from the early termination of a $250 million resell agreement, and a loss of $4.9 million on the sale of
Wachovia stock, $658,000 on a derivative swap transaction and a $489,000 write-down of securities in the third quarter. In the first quarter of
2007, the Company recorded gains of $981,000 on the sale of $163 million in securities and recognized an impairment loss of $36.0 million as
the Company declared its intent to restructure its securities portfolio by selling approximately $1.2 billion in available for sale securities. The
securities were sold in April 2007. In the second quarter of 2007, the Company recorded gains of $1.1 million from the sale of additional
available for sale debt securities and equity securities.

The Company sold approximately $490 million of residential real estate loans in March 2007 and recognized a $3.9 million gain.
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Noninterest Expense

The following charts detail the Company�s core noninterest expense by category for the years ended December 31, 2008 and 2007:

(1) Other consists of other expenses and any category of core noninterest expense that falls below 5% of total core noninterest expense.
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The following table shows the dollar and percentage changes in noninterest expense by category for 2008 as compared to 2007, and 2007 as
compared to 2006. Core noninterest expense increased $117.0 million, or 21.6%, in 2008 as compared to 2007. Core noninterest expense to
average assets was 2.46% and 2.27% for 2008 and 2007, respectively.

Increase (Decrease)
Year Ended December 31, 2008

Compared
to 2007 %

2007
Compared
to 2006 %2008 2007 2006

(In thousands)
Salaries and employee benefits $ 295,881 $ 279,055 $ 279,612 $ 16,826 6.0% $ (557) (0.2)%
Occupancy expense of bank premises, net 95,485 78,709 67,338 16,776 21.3 11,371 16.9
Furniture and equipment expenses 59,865 53,262 48,585 6,603 12.4 4,677 9.6
Professional services 29,112 18,787 18,465 10,325 55.0 322 1.7
FDIC insurance and other regulatory fees 18,081 6,301 4,822 11,780 187.0 1,479 30.7
Amortization of intangible assets 16,613 13,358 12,209 3,255 24.4 1,149 9.4
Electronic banking and other retail banking
expenses 16,043 19,660 13,521 (3,617) (18.4) 6,139 45.4
Losses and expenses on other real estate 28,366 1,171 854 27,195 2322.4 317 37.1
Loss on equity investments 16,925 3,019 1,514 13,906 460.6 1,505 99.4
Advertising 12,092 10,065 10,782 2,027 20.1 (717) (6.6)
Communications 11,371 11,099 10,845 272 2.5 254 2.3
Postage and courier 9,896 10,656 10,476 (760) (7.1) 180 1.7
Loan closing costs 6,628 5,549 5,067 1,079 19.4 482 9.5
Travel 6,525 6,945 8,200 (420) (6.1) (1,255) (15.3)
Other expenses 36,266 24,503 26,898 11,763 48.0 (2,395) (8.9)

Core noninterest expense 659,149 542,139 519,188 117,010 21.6 22,951 4.4
Goodwill impairment 575,000 � � 575,000 100.0 � �
Severance expense 786 6,616 413 (5,830) (88.1) 6,203 1501.9
Merger related expenses � 4,015 � (4,015) (100.0) 4,015 100.0
Net loss related to the early extinguishment of debt 10,327 6,908 � 3,419 49.5 6,908 100.0

Total noninterest expense $ 1,245,262 $ 559,678 $ 519,601 $ 685,584 122.5% $ 40,077 7.7%

Salaries and employee benefits increased 6% from 2007 to 2008. The change was primarily due to a decrease in deferred salary costs and
increases in commissions and separation payments along with an additional working day in 2008. Stock-based compensation expense decreased
from 2007 due to certain performance criteria not being met, resulting in the reversal of previously expensed performance-based restricted stock.
The Company�s average number of full-time equivalent employees increased from 4,588 in 2007 to 4,671 in 2008. The increase in employees
was primarily due to the Company�s two acquisitions in 2007, but was partially offset by reductions in workforce in 2007 and 2008.

The increases in occupancy and furniture and equipment expenses were primarily due to the 2007 acquisitions of Commercial Bankshares, Inc.
and Citrus and Chemical Bancorporation, Inc. Additional increases resulted from higher information technology costs, charges related to
abandoned leases and increased lease expense resulting from the sale-leaseback of 56 properties in 2007. The increased occupancy expense from
the sale-leasebacks is more than offset by the amortization of deferred gains on the sales, which are included in noninterest income.
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Professional services increased from 2007 to 2008 primarily due to increases in legal fees associated with credit related matters, accounting fees,
consulting fees related to the Colonial 1st Project and technology related services.

FDIC insurance and other regulatory fees increased from 2007 to 2008 due to increases in deposits on which the FDIC assessment is based, as
well as the depletion of Colonial Bank�s available FDIC assessment credits in late 2007.

Amortization of intangible assets increased from 2007 to 2008 due to additional core deposit intangible assets that were recorded for the
Commercial Bankshares, Inc. and Citrus & Chemical Bancorporation, Inc. acquisitions in 2007.

Electronic banking and other retail banking expenses decreased from 2007 to 2008 due to the discontinuance of consulting services related to
revenue enhancement initiatives, as well as management�s focused efforts to reduce fraud and operating losses.

The increases in losses and expenses on other real estate were driven by higher charges resulting from real estate value declines arising from the
current U.S. recession. The losses and expenses on other real estate for 2008 included $4.8 million of write downs on properties sold, $11.7
million of additional write downs on other real estate and $11.9 million in other real estate expenses.

Loss on equity investments increased from 2007 to 2008 due to the recognition of $10.4 million of impairment charges during 2008 along with
operating losses related to real estate joint ventures and low income housing tax credit investments, as well as the establishment of a $1.5 million
reserve for losses.

Advertising expense increased from 2007 to 2008 primarily due to increased newspaper and radio advertisements to attract and retain deposits.

Loan closing costs increased from 2007 to 2008 primarily due to the increased frequency of appraisals driven by rapid declines in real estate
values in late 2007 and throughout 2008.

Other expenses increased from 2007 to 2008 primarily due to an $8.6 million increase in subservicing fees associated with the increased
balances of mortgage warehouse assets, an increase in the off-balance sheet credit reserve of $2.0 million and a charge of $1.1 million related to
a litigation settlement.

Colonial recorded a noncash charge of $575.0 million in the fourth quarter of 2008 for goodwill impairment. Goodwill recorded on past
acquisitions in Florida and Nevada became impaired in the fourth quarter primarily due to declining bank market valuations and increased credit
costs. Refer to the Goodwill section of Management�s Discussion and Analysis for additional information.

Severance expense relates primarily to the reduction in force efforts in 2007. This expense decreased significantly for 2008.

Merger related expenses in 2007 related to the acquisitions of Commercial Bankshares, Inc. and Citrus & Chemical Bancorporation, Inc.

During 2008, the Company incurred a $10.3 million net loss related to the early extinguishment of debt. A $9.7 million loss was incurred on the
early termination of $205 million in FHLB advances, which bore interest averaging 4.68%, and a $597,000 loss was incurred on the call of $90.5
million in brokered time deposits, which bore interest at 4.90%. During 2007, the Company redeemed $185 million of trust preferred securities,
which bore interest averaging 8.58%, and incurred a $6.9 million net loss related to the early extinguishment of debt.
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Minority Interest Expense/REIT Preferred Dividends

During May 2007, the Company issued $300 million in fixed-to-floating rate perpetual non-cumulative preferred stock through its indirect
subsidiary CBG Florida REIT Corp. These securities pay dividends at a rate of 7.114% until May 15, 2012 and 3-month LIBOR plus 2.02% for
each dividend period thereafter. The dividends are reflected, before tax, as minority interest expense on the Company�s consolidated statements
of income. CBG Florida REIT Corp. may redeem the preferred stock, in whole or in part, on May 15, 2012 and each fifth succeeding year
thereafter. Refer to Note 20, Minority Interest/REIT Preferred Securities, for additional information.

Provision for Income Taxes

The effective income tax rate was 22.0% in 2008 and 32.6% in 2007. During 2008, the loss recognized created an income tax benefit of $247.7
million. The provision for income taxes in 2007 was $87.6 million. The decrease in the effective tax rate from 2007 was primarily the result of
substantial losses recognized during 2008, which was partially offset by the impairment of goodwill, much of which was a non-taxable charge.
For further information concerning the provision for income taxes, refer to Note 25, Income Taxes.

REVIEW OF STATEMENT OF CONDITION

Financial Condition

Changes in selected components of the Company�s balance sheet from December 31, 2007 to December 31, 2008 are as follows:

December 31,
2008

December 31,
2007

Increase (Decrease)
$ %

(Dollars in thousands)
Interest bearing deposits in banks and the Federal Reserve $ 1,534,463 $ 28,993 $ 1,505,470 5,192.5%
Securities purchased under agreements to resell 1,556,157 2,049,664 (493,507) (24.1)
Securities 3,503,380 3,682,510 (179,130) (4.9)
Loans held for sale 2,082,248 1,544,222 538,026 34.8
Loans, net of unearned income 14,530,018 15,923,178 (1,393,160) (8.7)
Goodwill 432,053 1,008,168 (576,115) (57.1)
Other real estate owned 127,850 15,760 112,090 711.2
Total assets 25,816,306 25,975,989 (159,683) (0.6)
Non-time deposits 7,989,907 9,771,573 (1,781,666) (18.2)
Total deposits 18,673,265 18,544,267 128,998 0.7
Short-term borrowings 1,172,706 568,721 603,985 106.2
Long-term debt 4,043,807 4,023,836 19,971 0.5
Minority interest/REIT preferred securities 293,058 293,058 0 0.0
Shareholders� equity 1,344,978 2,273,571 (928,593) (40.8)
Interest Bearing Deposits in Banks and the Federal Reserve

In response to significant uncertainty in the marketplace and to increase liquid assets, Colonial increased the level of cash balances maintained at
the Federal Reserve and the FHLB, thereby increasing interest bearing deposits in banks and the Federal Reserve to $1.5 billion as of
December 31, 2008 as compared to $29 million at December 31, 2007. The balance held at the Federal Reserve at December 31, 2008 was $1.1
billion while the balance held at the FHLB was $388.5 million.
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Securities Purchased Under Agreements to Resell

Colonial�s securities purchased under agreements to resell at December 31, 2008 represent mortgage backed securities which have been
securitized by customers of the Company�s mortgage warehouse lending division and are under agreements to be sold to third-party investors.
Colonial purchases these securities prior to their initial settlements with those investors. Refer to the Mortgage Warehouse Assets section of
Management�s Discussion and Analysis for additional information. At December 31, 2007, Colonial had an additional $500 million invested in
traditional resell agreements that were terminated during 2008.

Securities

BancGroup determines the funds available for investment based upon anticipated loan and deposit growth, liquidity needs and pledging
requirements, as well as other factors. An investment strategy is developed based on these factors, along with BancGroup�s balance sheet position
and relative value opportunities in the market.

All securities are either classified as held to maturity or available for sale. Held to maturity securities are those securities which management has
the ability and intent to hold until maturity. The carrying value of held to maturity securities was $200.4 million at the end of 2008 compared to
$1.2 million at the end of 2007. The current year increase was the result of purchases during 2008. Securities classified as held to maturity
consisted primarily of agency mortgage-backed securities and included U.S. Treasury bonds and municipal obligations. The following chart
details the Company�s held to maturity securities at December 31, 2008 by category:

Held To Maturity Securities
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Securities available for sale represent those securities that the Company intends to hold for an indefinite period of time and may be sold in
response to changes in BancGroup�s interest rate risk position, prepayment risk or other similar factors. These securities are recorded at fair value
with unrealized gains or losses, net of any tax effect, added to or deducted from shareholders� equity. At December 31, 2008, the net unrealized
pretax loss on securities available for sale was $476.9 million, compared to $5.8 million at December 31, 2007. The unrealized loss, net of
income taxes, is reflected in the Company�s shareholders� equity in the amount of $310.0 million and $3.7 million at December 31, 2008 and
2007, respectively. At December 31, 2008, securities available for sale totaled $3.3 billion, or 94.3% of the total securities portfolio, compared
to $3.7 billion, or 99.97%, at December 31, 2007. The following chart details the Company�s securities available for sale at December 31, 2008
by category:

The composition of the Company�s securities portfolio is reflected in the following tables.

Securities by Category

Carrying Value at December 31,
2008 2007 2006

(In thousands)
Securities available for sale:
U.S. Treasury securities and obligations of U.S. government sponsored entities (GSE�s) $ 25,222 $ � $ 166,481
Agency mortgage-backed securities 1,533,391 1,359,503 1,012,855
Non-agency mortgage-backed securities 1,203,263 1,701,047 1,670,973
Obligations of state and political subdivisions 345,695 371,930 78,603
Corporate notes � 6,819 �
Federal Reserve and FHLB stock and other 195,388 241,983 154,702

Total securities available for sale 3,302,959 3,681,282 3,083,614

Held to maturity securities:
U.S. Treasury securities 500 500 500
Agency mortgage-backed securities 199,687 495 747
Obligations of state and political subdivisions 234 233 627

Total held to maturity securities 200,421 1,228 1,874

Total securities $ 3,503,380 $ 3,682,510 $ 3,085,488

Securities to total assets 13.6% 14.2% 13.5%

Average securities to average earning assets 15.7% 14.7% 14.8%

Average duration (excluding equities) 5.71
years 4.97 years 4.45 years
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Securities by Credit Rating at December 31, 2008

Government /
GSE Obligations

Lower of Standard & Poor�s or Moody�s
Designation Unrated/

Other TotalAAA A-to AA+ BBB-to BBB+
(In thousands)

U.S. Treasury securities and obligations of U.S. GSE�s $ 25,722 $ � $ � $ � $ � $ 25,722
Agency mortgage-backed securities 1,733,078 � � � � 1,733,078
Non-agency mortgage-backed securities � 653,576 264,589 148,509 136,589 1,203,263
Obligations of state and political subdivisions � 24,060 305,442 14,082 2,345 345,929
FHLB stock and other � 19,511 � � 175,877 195,388

Total securities $ 1,758,800 $ 697,147 $ 570,031 $ 162,591 $ 314,811 $ 3,503,380

As of December 31, 2008, the ratings for approximately $136.6 million of securities in Colonial�s portfolio were reduced to below investment
grade by the rating agencies due to deteriorating U.S. economic conditions. Colonial still expects to collect all contractual principal and interest
amounts on these securities.

Securities by Credit Rating at December 31, 2007

Government /
GSE Obligations

Lower of Standard & Poor�s or Moody�s
Designation Unrated/

Other TotalAAA A-to AA+ BBB-to BBB+
(In thousands)

U.S. Treasury securities $ 500 $ � $ � $ � $ � $ 500
Agency mortgage-backed securities 1,359,998 � � � � 1,359,998
Non-agency mortgage-backed securities � 1,701,047 � � � 1,701,047
Obligations of state and political subdivisions � 367,136 2,321 � 2,706 372,163
Federal Reserve and FHLB stock and other � � 4,965 1,856 241,981 248,802

Total securities $ 1,360,498 $ 2,068,183 $ 7,286 $ 1,856 $ 244,687 $ 3,682,510

Securities by Credit Rating at December 31, 2006

Government /
GSE Obligations

Lower of Standard & Poor�s or Moody�s
Designation Unrated/

Other TotalAAA A-to AA+ BBB-to BBB+
(In thousands)

U.S. Treasury securities $ 166,981 $ � $ � $      � $ � $ 166,981
Agency mortgage-backed securities 1,013,602 � � � � 1,013,602
Non-agency mortgage-backed securities � 1,670,973 � � � 1,670,973
Obligations of state and political subdivisions � 72,965 2,258 � 4,007 79,230
Federal Reserve and FHLB stock and other � � � � 154,702 154,702

Total securities $ 1,180,583 $ 1,743,938 $ 2,258 $ � $ 158,709 $ 3,085,488
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The maturities of the Company�s debt securities portfolio at December 31, 2008 are as follows:

Contractual Maturity Distribution of Debt Securities(1)

Within 1 Year 1-5 Years 5-10 Years Over 10 Years

Amount
Average
Rate Amount

Average
Rate Amount

Average
Rate Amount

Average
Rate

(In thousands)
Securities available for sale:
U.S Treasury securities and
obligations of GSE�s $ � �% $ � �% $ 25,222 3.00% $ � �%
Agency mortgage-backed securities 36 5.50% 1,313 6.14% 45,849 5.68% 1,486,192 5.55%
Non-agency mortgage-backed
securities � �% � �% � �% 1,203,263 6.06%
Obligations of state and political
subdivisions(2) 1,802 6.99% 9,124 6.40% 60,556 6.31% 274,363 6.33%
Federal Reserve and FHLB stock and
other � �% � �% � �% � �%

Total securities available for sale 1,838 6.96% 10,437 6.37% 131,627 5.46% 2,963,818 5.83%

Held to maturity securities:
U.S. Treasury securities � �% � �% 500 7.25% � �%
Agency mortgage-backed securities 5 10.01% 55 7.01% 92 8.53% 199,535 5.89%
Obligations of state and political
subdivisions(2) � �% 234 7.76% � �% � �%

Total held to maturity securities 5 10.01% 289 7.62% 592 7.45% 199,535 5.89%

Total debt securities $ 1,843 6.97% $ 10,726 6.40% $ 132,219 5.47% $ 3,163,353 5.83%

(1) These are contractual maturities; expected and actual maturities could differ from contractual maturities because underlying borrowers may have the right to
call or prepay obligations without call or prepayment penalties.

(2) The weighted average yields are calculated on the basis of the cost and effective yield weighted for the scheduled maturity of each security. The yield is
reflected on a fully tax equivalent basis using a federal income tax rate of 35%, net of nondeductible interest expense.

Mortgage Warehouse Assets

The mortgage warehouse lending division provides short-term, secured funding to mortgage companies. Colonial�s fundings to the mortgage
companies are reflected in loans, loans held for sale and securities purchased under agreements to resell. The mortgage warehouse assets are
secured by mortgage loans that are sold to investors such as Fannie Mae, Freddie Mac, Ginnie Mae and money center financial institutions who
have committed to purchase the mortgage loans collateralizing the mortgage warehouse assets. The mortgage loans are generally delivered to
investors within one month. Colonial controls the collateral files (which include the underlying mortgage legal documents) for the majority of
the outstanding mortgage warehouse assets. In the event of a default by a mortgage company, Colonial could assume ownership of the
underlying individual
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mortgage loan and the related forward sales commitment pursuant to which Colonial could deliver the loan to the permanent investor. During
2008, Colonial�s mortgage warehouse lending division provided approximately $70 billion of interim funding to the industry representing nearly
400,000 residential mortgage loans.

Mortgage warehouse loans represent collateralized draws on lines of credit to mortgage origination companies. The loans are used to originate
mortgage loans to their customers. Investors have committed to purchase the mortgage loans securing the mortgage warehouse loans. Short-term
participations in loans held for sale are another source of funding provided to these companies whereby Colonial purchases participations in
certain mortgage loans which have commitments to be sold to third-party investor institutions. Securities purchased under agreements to resell
represent mortgage backed securities which have been securitized by these companies and are under agreements to be sold to third-party
investors. Colonial purchases these securities prior to their initial settlements with those investors.

Colonial had a facility in which it sold certain mortgage warehouse loans and short-term participations in loans held for sale to a wholly-owned
special purpose entity which then sold interests in those assets to third-party commercial paper conduits (conduits). The Company reduced the
interests in mortgage warehouse assets that were sold by $500 million in each of April and November 2007, for a total 2007 reduction of $1.0
billion. At December 31, 2007, the total outstanding balances of interests sold to the conduits was $1.0 billion. In January 2008, the balance
outstanding to the conduits was reduced to $0 and the facility was terminated by its terms. Refer to Note 9, Sales and Servicing of Financial
Assets, for additional information.

A summary of the major components of mortgage warehouse assets is shown in the table below:

December 31,
2008 2007

(In thousands)
Securities purchased under agreements to resell $ 1,556,157 $ 1,549,664
Loans held for sale 1,975,654 1,484,502
Mortgage warehouse loans 731,176 290,603

Total mortgage warehouse assets on balance sheet 4,262,987 3,324,769
Interests sold:
Loans held for sale � 769,221
Mortgage warehouse loans � 230,779

Total mortgage warehouse assets under management $ 4,262,987 $ 4,324,769

Loans Held for Sale

Loans held for sale is comprised of three elements: short-term participations in mortgage loans, retail mortgages and other loans held for sale.
Total loans held for sale at December 31, 2008 increased $538 million, or 34.8%, from December 31, 2007, primarily due to an increase in
participations purchased by the mortgage warehouse division driven by customer demand and the elimination of the sales of participations to the
third party commercial paper conduits, as well as an increase in other loans held for sale. Loans held for sale fluctuate as demand for residential
mortgages changes and customer demands change. A summary of the elements that make up loans held for sale is shown in the table below:

December 31,
2008

December 31,
2007

(In thousands)
Short-term participations in mortgage loans held for sale (includes $1,950,445 measured at fair value at
December 31, 2008) $ 1,975,654 $ 1,484,502
Retail mortgage loans held for sale 57,396 59,720
Other loans held for sale 49,198 �

Total loans held for sale $ 2,082,248 $ 1,544,222
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BancGroup elected the fair value option for its short-term participations in mortgage loans held for sale acquired on or after August 1, 2008. The
fair value of loans held for sale is based on what secondary markets are currently offering for portfolios with similar characteristics. For a
detailed discussion of the determination of fair value for individual financial instruments, see Note 5, Fair Value Measurements.

Loans

During 2008, Colonial and many other financial institutions became focused on capital preservation. As credit quality in the industry
deteriorated and the current U.S. recession severely impacted property values, Colonial�s focus shifted from balance sheet growth to balance
sheet contraction, or deleveraging. Colonial focused on reducing exposures in specific markets and to specific borrowers. The result of these
factors is a $1.8 billion, or 11.7%, decrease in Colonial�s outstanding loan portfolio, excluding mortgage warehouse lending, from December 31,
2007 to December 31, 2008. The impact has been most noticeable in the residential construction market. As the current U.S. recession�s impact
on real estate values has negatively impacted developers and other borrowers, Colonial has been, and continues to be, more selective in
approving new loans or expansions of existing loan relationships. Loans in the mortgage warehouse division increased $440.6 million from
December 31, 2007. Mortgage warehouse loans increased because Colonial stopped selling interests in mortgage warehouse loans to third-party
commercial paper conduits and terminated the off balance sheet facility in January 2008.

Gross Loan Portfolio
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December 31,
2008 2007 2006 2005 2004

(In thousands)
Commercial, financial and agricultural $ 1,713,267 $ 1,506,986 $ 1,440,448 $ 1,591,195 $ 2,123,664
Commercial real estate 4,935,944 5,012,773 4,291,979 4,424,465 4,270,817
Real estate construction 4,922,190 6,296,262 6,340,324 5,483,424 3,936,800
Residential real estate 2,572,077 2,673,823 2,987,212 3,048,007 2,228,648
Consumer and other 402,070 452,642 438,375 372,470 315,386

Total loans 14,545,548 15,942,486 15,498,338 14,919,561 12,875,315
Less: unearned income (15,530) (19,308) (19,449) (19,697) (17,504)

Total loans, net of unearned income $ 14,530,018 $ 15,923,178 $ 15,478,889 $ 14,899,864 $ 12,857,811

Loans classified as commercial, financial and agricultural represented 11.8% of total loans at December 31, 2008, and consisted of secured and
unsecured credit lines and amortizing loans for various industrial, agricultural, commercial, financial, retail or service businesses, as well as
mortgage warehouse lines of credit.

Commercial real estate loans represented 33.9% of total loans at December 31, 2008. These loans are collateralized by seasoned real estate held
for investment and business purposes.

Real estate construction loans were 33.8% of total loans at December 31, 2008. Loans of this type are made to individuals, companies or
developers for use in the purchase or construction of properties such as single and multi-family residential and non-residential real estate. These
loans are repaid by the cashflows generated through the operation, sale or refinancing of the underlying commercial property.

Residential real estate loans represented 17.7% of total loans at December 31, 2008. The majority of Colonial�s residential real estate loans are
adjustable and fixed rate first mortgages on single-family, owner-occupied properties.

Consumer and other loans represented 2.8% of total loans at December 31, 2008. Loans in this category may be unsecured or secured and
include loans for investment purposes, vehicle purchases, purchases of personal property, personal expense loans and overdrafts of deposit
accounts. These loans are made to individuals and businesses such as financial institutions, municipalities and not-for-profit organizations.
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The contractual maturities of loans may vary significantly from actual maturities due to loan extensions, early payoffs due to refinancing and
other factors. Fluctuations in interest rates and availability of credit from other sources are major factors in early loan payoffs. The uncertainties
of future events, particularly with respect to interest rates, make it difficult to predict the actual maturities. The following table represents the
contractual maturities of loans at December 31, 2008:

Loan Maturity/Rate Sensitivity

Maturing Rate Sensitivity
Rate Sensitivity, Loans
Maturing Over 1 Year

Within 1
Year 1-5 Years

Over 5
Years Fixed

Floating/
Adjustable Fixed

Floating/
Adjustable

(Dollars in thousands)
Commercial, financial and agricultural $ 1,255,467 $ 284,490 $ 173,310 $ 366,042 $ 1,347,225 $ 225,141 $ 232,659
Commercial real estate 1,241,636 2,446,233 1,248,075 2,978,002 1,957,942 2,365,264 1,329,044
Real estate construction 3,141,352 1,568,945 211,893 1,087,143 3,835,047 505,663 1,275,175
Residential real estate 1,059,969 909,912 602,196 654,337 1,917,740 269,591 1,242,517
Consumer and other loans 99,231 130,144 172,695 292,356 109,714 227,459 75,380

Totals $ 6,797,655 $ 5,339,724 $ 2,408,169 $ 5,377,880 $ 9,167,668 $ 3,593,118 $ 4,154,775

For additional discussion of loans, refer to the Risk Management section of Management�s Discussion and Analysis.

Goodwill

The Company�s annual goodwill impairment test was performed as of September 30, 2008. As a result of the annual impairment test, even
though four reporting units were required to perform a second step analysis, management determined that no goodwill impairment charge was
required at that time, as the implied fair value of goodwill for each tested reporting unit exceeded its carrying value. Due to the decline in market
valuations for financial institutions, including Colonial, and increased credit costs during the fourth quarter of 2008, an interim impairment test
was performed as of December 31, 2008. As a result of the interim impairment test, the Company computed and recorded a $575.0 million
goodwill impairment loss in the fourth quarter of 2008, reducing the balance of goodwill to the implied fair value from the second step of the
impairment test. The impairment impacted two of the Company�s six reportable segments, representing four of the Company�s seven reporting
units. Refer to Note 14, Goodwill and Other Intangible Assets, as well as the Purchase Accounting and Goodwill section of Critical Accounting
Polices in Management�s Discussion and Analysis for additional information.

Due to the ongoing uncertainty in market conditions, which may continue to negatively impact the performance of BancGroup�s reporting units
as well as the market valuations of financial institutions, including Colonial, management will continue to monitor and evaluate the carrying
value of goodwill. Additional goodwill impairment could be recorded in future periods and such impairment could be material to the Company�s
results of operations.

Other Real Estate Owned

Total other real estate owned increased $112.1 million from December 31, 2007 to December 31, 2008. The increase was driven by deteriorating
credit quality in the Company�s loan portfolio. A substantial portion of the outstanding balance relates to properties in waterfront locations in
Florida and coastal Alabama.
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Deposits

BancGroup�s period end deposits consisted of the following:

December 31, % of Total
2008 2007 2008 2007

(In thousands)
Noninterest bearing demand deposits $ 2,816,699 $ 2,988,457 15.1% 16.1%
Interest bearing demand deposits 4,826,328 6,307,491 25.8 34.0
Savings deposits 346,880 475,625 1.9 2.6

Non-time deposits 7,989,907 9,771,573 42.8 52.7
Certificates of deposit less than $100,000 4,527,459 3,566,220 24.3 19.2
Certificates of deposit $100,000 or more 3,911,446 3,143,193 20.9 16.9
Other time deposits 678,483 538,740 3.6 2.9

Retail deposits 17,107,295 17,019,726 91.6 91.7
Brokered time deposits 1,297,651 1,455,586 7.0 7.9
Reciprocal brokered time deposits 268,319 68,955 1.4 0.4

Total brokered time deposits 1,565,970 1,524,541 8.4 8.3

Total deposits $ 18,673,265 $ 18,544,267 100.0% 100.0%

BancGroup continues to focus on growing deposits throughout its market areas. Total deposits increased 0.7% from December 31, 2007. The
increase was driven by retail time deposits which increased $1.9 billion, or 25.8%, during 2008. This increase was substantially offset by a
decrease in non-time deposit accounts of $1.8 billion, or 18.2%. Total brokered time deposits increased $41.4 million, or 2.7%, driven primarily
by an increase of $199.3 million in reciprocal brokered time deposits which was partially offset by a reduction of $157.9 million in brokered
time deposits from 2007 to 2008. In 2008, due to the current U.S. recession and its impact on the banking industry, reciprocal brokered time
deposits became more attractive to customers looking to maximize FDIC insurance coverage. As market demographics change, products and
services are restructured to meet the needs of a particular region or customer base. Refer to the Liquidity and Funding section of Management�s
Discussion and Analysis for further information.

The following chart details BancGroup�s deposit base by state at December 31, 2008:

Total Deposit Base
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At December 31, 2008, the scheduled maturities of time deposits in amounts of $100,000 or more were as follows:

Months to Maturity (In thousands)
3 or less $ 1,187,997
Over 3 through 6 799,447
Over 6 through 12 1,641,419
Over 12 512,445

Total $ 4,141,308

Time deposit maturities of $9.4 billion in 2009 are expected to be renewed or substantially replaced by new originations. Over the past 12
months, 57.5% of total matured time deposits were renewed while new originations exceeded the level of maturing time deposits that did not
renew. During January and February of 2009, $2.1 billion of time deposits matured and 49.7% of those deposits were renewed while Colonial
increased total time deposits with $1.0 billion of new originations. If the level of time deposit renewals and originations is less than the level of
maturities, Colonial could modify other deposit offerings or increase utilization of wholesale funding.

Short-Term Borrowings

Short-term borrowings consist of repurchase agreements, federal funds purchased and Federal Reserve Term Auction Facility (TAF) funds.
Short-term borrowings increased $604 million, or 106%, from December 31, 2007 to December 31, 2008 as Colonial purchased $700 million in
Federal Reserve TAF funds and decreased repurchase agreements by $96 million, or 17%. Refer to Note 16, Short-Term Borrowings, for
additional information.

Long-Term Debt

Long-term debt consists of FHLB advances, subordinated debt, junior subordinated debt, and capital lease obligations. Total long-term debt
increased $20 million, or 0.50%, from December 31, 2007 to December 31, 2008. During 2008, the Company issued $250 million in
subordinated debt, which qualifies as Tier II regulatory capital; paid off $214 million in FHLB borrowings; and paid off $7.7 million of variable
rate subordinated debt and $20.7 million of fixed rate subordinated debt. In addition, Colonial increased capital lease obligations by $3.4 million,
or 22%. Refer to Note 17, Long-Term Debt, for additional information.

REIT Preferred Securities

During May 2007, the Company issued $300 million in fixed-to-floating rate perpetual non-cumulative preferred stock through its indirect
subsidiary CBG Florida REIT Corp. When declared, dividends on these securities are payable at a rate of 7.114% until May 15, 2012 and at a
rate of 3-month LIBOR plus 2.02% for each dividend period thereafter. CBG Florida REIT Corp., at its option and subject to certain restrictions,
may redeem the preferred stock, in whole or in part, on May 15, 2012 and each fifth succeeding year thereafter. These securities qualify as Tier I
capital. Refer to Note 20, Minority Interest/REIT Preferred Securities, for additional information.

55

Edgar Filing: COLONIAL BANCGROUP INC - Form 10-K

Index to Financial Statements 67



Index to Financial Statements

OFF-BALANCE SHEET ARRANGEMENTS AND CONTRACTUAL OBLIGATIONS

Off-Balance Sheet Arrangements

As a financial services provider, the Company routinely commits to extend credit, including loan commitments, letters of credit and financial
guarantees. A significant portion of commitments to extend credit may expire without being drawn upon. These commitments are subject to the
same credit policies and approval process used for loans. Also, in the ordinary course of business, the Company enters into indemnification
agreements, including underwriting agreements relating to offers and sales of its securities, acquisition agreements and various other business
arrangements, such as relationships arising from service as a director or officer of BancGroup or its subsidiaries. For more information regarding
off-balance sheet arrangements, see Note 10, Commitments and Contingent Liabilities.

Contractual Obligations

The Company enters into contractual obligations in the ordinary course of business, including debt issuances for the funding of operations and
leases for premises and equipment. The table below summarizes contractual obligations as of December 31, 2008 except for obligations of
short-term borrowing arrangements and pension and postretirement benefits plans. More information on these obligations is contained in Note
16, Short-Term Borrowings, and Note 21, Employee Benefit Plans.

The Company also enters into derivatives, which create contractual obligations, as part of its interest rate risk management process. For more
information, see the Interest Rate Risk section of Management�s Discussion and Analysis and Note 12, Derivatives.

Payments Due by Period

Contractual Obligations Total
Less than 1

Year 1-3 Years 3-5 Years After 5 Years Other
(In thousands)

Long-term debt par value(1)(2) $ 4,095,908 $ 42,421 $ 99,388 $ 3,590 $ 3,950,509 $ �
Long-term debt interest(3)(4) 2,616,204 197,076 388,723 377,657 1,652,748 �
Operating leases 411,195 40,442 75,786 54,491 240,476 �
Time deposits 10,683,358 9,397,048 1,117,651 167,196 1,463 �
Uncertain tax positions(5) 26,027 � � � � 26,027

Total $ 17,832,692 $ 9,676,987 $ 1,681,548 $ 602,934 $ 5,845,196 $ 26,027

(1) Excludes purchase accounting fair value adjustments, hedge accounting fair value adjustments and unamortized premiums and discounts.
(2) Includes principal payments related to capital leases totaling $18.5 million, payable as follows: $1.4 million in less than 1 year; $2.7 million in 1-3 years; $2.7

million in 3-5 years; and $11.7 million after 5 years.
(3) Includes interest payments related to capital leases totaling $9.3 million, payable as follows: $1.2 million in less than 1 year; $2.2 million in 1-3 years; $1.9

million in 3-5 years; and $4.0 million after 5 years.
(4) Includes interest on variable rate debt calculated using the effective contractual rates as of December 31, 2008.
(5) As of December 31, 2008, the Company had $26.0 million in uncertain tax positions. Due to the uncertainty of the timing of future cash flows associated with

these obligations, reasonably reliable estimates of the periods of cash settlement with the respective taxing authorities cannot be made.
Time deposit maturities of $9.4 billion in 2009 are expected to be renewed or substantially replaced by new originations. Over the past 12
months, 57.5% of total matured time deposits were renewed while new originations exceeded the level of maturing time deposits that did not
renew. During January and February of 2009, $2.1 billion of time deposits matured and 49.7% of those deposits were renewed while Colonial
increased total time deposits with $1.0 billion of new originations. If the level of time deposit renewals and originations is less than the level of
maturities, Colonial could modify other deposit offerings or increase utilization of wholesale funding. See the Deposits section of Management�s
Discussion and Analysis, and Note 15, Time Deposits, for additional information.
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RISK MANAGEMENT

Credit Risk Management

Colonial has some measure of credit risk in most of its primary banking activities, but the majority of this risk is associated with lending. The
Company�s credit risk management process is centered on credit and underwriting policies and procedures, a loan approval process that uses a
committee structure, audit and review functions and credit professionals at the regional, business-line and BancGroup levels. In addition,
Colonial has a credit risk reporting and analysis group which evaluates changes in credit risk, monitors large concentrations and exposures by
types and locations and implements the Company�s loan loss allowance methodology. Colonial also has a special assets/collections group which
is charged with controlling losses, obtaining recoveries and implementing strategies to reduce problem asset levels. In addition, the internal
auditors and regulatory examiners review and perform detailed tests of the Company�s credit risk management activities, such as credit
underwriting, loan administration and the loan loss allowance process. The overall goals of Colonial�s credit risk management activities include
providing an appropriate basis for new credit extensions and timely recognition of problems and risks.

In addition to lending, credit risk is present in Colonial�s securities portfolio, derivative instruments and certain deposit activities. The Company�s
treasury and deposit departments have credit risk management processes in place in order to manage credit risk in these activities.

Loan Approval and Underwriting

The Chief Credit and Risk Officer, who reports directly to the Chief Executive Officer, provides company-wide credit oversight through a senior
credit administration function. This function reviews larger credits prior to approval and also provides an independent review of credits on an
ongoing basis. In addition, the Company has established regional loan committees comprised of local officers and directors that approve loans
up to certain dollar amounts. These committees provide local business and market views while BancGroup�s senior management provides
oversight by participating in the state loan committees. Loans to the Company�s largest borrowers and loans originated out of specialized
business units may go through these committees for approval, but also are generally reviewed and approved by additional committees
established by the Board of Directors and administered by the Chief Credit and Risk Officer.

Below is a summary of the most significant underwriting criteria used to evaluate new loans and loan renewals:

� Cash flow and debt service coverage � adequate cash flow is a necessary condition of credit worthiness. Loans not clearly supported by a
borrower�s cash flow must be justified by secondary repayment sources.

� Secondary repayment sources � alternative repayment funds significantly mitigate risk as long as the funds are liquid, easily accessible
and adequate to supplement the primary cash flow source.

� Underlying collateral value � loans are generally secured by the asset being financed. However, unless it is liquid, it does not justify
loans that cannot be serviced by the borrower�s normal cash flows.

� Overall credit worthiness of the customer � the customer�s relationships, both past and current, with both Colonial and other lenders are
taken into account. Success depends on building lasting, mutually beneficial relationships with clients, which involves assessing their
financial position and background.

� Equity invested in the transaction � in general, borrowers are required to contribute or invest a portion of their own funds prior to any
loan advances.

Collateral guidelines vary with the type of loan and creditworthiness of the borrower, but generally require loan-to-value ratios ranging from
50% to 90%, depending on the loan type. Collateral values are monitored and estimated by loan officers and the senior credit administration
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Commercial Real Estate and Real Estate Construction Loan Categories

A large portion of BancGroup�s loans are secured by real estate, with commercial real estate and construction loans representing 33.9% and
33.8% of total loans as of December 31, 2008, respectively. BancGroup�s commercial real estate and construction loans are spread
geographically throughout Alabama, Florida and other areas including metropolitan Atlanta, Dallas, Reno and Las Vegas with no more than
12.5% of total commercial real estate and construction loans in any one metropolitan statistical area (MSA). The Alabama economy generally
experiences a slow but steady rate of growth, while BancGroup�s markets in Florida, Georgia, Nevada and Texas have historically experienced
higher rates of growth. Currently, all of BancGroup�s markets are experiencing a decline in real estate values due to an over supply of houses
along with reduced demand for real estate, particularly residential real estate. The collateral held in the commercial real estate and construction
portfolios consists of various property types such as retail properties, 1-4 family residential developments and lots, office buildings, land held for
future development or construction, residential homes under construction, multi-family housing, condominium properties, warehouses, lodging
and health service facilities. Colonial focuses its commercial real estate and construction lending efforts on properties owned and/or developed
by experienced customers with whom BancGroup has established relationships. In addition to the subject properties, substantially all
construction and commercial real estate loans have personal guarantees of the principals involved. The owner-occupied commercial real estate
portfolio represented 34.0% of the total commercial real estate portfolio outstanding at December 31, 2008. Owner-occupied real estate is
primarily dependent on cash flows from operating businesses rather than on the sale or rental of the property; therefore, these loans generally
contain different inherent risks than other commercial real estate loans.

The following charts reflect the geographic diversity and property type distribution of total construction and commercial real estate loans at
December 31, 2008:

Construction
% of
Total

Commercial
Real Estate

% of
Total

(Dollars in thousands)
Geographic Diversity (by property location)(1)
Florida $ 2,144,120 43.6% $ 3,015,510 61.1%
Alabama 488,710 9.9% 543,261 11.0%
Georgia 511,470 10.4% 349,924 7.1%
Texas 947,705 19.2% 440,882 9.0%
Nevada 432,433 8.8% 199,693 4.0%
Other 397,752 8.1% 386,674 7.8%

Total $ 4,922,190 100.0% $ 4,935,944 100.0%

Property Type
Distribution %

Property Type
Distribution %

Construction
Portfolio

Total
Portfolio

Commercial
Real Estate
Portfolio

Total
Portfolio

Residential Construction Retail 22.0% 7.5%
Residential development and lots 24.3% 8.2% Office 21.5% 7.3%
Residential home construction 9.5% 3.2% Warehouse 13.7% 4.6%
Residential land 7.0% 2.4% Multi-Family 9.4% 3.2%
Condominium 5.5% 1.9% Healthcare 9.1% 3.1%

Total Residential Construction 46.3% 15.7% Lodging 6.2% 2.1%

Commercial Construction Church or School 3.7% 1.3%
Commercial land 17.6% 6.0% Industrial 2.5% 0.8%
Commercial development and lots 11.0% 3.7% Farm 2.5% 0.8%
Retail 8.1% 2.7% Other(2) 9.4% 3.2%

Multi-Family 3.9% 1.3% Total Commercial Real Estate 100.0% 33.9%
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Office 4.2% 1.4%
Other(2) 8.9% 3.0%

Total Commercial Construction 53.7% 18.1%

Total Construction 100.0% 33.8%
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(1) No more than 12.5% of construction and commercial real estate loans are in any one MSA.
(2) Other includes all loans in categories smaller than the lowest percentages shown above.
Selected Characteristics of the 75 Largest Construction and Commercial Real Estate Loans

Construction
Commercial
Real Estate

75 Largest Loans Total (in thousands) $ 1,321,673 $ 1,001,470
% of 75 Largest Loans to Category Total 26.9% 20.3%
Average Loan to Value Ratio (75 largest loans) 73.2% 68.4%
Average Debt Coverage Ratio (75 largest loans) N/A 1.51x
Residential Construction Loan Category

Residential construction represents approximately 46% of the Company�s construction portfolio and consists of residential development and lots,
residential home construction, residential land and condominiums. The loans are generally short-term, have the personal guarantees of the
principals involved and are underwritten such that each borrower has substantial equity in the project.

The majority of the Company�s nonperforming assets and net charge-offs during recent quarters relate to residential construction loans. The lack
of real estate sales has caused liquidity issues for some of the Company�s borrowers which have resulted in higher levels of nonperforming loans
and losses in this portfolio.

The following table and chart show the components of residential construction loans, excluding nonperforming loans of approximately $300.4
million, at December 31, 2008:

Residential Construction Loans

Total
Outstanding Residential

Development

Builder
Lot

Inventory

Consumer-
Owned
Lots

Residential
Presold

Residential
Speculative Land

Condominium
Construction    Amount    %

(Dollars in millions)
Florida $ 885 45% $ 309 $ 45 $ 65 $ 47 $ 109 $ 137 $ 173
Texas 483 24 303 23 5 12 42 84 14
Georgia 267 14 153 13 1 9 57 12 22
Alabama 227 11 71 22 24 17 62 25 6
Nevada 85 4 33 1 � 22 10 19 �
Other 33 2 7 1 1 3 2 7 12

Total $ 1,980 100% $ 876 $ 105 $ 96 $ 110 $ 282 $ 284 $ 227
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Residential Construction Loans

Other Loan Categories

The risks associated with loans classified as commercial, financial and agricultural are generally related to the earnings capacity of, and the cash
flows generated from, the specific business activities of the borrowers.

The risks associated with residential real estate loans are primarily related to the earnings capacity of the individual borrowers, as well as overall
economic conditions which can adversely impact employment levels and property values. The Company has not offered any products targeting
sub-prime borrowers and does not offer higher risk mortgage products such as option ARMs, �pick a payment� loans and low or no documentation
loans.

Regarding consumer and other loans, the principal source of repayment is the earnings of the individual borrower and, on collateralized loans,
the collateral serves as a secondary source of repayment.

Allowance for Loan Losses

Management�s ongoing evaluation of the adequacy of the allowance for loan losses considers both impaired and unimpaired loans and takes into
consideration Colonial�s past loan loss experience, known and inherent risks in the portfolio, existing adverse situations that may affect the
borrowers� ability to repay, estimated value of any underlying collateral, an analysis of existing guarantees and an analysis of current economic
conditions.

Colonial, through its lending and credit functions, performs ongoing reviews of its loan portfolio for credit risk. Colonial employs an
independent credit review area that reviews the lending and credit functions to test the identification of credit risks. The Company remains
committed to the timely recognition of problem loans and to ensuring an adequate level of allowance to cover inherent losses. Using information
derived from the credit risk identification process, the Company�s credit risk management area analyzes and performs the Company�s allowance
for loan losses calculations. The analysis includes four basic components: general allowances for loan pools, specific allowances for individual
loans, allowances based on identified economic conditions and other risk factors and the overall allowance level (which gives rise to the
unallocated component of the allowance).
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Management reviews the methodology, calculations and results and ensures that the calculations are appropriate and that all material risk
elements have been assessed in order to determine the appropriate level of allowance for the inherent losses in the loan portfolio at each quarter
end. Past due balances, nonaccrual balances, and potential problem loan balances are not absolute indicators of the losses inherent in the loan
portfolio, but are considered in the overall evaluation of the adequacy of the allowance for loan losses. In addition, the allowance for loan losses
methodology is discussed with, and reviewed by, the Risk Committee of the Board of Directors on a quarterly basis.

The following chart reflects the various tiers of reserves included in the allowance for loan losses:

Tier I General allowance calculated based upon Colonial�s historical losses
Tier II Specific reserves for impaired loans
Tier III Reserves for economic and other risk factors
Unallocated Represents the imprecision inherent in the previous calculations
Total Represents summation of all reserves

Tier I Reserves

The first reserve component (i.e. Tier I Reserves) is the general allowance for loan pools assessed by applying loss factors to groups of loans that
have similar characteristics. This part of the methodology is governed by SFAS 5, Accounting for Contingencies. The general allowance factors
are based upon recent and historical charge-off experience and are applied to the outstanding portfolio by loan type and internal risk rating.
Historical loss analyses provide the basis for factors used for homogenous pools of smaller loans, such as residential real estate and other
consumer loan categories which generally are not evaluated based on individual risk ratings but almost entirely based on historical losses. The
statistics used in the Tier I analyses are adjusted quarterly based on loss trends and risk rating migrations.

As a result of the significant real estate market deterioration in the fourth quarter of 2007 and throughout 2008, the levels of classified and
criticized loans, as well as net charge-offs, have increased. As a result the Tier I component of the Company�s allowance for loan losses increased
to $206.2 million at December 31, 2008, from $182.2 million at December 31, 2007

Tier II Reserves

The second component of the allowance (i.e. Tier II Reserves) involves the calculation of specific allowances for each impaired loan in
accordance with SFAS 114, Accounting by Creditors for Impairment of a Loan. In situations where a loan is determined to be impaired
(primarily because it is probable that all principal and interest amounts due according to the terms of the note will not be collected as scheduled),
a specific reserve may or may not be warranted. Upon examination of the collateral and other factors, it may be determined that Colonial
reasonably expects to collect all amounts due; therefore, no specific reserve is warranted. Any loan determined to be impaired (whether a
specific reserve is assigned or not) is excluded from the Tier I calculations described above.

Colonial tests a broad group of loans for impairment each quarter (this includes all loans over $1 million that have internal risk ratings below a
predetermined classification level, plus all loans over $500,000 that are more than 60 days past due). Once a loan is identified as impaired,
reserves are based on a thorough analysis of the most probable source of repayment which is normally the liquidation of collateral, but may also
include discounted future cash flows or the market value of the loan itself. Generally, for collateral dependent loans, current market appraisals
are utilized for larger credits; however, in situations where a current market appraisal is not available, Colonial utilizes the best available
information (including appraisals for similar properties,
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communications with qualified real estate professionals, information contained in reputable publications and other market data) to estimate the
current fair value (less cost to sell) of the subject property. As a result of the increase in the level of impaired loans, the Tier II component of the
allowance for loan losses increased to $48.6 million at December 31, 2008, from $11.0 million at December 31, 2007.

Tier III Reserves

The third component of the allowance (i.e. Tier III Reserves) represents the effect of risks or losses that are not fully captured elsewhere. This
part of the allowance is calculated in accordance with SFAS 5 and reflects adjustments to historical loss experience to incorporate current
economic conditions and other factors which impact the inherent losses contained in the portfolio. This component includes amounts for
portfolio categories which are deemed to have risks not included in the other reserve elements as well as macroeconomic and other factors. The
qualitative risk factors of this third allowance tier are more subjective and require a high degree of management judgment. Currently, the Tier III
Reserves include additional reserves for Colonial�s concentration in commercial real estate and construction loans as well as reserves for
mortgage warehouse loans, and residential real estate loans. While the Tier III factors represent incremental risks inherent in the portfolio, due to
the nature of the risks, the loss factors utilized in this component are not readily observable and therefore are based upon management�s best
estimation and are directionally consistent with current market conditions.

The Tier III Reserves for commercial real estate and construction are intended to provide for current elevated levels of economic risk as well as
the inherent incremental risk resulting from Colonial�s relative concentration in those loan types. The reserves for mortgage warehouse lending
are included in Tier III because historical losses for this portfolio have been de minimis, and as such no Tier I reserve is calculated for this
portfolio. The incremental reserves for residential mortgage loans are intended to represent the additional levels of inherent risk in this portfolio.
As a result of the overall market deterioration during 2008 and the impact on the Company�s asset quality metrics, the Tier III component of the
allowance for loan losses increased to $55.4 million at December 31, 2008, from $28.6 million at December 31, 2007.

Unallocated Allowance

In addition to the Tier I, II and III reserves, unallocated reserves are included in the overall allowance for loan losses. The unallocated allowance
is the result of management�s judgment of risks inherent in the portfolio, economic uncertainties and other subjective factors, including industry
trends, as well as the imprecision inherent in the estimates used for the allocated portions of the allowance. Management reviews the overall
level of the allowance for loan losses as well as the unallocated component and considers the level of both amounts in determining the
appropriate level of reserves to be maintained given the overall inherent risk in Colonial�s total loan portfolio. The unallocated allowance totaled
$14.7 million and $17.0 million at December 31, 2008 and 2007, respectively.
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Allocation of the Allowance for Loan Losses

December 31,
2008 2007 2006 2005 2004

Amount

Percent of
Loans in
Each

Category
to Total
Loans Amount

Percent of
Loans in
Each

Category
to Total
Loans Amount

Percent of
Loans in
Each

Category
to Total
Loans Amount

Percent of
Loans in
Each

Category
to Total
Loans Amount

Percent of
Loans in
Each

Category
to Total
Loans

(Dollars in thousands)
Balance at end of period
applicable to:
Commercial, financial and
agricultural $ 50,859 11.8% $ 44,425 9.5% $ 42,148 9.3% $ 44,244 10.6% $ 47,404 16.5%
Commercial real estate 66,859 33.9% 28,678 31.4% 26,820 27.7% 40,311 29.7% 37,393 33.2%
Real estate construction 157,576 33.8% 119,723 39.5% 64,487 40.9% 41,826 36.8% 30,357 30.5%
Residential real estate 24,947 17.7% 16,702 16.8% 18,337 19.3% 20,734 20.4% 12,494 17.3%
Consumer and other 10,070 2.8% 12,328 2.8% 11,265 2.8% 10,030 2.5% 9,075 2.5%
Unallocated 14,689 NA 16,989 NA 11,793 NA 13,906 NA 12,079 NA

Total $ 325,000 100.0% $ 238,845 100.0% $ 174,850 100.0% $ 171,051 100.0% $ 148,802 100.0%

Percent of Reserve to
Loan Category
Commercial, financial and
agricultural 2.97% 2.95% 2.93% 2.78% 2.23%
Commercial real estate 1.35% 0.57% 0.62% 0.91% 0.88%
Real estate construction 3.20% 1.90% 1.02% 0.76% 0.77%
Residential real estate 0.97% 0.62% 0.61% 0.68% 0.56%
Consumer and other 2.50% 2.72% 2.57% 2.69% 2.88%
Unallocated NA NA NA NA NA
Total 2.24% 1.50% 1.13% 1.15% 1.16%
The following table summarizes changes in the balance of the allowance for loan losses as well as loan loss experience:

Year Ended December 31,
2008 2007 2006 2005 2004

(Dollars in thousands)
Balance � January 1 $ 238,845 $ 174,850 $ 171,051 $ 148,802 $ 138,549
Additions due to acquisitions � 13,914 � 14,622 6,857
Provision charged to income 728,942 106,450 22,142 26,838 26,994
Reduction due to sale of mortgage loans originally held for
investment � (2,303) � � �
Loans charged off (647,933) (61,338) (30,779) (27,206) (29,811)
Recoveries 5,146 7,272 12,436 7,995 6,213

Balance � December 31 $ 325,000 $ 238,845 $ 174,850 $ 171,051 $ 148,802

Loans (net of unearned income) December 31 $ 14,530,018 $ 15,923,178 $ 15,478,889 $ 14,899,864 $ 12,857,811
Ratio of ending allowance to ending loans (net of unearned
income) 2.24% 1.50% 1.13% 1.15% 1.16%
Average loans (net of unearned income) $ 15,454,146 $ 15,290,766 $ 15,339,699 $ 14,139,380 $ 12,148,513
Ratio of net charge-offs to average loans (net of unearned
income) 4.16% 0.35% 0.12% 0.14% 0.19%
BancGroup also maintains a reserve against certain unfunded commitments, including letters of credit. This reserve is included in other
liabilities and totaled $3.0 million and $1.0 million as of December 31, 2008 and 2007, respectively.
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Analysis of Net Charge-Offs

December 31,
2008 2007 2006 2005 2004

(Dollars in thousands)
Charge-offs:
Commercial, financial and agricultural $ 34,669 $ 4,034 $ 17,346 $ 8,452 $ 10,854
Commercial real estate 47,843 3,648 1,537 8,860 8,034
Real estate construction 527,307 45,363 5,690 2,445 2,670
Residential real estate 25,909 4,214 1,702 3,155 2,613
Consumer and other 12,205 4,079 4,504 4,294 5,640

Total charge-offs 647,933 61,338 30,779 27,206 29,811

Recoveries:
Commercial, financial and agricultural 1,733 4,386 5,914 3,546 2,855
Commercial real estate 245 118 3,175 1,171 776
Real estate construction 839 410 571 254 223
Residential real estate 531 560 428 584 480
Consumer and other 1,798 1,798 2,348 2,440 1,879

Total recoveries 5,146 7,272 12,436 7,995 6,213

Net charge-offs:
Commercial, financial and agricultural 32,936 (352) 11,432 4,906 7,999
Commercial real estate 47,598 3,530 (1,638) 7,689 7,258
Real estate construction 526,468 44,953 5,119 2,191 2,447
Residential real estate 25,378 3,654 1,274 2,571 2,133
Consumer and other 10,407 2,281 2,156 1,854 3,761

Total net charge-offs $ 642,787 $ 54,066 $ 18,343 $ 19,211 $ 23,598

Percent of net charge-offs to average loan category:
Commercial, financial and agricultural 2.07% (0.03)% 0.78% 0.28% 0.41%
Commercial real estate 0.95% 0.08% (0.04)% 0.17% 0.17%
Real estate construction 9.11% 0.71% 0.09% 0.05% 0.07%
Residential real estate 0.97% 0.13% 0.04% 0.09% 0.10%
Consumer and other 2.29% 0.47% 0.49% 0.51% 1.14%
Total 4.15% 0.35% 0.12% 0.14% 0.19%
While the majority of 2008 net charge-offs occurred in the Company�s real estate construction portfolio, the other components of the loan
portfolio also experienced elevated levels of charge-offs arising from the current U.S. recession.

Nonperforming Assets and Potential Problem Loans

Colonial maintains an active nonaccrual and problem loan identification program. Through the ongoing monitoring and review of the various
risks in the loan portfolio, this program aids in the timely identification of problem loans and the minimization of the risk of loss.

Nonperforming assets consist of loans on nonaccrual status, renegotiated loans, other real estate owned, repossessions and loans held for sale on
nonaccrual status. Loans are generally placed on nonaccrual status if full collection of principal and interest becomes unlikely (even if all
payments are current) or if the loan is delinquent in principal or interest payments for 90 days or more, unless the loan is well secured and in the
process of collection. BancGroup�s policy is to charge-off consumer installment loans when they become 120 days past due unless they are in the
process of foreclosure and are adequately collateralized. Management monitors all loans that are contractually 90 days past due, renegotiated or
nonaccrual.
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Other real estate owned includes real estate acquired through foreclosure or by deed taken in lieu of foreclosure. These properties are recorded at
estimated fair value, less costs to sell, with any initial difference between the fair value of the property and the carrying value of the loan being
charged to the allowance for loan losses. Subsequent changes in fair value are reported as adjustments to the carrying amount, not to exceed the
adjusted carrying value of the assets at the time of transfer. Those subsequent changes, as well as any gains or losses recognized on the sale of
these properties, are included in noninterest expense.

Nonperforming Assets

December 31,
2008 2007 2006
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