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Workhorse Group Inc.

100 Commerce Drive

Loveland, Ohio  45140

513-360-4704

(Address, including zip code, and telephone number, including area code, of agent for service)

With copies to:

Stephen M. Fleming, Esq.

Fleming PLLC

49 Front Street, Suite 206

Rockville Centre, New York 11570

516-833-5034

Approximate date of commencement of proposed sale to the public :

From time to time after this Registration Statement becomes effective as determined by market conditions.

If the only securities being registered on this Form are being offered pursuant to dividend or interest reinvestment
plans, please check the following box. ☐

If any of the securities being registered on this Form are to be offered on a delayed or continuous basis pursuant to
Rule 415 under the Securities Act of 1933, other than securities offered only in connection with dividend or interest
reinvestment plans, check the following box. ☒

If this Form is filed to register additional securities for an offering pursuant to Rule 462(b) under the Securities Act,
please check the following box and list the Securities Act registration statement number of the earlier effective
registration statement for the same offering. ☐

If this Form is a post-effective amendment filed pursuant to Rule 462(c) under the Securities Act, check the following
box and list the Securities Act registration statement number of the earlier effective registration statement for the same
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offering. ☐

If this Form is a registration statement pursuant to General Instruction I.D. or a post-effective amendment thereto that
shall become effective upon filing with the Commission pursuant to Rule 462(e) under the Securities Act, check the
following box. ☐

If this Form is a post-effective amendment to a registration statement filed pursuant to General Instruction I.D. filed to
register additional securities or additional classes of securities pursuant to Rule 413(b) under the Securities Act, check
the following box. ☐

Indicate by check mark whether the registrant is a large accelerated filer, an accelerated filer, a non-accelerated filer,
or a smaller reporting company. See the definitions of “large accelerated filer,” “accelerated filer” and “smaller reporting
company” in Rule 12b-2 of the Exchange Act.

Large accelerated filer ☐ Accelerated filer ☐

Non-accelerated filer ☐ (Do not check if a smaller reporting company). Smaller  reporting company ☒
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CALCULATION OF REGISTRATION FEE

Title of each class of
securities to be registered

Amount
to be
registered
(1)(2)

Proposed
maximum
offering
price per
share (2)

Proposed
maximum
aggregate
offering price
(2)

Amount of
registration
fee (3)

Common Stock, par value $.001 per share
Preferred Stock, par value $.001 per share
Warrants
Debt Securities
Units
Total $150,000,000 $15,105.00

(1)

Pursuant to Rule 416 of the Securities Act of 1933 (or the Securities Act), there are being registered an
indeterminate principal amount or number of common stock, preferred stock, warrants, debt securities and units as
shall have an aggregate initial offering price of the securities issued or sold under this Registration Statement not to
exceed $150,000,000. Separate consideration may or may not be received for securities that are being registered
that are issued in exchange for, or upon conversion or exercise of, the preferred stock, securities warrants, debt
securities or units being registered hereunder.

(2)

Subject to footnote (1), this registration statement also covers an indeterminate amount of common stock and/or
preferred stock that may be issued in exchange for, or upon conversion or exercise of, the preferred stock,
securities warrants, debt securities or units being registered. Any securities being registered may be sold separately
or as units with other securities being registered.

(3)Calculated pursuant to Rule 457(o) under the Securities Act of 1933.

The registrant hereby amends this registration statement on such date or dates as may be necessary to delay its
effective date until the registrant shall file a further amendment which specifically states that this registration
statement shall thereafter become effective in accordance with Section 8(a) of the Securities Act of 1933 or until
the registration statement shall become effective on such date as the Commission, acting pursuant to said
Section 8(a), may determine.
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The information in this prospectus is not complete and may be changed. We may not sell these securities until
the registration statement filed with the Securities and Exchange Commission is effective. This prospectus is
not an offer to sell these securities and it is not soliciting an offer to buy these securities in any state where the
offer or sale is not permitted.

SUBJECT TO COMPLETION,

DATED AUGUST 11, 2016

PROSPECTUS

$150,000,000

Common Stock

Preferred Stock 
Warrants 
Debt Securities

Units

We may offer and sell, from time to time in one or more offerings, up to $150,000,000 in the aggregate of common
stock, preferred stock, warrants to purchase our common stock, debt securities or units, at prices and on terms that we
will determine at the time of the offering. Preferred stock, warrants and debt securities may also be convertible into
preferred stock or common stock.

This prospectus describes some of the general terms that may apply to these securities. Each time we sell securities, to
the extent required by applicable law, we will provide a supplement to this prospectus that contains specific
information about the offering and the terms of the securities being offered. The supplement may also add, update or
change information contained in this prospectus. 

You should carefully read this prospectus, all prospectus supplements and all other documents incorporated by
reference in this prospectus before you invest in our securities.
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We will offer the securities in amounts, at prices and on terms to be determined by market conditions at the time of the
offerings. The securities may be offered separately or together in any combination.

The securities may be offered and sold on a delayed or continuous basis directly by us or through underwriters, agents
or dealers as designated from time to time, through a combination of these methods or any other method as provided
in the applicable prospectus supplement. The supplements to this prospectus will designate the terms of our plan of
distribution. See the discussion under the heading “Plan of Distribution” for more information on the topic.

Our common stock is listed on The NASDAQ Capital Market under the symbol “WKHS.”

Investing in our securities involves risks. You should carefully review the section captioned “ Risk Factors”
beginning on page 1 of this prospectus regarding information included and incorporated by reference in this
prospectus and the applicable prospectus supplement.

Neither the Securities and Exchange Commission nor any state securities commission has approved or
disapproved of these securities or determined if this prospectus is truthful or complete. Any representation to
the contrary is a criminal offense.

The date of this prospectus is August     , 2016.
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ABOUT THIS PROSPECTUS

This prospectus is part of a registration statement that we have filed with the Securities and Exchange Commission
using a “shelf” registration process. Using this process, we may sell any combination of the securities described in this
prospectus in one or more offerings up to a total dollar amount of $150,000,000.

This prospectus provides you with a general description of the securities that we may offer. Each time we use this
prospectus to offer securities, we will provide a prospectus supplement that will describe the specific terms of the
offering. The prospectus supplement may also add to or update other information contained in this prospectus.

In making your investment decision, you should rely only on the information contained or incorporated by reference
in this prospectus and any prospectus supplement we may authorize to be delivered to you. This prospectus
incorporates important business and financial information about us that is not included in or delivered with this
prospectus. You may obtain a copy of this information, without charge, as described in the “Where You Can Find More
Information” section. We have not authorized anyone to provide you with any other information. If you receive any
other information, you should not rely on it.

You should not assume that the information appearing in this prospectus is accurate as of any date other than the date
on the front cover of this prospectus. You should not assume that the information contained in the documents
incorporated by reference in this prospectus is accurate as of any date other than the respective dates of those
documents. Our business, financial condition, results of operations, reserves and prospects may have changed since
that date.

We encourage you to read this entire prospectus together with the documents incorporated by reference into this
prospectus before making a decision whether to invest in our securities.

ABOUT WORKHORSE GROUP INC.

We are a technology company that is focused on last mile delivery systems with operations in Indiana and Ohio. We
design, develop, manufacture and sell cost effective high-performance electric medium duty trucks and unmanned
aerial delivery systems that are fully integrated with our electric vehicles. 
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We are a Nevada corporation. Our executive offices are located at 100 Commerce Drive, Loveland, Ohio  45140, and
our telephone number is 513-360-4704.

Unless otherwise stated or the context requires otherwise, references to “we,” “us,” the “Company” and “Workhorse Group”
refer to Workhorse Group Inc. and unless otherwise differentiated, its wholly-owned subsidiaries, Workhorse
Technologies Inc. and Workhorse Motor Works Inc.

RISK FACTORS

An investment in our securities involves a high degree of risk. You should carefully consider the risk factors and all
other information contained in our most recent Annual Report on Form 10-K, in our Quarterly Reports on Form 10-Q
and Current Reports on Form 8-K before investing in our securities. You should also consider similar information
contained in any Annual Report on Form 10-K, Quarterly Report on Form 10-Q, Current Report on Form 8-K or other
document filed by us with the SEC after the date of this prospectus before deciding to invest in our securities. If any of
these risks were to occur, our business, financial condition or results of operations could be adversely affected. In that
case, the trading price of our common stock or other securities could decline and you could lose all or part of your
investment. When we offer and sell any securities pursuant to a prospectus supplement, we may include additional
risk factors relevant to such securities in the prospectus supplement.

1
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FORWARD LOOKING STATEMENTS

This prospectus contains forward-looking statements that involve risks and uncertainties. You should not place undue
reliance on these forward-looking statements. Our actual results could differ materially from those anticipated in the
forward-looking statements for many reasons, including the reasons described in our “Prospectus Summary,” “Use of
Proceeds,” “Risk Factors,” “Management Discussion and Analysis of Financial Condition and Result of Operations,” and
“Business” sections. In some cases, you can identify these forward-looking statements by terms such as “anticipate,”
“believe,” “continue,” “could,” “depends,” “estimate,” “expects,” “intend,” “may,” “ongoing,” “plan,” “potential,” “predict,” “project,” “should,”
“will,” “would” or the negative of those terms or other similar expressions, although not all forward-looking statements
contain those words.

We have based these forward looking statements largely on our current expectations and projections about future
events and financial trends that we believe may affect our financial condition, results of operations, business strategy
and financial needs. These forward looking statements are subject to a number of known and unknown risks,
uncertainties and assumptions, including risks described in the section titled “Risk Factors” and elsewhere in this
prospectus, regarding, among other things:

●management and employee operations and execution risks;

●a failure to develop sales and the loss of any key customer that we may develop; 

●loss of key personnel;

●competition in the markets we serve;

●intellectual property risks;

●our ability to fund our working capital requirements;

●risks associated with the uncertainty of future financial results;

●risks associated with this offering;

●risks associated with raising additional capital when needed and at reasonable terms; and

●risks associated with our reliance on third party suppliers of raw materials and other organizations that providegoods and services to us.

These risks are not exhaustive. Other sections of this prospectus may include additional factors that could adversely
impact our business and financial performance. Moreover, we operate in a very competitive and rapidly changing
environment. New risk factors emerge from time to time, and it is not possible for our management to predict all risk
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factors nor can we assess the impact of all factors on our business or the extent to which any factor, or combination of
factors, may cause actual results to differ materially from those contained in, or implied by, any forward looking
statements.

You should not rely upon forward looking statements as predictions of future events. We cannot assure you that the
events and circumstances reflected in the forward looking statements will be achieved or occur. Although we believe
that the expectations reflected in the forward looking statements are reasonable, we cannot guarantee future results,
levels of activity, performance or achievements. Except as required by law, we undertake no obligation to update
publicly any forward looking statements for any reason after the date of this prospectus or to conform these statements
to actual results or to changes in our expectations.

You should read this prospectus and the documents that we reference in this prospectus and have filed as exhibits to
the registration statement of which this prospectus is a part with the understanding that our actual future results, levels
of activity, performance and achievements may be materially different from what we expect. We qualify all of our
forward looking statements by these cautionary statements.

2

Edgar Filing: Workhorse Group Inc. - Form S-3

11



OUR COMPANY

We are a technology company that is focused on last mile delivery systems. We design, develop, manufacture and sell
cost effective high-performance electric medium duty trucks and unmanned aerial delivery systems that are fully
integrated with our electric vehicles. We believe our vehicles, engineering expertise, and business model differentiates
us from other truck and drone manufacturers.

On June 4, 2014, we entered into a Vehicle Purchase Agreement with United Parcel Service Inc. (“UPS”), pursuant to
which we outlined with UPS the relationship by which we would sell vehicles to UPS. On August 7, 2015, we entered
into a Prime Order under the Vehicle Purchase Agreement with UPS, pursuant to which UPS agreed to purchase 125
E-GEN trucks. In connection with each purchase order, we develop a delivery schedule as well as locations for
specific deliveries. For example, the schedule agreed to with UPS for the Prime Order requires that we deliver the 125
units to 26 selected UPS facilities across eight states over a six-month period. However, these deadlines are expected
to evolve as UPS operations personnel from eight states will be involved in the scheduling.

Workhorse had previously entered into a purchase agreement with UPS to supply 18 all-electric Workhorse E-100
Walk-In Vans to be deployed in the Houston-Galveston, Texas area The U.S. Department of Energy selected this
project to improve local air quality in the Houston-Galveston area, which is currently designated as a National
Ambient Air Quality Non-Attainment Area. We continue regular deliveries of the E-100 vehicles with all deliveries to
be completed by the beginning of the third quarter 2016.

We have developed and begun delivery of our second generation, full-electric truck, “E-100”, which is a significant
improvement over our first generation E-100 vehicle. The second-generation vehicle includes a single powerful
electric motor with no transmission and lighter, high-density Lithium-ion batteries, giving the vehicle a range of up to
100 miles. We have filed a patent application for the system that extends the range of electric vehicles while reducing
the overall cost of the typical battery-electric power train. The system, E-GEN TM, is designed specifically for the
package delivery vehicle market, in which the diesel and/or gasoline-powered vehicles in use now are required to stop
and restart hundreds of times a day. Our E-GEN system incorporates a small internal combustion engine that powers
an integrated electric motor as a generator when the battery pack reaches a pre-determined depth-of-discharge (DOD).
The DOD is calculated based on projected route distance, package loads and electricity efficiency curves. The gas
engine never propels the vehicle, its task is simple, to automatically turn on in the event the battery needs a small
re-charge. We believe that the range-extended battery-electric technology is an ideal fit for urban and suburban
delivery routes, despite the typical fleet owner's concerns about range and cost. Our E-GEN Drive system will enable
our customers to keep their batteries charged to a consistent state of charge throughout the day and, since we are able
to use smaller battery packs, we can reduce the cost of the entire system. Our E-GEN trucks offer a three-year
payback, making them price competitive with gasoline-powered trucks. We recently entered in an agreement with
Bayerische Motoren Werke AG (BMW) to supply the new quiet-running 2-cylinder gasoline generator replacing the
current 4-cylinder engine to extend the range of our E-GEN product.
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In March of 2013, we purchased the former Workhorse Custom Chassis assembly plant in Union City, Indiana from
Navistar International (NAV: NYSE). With this acquisition, we acquired the capability to be an Original Equipment
Manufacturer (OEM) of Class 3-6 commercial-grade, medium-duty truck chassis, to be marketed under the
Workhorse® brand.

Ownership and operation of this plant enables us to build new chassis with gross vehicle weight capacities of between
10,000 and 26,000 pounds. These chassis are our new 88”-track (W88) and include either of our two
second-generation, battery-electric drive trains, both powered by Panasonic 18650 Li-ion cells. The W88 truck chassis
is currently being offered to fleet purchasing managers at price points that are both attractive and cost competitive. At
the same time, we intend to partner with engine suppliers and body fabricators to offer fleet-specific, custom,
purpose-built chassis that provide total cost of ownership solutions that are superior to the competition.

3
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In addition to having the ability to build our own chassis, we design and produce battery-electric power trains that can
be installed in new Workhorse chassis or installed as repower packages to convert used Class 3-6 medium-duty
vehicles from diesel or gasoline power to electric power. Our approach is to provide battery-electric power trains
utilizing proven, automotive-grade, mass-produced parts in their architectures, coupled with in-house control software
that we have developed over the last five years.

The Workhorse Custom Chassis acquisition provides other important assets including the Workhorse brand and logo,
intellectual property, schematics, logistical support from Up-Time Parts (a Navistar subsidiary) and a network of
400-plus sales and service outlets across North America. We believe the combination of our chassis assembly
capability, coupled with its ability to offer an array of fuel choices, gives Workhorse a unique opportunity in the
marketplace.

We are also seeking to re-design the future of parcel delivery aviation: HorseFly™, an Unmanned Aerial Vehicle (UAV)
that is designed for the package delivery market as well as other commercial applications. Our UAV works in tandem
with our electric trucks to bring a practical low cost solution to making the last mile more efficient and cost effective
for our parcel customers. HorseFly™ is designed to further improve package delivery efficiencies and has been
developed in conjunction with the University of Cincinnati. In June 2016, the Federal Aviation Administration (or the
FAA) announced new rules permitting commercial use of drones weighing less than 55 pounds subject to certain
restrictions including maintaining visual contact.

We recently developed Metron® which is a system that provides fleet operators ultimate energy and route efficiency
while enabling them to monitor, control and update software remotely. We are also currently in the initial stages of
developing a self-driving software to further differentiate us as the technology company with the most cost effective
last mile delivery system in the marketplace. 

We responded to a Request for Information and Prequalification (RFI) from the United States Postal Service (USPS)
for its Next Generation Delivery Vehicle (NGDV) Acquisition Program relating to the replacement of the USPS’
current fleet of mail delivery vehicles. In April 2015, the USPS notified Workhorse that it had advanced in the NGDV
Acquisition Program as a prequalified supplier. Workhorse partnered with another pre-qualified supplier to design and
build the body and the joint response to the USPS NGDV RFP, which was submitted to the USPS in February 2016.
We then subsequently submitted proposal revisions in March 2016.

4
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USE OF PROCEEDS

Unless we indicate otherwise in an accompanying prospectus supplement, we intend to use the net proceeds from the
sale of our securities offered by this prospectus for general corporate purposes, which may include, but not be limited
to, working capital, capital expenditures, acquisitions, refinancing of indebtedness and repurchases or redemptions of
securities.

DESCRIPTION OF CAPITAL STOCK

Our articles of incorporation provide that we are authorized to issue 50 million shares of common stock, par value
$0.001 per share, and 75 million shares of preferred stock, par value $0.001 per share.

Common Stock

Voting Rights

The holders of our common stock are entitled to one vote per share on all matters to be voted upon by our
shareholders, including the election of directors. Cumulative voting is not permitted in the election of directors.

Dividend Rights

Subject to preferences that may apply to shares of preferred stock outstanding at the time, the holders of outstanding
shares of our common stock are entitled to receive dividends out of funds legally available if our board of directors, in
its discretion, determines to issue dividends and then only at the times and in the amounts that our board may
determine.

Liquidation Rights
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In the event of our liquidation, dissolution, or winding up, our common shareholders will receive ratably any net
assets that remain after the payment of all of our debts and other liabilities, subject to the senior rights of any
outstanding preferred stock.

Other

Our shares of common stock are not convertible into any other security and do not have any preemptive rights,
conversion rights, redemption rights or sinking fund provisions. The rights, preferences and privileges, including
voting rights, of holders of our common stock are subject to, and may be adversely affected by, the rights of the
holders of shares of preferred stock that the board may designate and issue in the future. There are currently no
preferred shares outstanding.

Preferred Stock

We are authorized to issue up to 75 million shares of preferred stock, in one or more series with such designations,
relative rights, preferences, voting rights, limitations, dividend rates, redemption prices, liquidation prices, conversion
rights, sinking or purchase fund rights, and other provisions as the board may fix or determine. Any series of preferred
stock may have rights and privileges superior to those of common stock.

No shares of preferred stock have been issued to date, nor do we have any currently designated shares of preferred
stock. We currently have no plans to issue any shares of preferred stock.

5
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Anti-Takeover Provisions Under Nevada Law.

Combinations with Interested Stockholder. Sections 78.411-78.444, inclusive, of the Nevada Revised Statutes (“NRS”)
contain provisions governing combinations with an interested stockholder. For purposes of the NRS, “combinations”
include: (i) any merger or consolidation with any interested stockholder, (ii) any sale, lease, exchange, mortgage,
pledge, transfer or other disposition to any interested stockholder of corporate assets with an aggregate market value
equal to 5% or more of the aggregate market value of the corporation’s consolidated assets, 5% or more of the
outstanding shares of the corporation or 10% or more of the earning power or net income of the corporation, (iii) the
issuance to any interested stockholder of voting shares (except pursuant to a share dividend or similar proportionate
distribution) with an aggregate market value equal to 5% or more of the aggregate market value of all the outstanding
shares of the corporation, (iv) the dissolution of the corporation if proposed by or on behalf of any interested
stockholder, (v) any reclassification of securities, recapitalization or corporate reorganization that will have the effect
of increasing the proportionate share of the corporation’s outstanding voting shares held by any interested stockholder
and (vi) any receipt by the interested stockholder of the benefit (except proportionately as a stockholder) of any loan,
advance, guarantee, pledge or other financial assistance. For purposes of the NRS, an “interested stockholder” is defined
to include any beneficial owner of more than 10% of any class of the voting securities of a Nevada corporation and
any person who is an affiliate or associate of the corporation and was at any time during the preceding three years the
beneficial owner or more than 10% of any class of the voting securities of the Nevada corporation.

Subject to certain exceptions, the provisions of the NRS governing combinations with interested stockholders provide
that a Nevada corporation may not engage in a combination with an interested stockholder for two years after the date
that the person first became an interested stockholder unless the combination or the transaction by which the person
first became an interested stockholder is approved by the board of directors before the person first became an
interested stockholder.

Control Share Acquisitions. The NRS also contains a “control share acquisitions statute.” If applicable to a Nevada
corporation this statute restricts the voting rights of certain stockholders referred to as “acquiring persons,” that acquire
or offer to acquire ownership of a “controlling interest” in the outstanding voting stock of an “issuing corporation.” For
purposes of these provisions a “controlling interest” means with certain exceptions the ownership of outstanding voting
stock sufficient to enable the acquiring person to exercise one-fifth or more but less than one-third, one-third or more
but less than a majority, or a majority or more of all voting power in the election of directors and “issuing corporation”
means a Nevada corporation that has 200 or more stockholders of record, at least 100 of whom have addresses in
Nevada appearing on the stock ledger of the corporation, and which does business in Nevada directly or through an
affiliated corporation. The voting rights of an acquiring person in the affected shares will be restored only if such
restoration is approved by the holders of a majority of the voting power of the corporation. The NRS allows a
corporation to “opt-out” of the control share acquisitions statute by providing in such corporation’s articles of
incorporation or bylaws that the control share acquisitions statute does not apply to the corporation or to an acquisition
of a controlling interest specifically by types of existing or future stockholders, whether or not identified.

Articles of Incorporation and Bylaws
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No Cumulative Voting.  Where cumulative voting is permitted in the election of directors, each share is entitled to as
many votes as there are directors to be elected and each shareholder may cast all of its votes for a single director
nominee or distribute them among two or more director nominees. Thus, cumulative voting makes it easier for a
minority shareholder to elect a director. Our articles of incorporation deny shareholders the right to vote cumulatively.

Authorized But Unissued Shares.  Our articles of incorporation permit the board to authorize the issuance of preferred
stock, and to designate the rights and preferences of our preferred stock, without obtaining shareholder approval. One
of the effects of undesignated preferred stock may be to enable the board to render more difficult or to discourage a
third party’s attempt to obtain control of Workhorse Group by means of a tender offer, proxy contest, merger, or
otherwise. The issuance of shares of preferred stock also may discourage a party from making a bid for the common
stock because the issuance may adversely affect the rights of the holders of common stock. For example, preferred
stock that we issue may rank prior to the common stock as to dividend rights, liquidation preference, or both, may
have special voting rights and may be convertible into shares of common stock. Accordingly, the issuance of shares of
preferred stock may discourage bids for our common stock or may otherwise adversely affect the market price of our
common stock.

Transfer Agent or Registrar

Empire Stock Transfer, Inc. is the transfer agent and registrar of our common stock.

6
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DESCRIPTION OF WARRANTS

We may issue warrants for the purchase of common stock or preferred stock. Warrants may be issued independently
or together with common stock or preferred stock offered by any prospectus supplement and may be attached to or
separate from any such offered securities. Series of warrants may be issued under a separate warrant agreement
entered into between us and a bank or trust company, as warrant agent, all as will be set forth in the prospectus
supplement relating to the particular issue of warrants. The warrant agent would act solely as our agent in connection
with the warrants and would not assume any obligation or relationship of agency or trust for or with any holders of
warrants or beneficial owners of warrants.

The following summary of certain provisions of the warrants does not purport to be complete and is subject to, and is
qualified in its entirety by reference to, all provisions of the warrant agreements.

Reference is made to the prospectus supplement relating to the particular issue of warrants offered pursuant to such
prospectus supplement for the terms of and information relating to such warrants, including, where applicable:

●
the number of shares of common stock or preferred stock purchasable upon the exercise of warrants to purchase
common stock or preferred stock and the price at which such number of shares of common stock or preferred stock
may be purchased upon such exercise;

●the date on which the right to exercise such warrants shall commence and the date on which such right shall expire;

●United States federal income tax consequences applicable to such warrants;

●the amount of warrants outstanding as of the most recent practicable date; and

●any other terms of such warrants.

Warrants will be issued in registered form only. The exercise price for warrants will be subject to adjustment in
accordance with the applicable prospectus supplement.

Each warrant will entitle the holder thereof to purchase such number of shares of common stock or preferred stock at
such exercise price as shall in each case be set forth in, or calculable from, the prospectus supplement relating to the
warrants, which exercise price may be subject to adjustment upon the occurrence of certain events as set forth in such
prospectus supplement. After the close of business on the expiration date, or such later date to which such expiration
date may be extended by us, unexercised warrants will become void. The place or places where, and the manner in
which, warrants may be exercised shall be specified in the prospectus supplement relating to such warrants.
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Prior to the exercise of any warrants to purchase common stock or preferred stock, holders of such warrants will not
have any of the rights of holders of common stock or preferred stock, as the case may be, purchasable upon such
exercise, including the right to receive payments of dividends, if any, on the common stock purchasable upon such
exercise, or to exercise any applicable right to vote.

7
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DESCRIPTION OF DEBT SECURITIES

We may issue debt securities together with other securities or separately, as described in the applicable prospectus
supplement, under an indenture to be entered into between our company and the trustee that meets certain
requirements identified in the applicable prospectus supplement.

We may issue the debt securities in one or more series with the same or various maturities, at par, at a premium, or at
a discount. We will describe the particular terms of each series of debt securities in a prospectus supplement relating
to that series, which we will file with the SEC.

The prospectus supplement will set forth, to the extent required, the following terms of the debt securities in respect of
which the prospectus supplement is delivered:

●the title of the series;

●the aggregate principal amount;

●the issue price or prices, expressed as a percentage of the aggregate principal amount of the debt securities;

●any limit on the aggregate principal amount;

●the date or dates on which principal is payable;

●the interest rate or rates (which may be fixed or variable) or, if applicable, the method used to determine such rate orrates;

●the date or dates from which interest, if any, will be payable and any regular record date for the interest payable;

●the terms and conditions upon which we may, or the holders may require us to, redeem or repurchase the debtsecurities;

●the denominations in which such debt securities may be issuable, if other than denominations of $1,000, or anyintegral multiple of that number;

●whether the debt securities are to be issuable in the form of certificated debt securities or global debt securities;

●the portion of principal amount that will be payable upon declaration of acceleration of the maturity date if other
than the principal amount of the debt securities;
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●if applicable, covenants affording holders of debt protection with respect to our operations, financial condition or
transactions involving us;

●the currency of denomination;

●the designation of the currency, currencies or currency units in which payment of principal and, if applicable,premium and interest, will be made;

●
if payments of principal and, if applicable, premium or interest, on the debt securities are to be made in one or more
currencies or currency units other than the currency of denominations, the manner in which the exchange rate with
respect to such payments will be determined;

●
if amounts of principal and, if applicable, premium and interest may be determined by reference to an index based
on a currency or currencies, or by reference to a commodity, commodity index, stock exchange index, or financial
index, then the manner in which such amounts will be determined;

●the provisions, if any, relating to any collateral provided for such debt securities;

●any events of default;

●the terms and conditions, if any, for conversion into or exchange for common shares;

●any depositaries, interest rate calculation agents, exchange rate calculation agents, or other agents; and

●whether such debt securities are senior securities or subordinated securities and the terms and conditions, if any,upon which the debt securities shall be subordinated in right of payment to other indebtedness of our company. 

One or more debt securities may be sold at a substantial discount below their stated principal amount. We may also
issue debt securities in bearer form, with or without coupons. If we issue discount debt securities or debt securities in
bearer form, we will describe material U.S. federal income tax considerations and other material special
considerations which apply to these debt securities in the applicable prospectus supplement.

8

Edgar Filing: Workhorse Group Inc. - Form S-3

22



We may issue debt securities denominated in or payable in a foreign currency or currencies or a foreign currency unit
or units. If we do, we will describe the restrictions, elections, and general tax considerations relating to the debt
securities and the foreign currency or currencies or foreign currency unit or units in the applicable prospectus
supplement.

The debt securities of a series may be issued in whole or in part in the form of one or more global securities that will
be deposited with, or on behalf of, a depositary identified in the prospectus supplement. Global securities will be
issued in registered form and in either temporary or definitive form. Unless and until it is exchanged in whole or in
part for individual debt securities, a global security may not be transferred except as a whole by the depositary for
such global security to a nominee of such depositary or by a nominee of such depositary to such depositary or another
nominee of such depositary or by such depositary or any such nominee to a successor of such depositary or a nominee
of such successor. The specific terms of the depositary arrangement with respect to any debt securities of a series and
the rights of and limitations upon owners of beneficial interests in a global security will be described in the applicable
prospectus supplement.

DESCRIPTION OF UNITS

The following description, together with the additional information we include in any applicable prospectus
supplement, summarizes the general features of the units that we may offer under this prospectus. We may issue units
consisting of two or more other constituent securities. These units may be issuable as, and for a specified period of
time may be transferable only as a single security, rather than as the separate constituent securities comprising such
units. While the features we have summarized below will generally apply to any units we may offer under this
prospectus, we will describe the particular terms of any units that we may offer in more detail in the applicable
prospectus supplement. The specific terms of any units may differ from the description provided below as a result of
negotiations with third parties in connection with the issuance of those units, as well as for other reasons. Because the
terms of any units we offer under a prospectus supplement may differ from the terms we describe below, you should
rely solely on information in the applicable prospectus supplement if that summary is different from the summary in
this prospectus.

We urge you to read the applicable prospectus supplement related to the specific units being offered, as well as the
complete instruments that contain the terms of the securities that comprise those units. Certain of those instruments, or
forms of those instruments, have been or will be filed as exhibits to the registration statement of which this prospectus
is a part, and supplements to those instruments or forms may be incorporated by reference into the registration
statement of which this prospectus is a part from reports we file with the Commission.

If we offer any units, certain terms of that series of units will be described in the applicable prospectus supplement,
including, without limitation, the following, as applicable:

●the title of the series of units;

●identification and description of the separate constituent securities comprising the units;
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●the price or prices at which the units will be issued;

●the date, if any, on and after which the constituent securities comprising the units will be separately transferable;

●a discussion of certain United States federal income tax considerations applicable to the units; and

●any other terms of the units and their constituent securities.

PLAN OF DISTRIBUTION

We may sell securities in and outside the United States through underwriters or dealers, directly to purchasers or
through agents or in ordinary brokerage transactions and transactions in which the broker-dealer solicits purchasers.
To the extent required by applicable law, a prospectus supplement will include the following information:

●the terms of the offering;

●the names of any underwriters or agents;

●the purchase price of the securities;

●the net proceeds to us from the sale of the securities;

●any delayed delivery arrangements;

●any underwriting discounts, commissions and other items constituting underwriters’ compensation;

●the initial public offering price;

●any discounts or concessions allowed or reallowed or paid to dealers; and

●any commissions paid to agents.

9
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Sale Through Underwriters or Dealers

If we use underwriters in the sale of securities, the underwriters will acquire the securities for their own account. The
underwriters may resell the securities from time to time in one or more transactions, including negotiated transactions,
at a fixed public offering price or at varying prices determined at the time of sale. Underwriters may offer securities to
the public either through underwriting syndicates represented by one or more managing underwriters or directly by
one or more firms acting as underwriters. Unless we inform you otherwise in the prospectus supplement, the
obligations of the underwriters to purchase the securities will be subject to conditions, and the underwriters will be
obligated to purchase all the securities if they purchase any securities. The underwriters may change from time to time
any initial public offering price and any discounts or concessions allowed or reallowed or paid to dealers.

During and after an offering through underwriters, the underwriters may purchase and sell the securities in the open
market. These transactions may include over allotment and stabilizing transactions and purchases to cover syndicate
short positions created in connection with the offering. The underwriters may also impose a penalty bid, whereby
selling concessions allowed to syndicate members or other broker-dealers for the offered securities sold for their
account may be reclaimed by the syndicate if such offered securities are repurchased by the syndicate in stabilizing or
covering transactions. These activities may stabilize, maintain or otherwise affect the market price of the offered
securities, which may be higher than the price that might otherwise prevail in the open market. If commenced, these
activities may be discontinued at any time.

If we use dealers in the sale of securities, we will sell the securities to them as principals. They may then resell the
securities to the public at varying prices determined by the dealers at the time of resale. The dealers participating in
any sale of the securities may be deemed to be underwriters within the meaning of the Securities Act with respect to
any sale of such securities. We will include in any prospectus supplement the names of the dealers and the terms of
the transactions.

We will bear costs relating to all of the securities being registered under this registration statement of which this
prospectus forms a part.

Any broker-dealers or other persons acting on our behalf that participate with us in the distribution of the securities
may be deemed to be underwriters and any commissions received or profit realized by them on the resale of the
securities may be deemed to be underwriting discounts and commissions under the Securities Act. As of the date of
this prospectus, we are not a party to any agreement, arrangement or understanding between any broker or dealer and
us with respect to the offer or sale of the securities pursuant to this prospectus.
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Pursuant to a requirement by the Financial Industry Regulatory Authority, or FINRA, the maximum commission or
discount to be received by any FINRA member or independent broker/dealer may not be greater than eight percent
(8%) of the gross proceeds received by us for the sale of any securities being registered pursuant to SEC Rule 415
under the Securities Act. If more than 5% of the net proceeds of any offering of securities made under this prospectus
will be received by a FINRA member participating in the offering or its affiliates or associated persons of such
FINRA member, the offering will be conducted in accordance with FINRA Conduct Rule 5121.

Direct Sales and Sales Through Agents

We may sell the securities directly. In that event, no underwriters or agents would be involved. We may also sell the
securities through agents we designate from time to time. In the prospectus supplement, we will name any agent
involved in the offer or sale of the securities, and we will describe any commissions payable by us to the agent. Unless
we inform you otherwise in the prospectus supplement, any agent will agree to use its reasonable best efforts to solicit
purchases for the period of its appointment.

10
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We may sell the securities directly to institutional investors or others who may be deemed to be underwriters within
the meaning of the Securities Act with respect to any sale of the securities. We will describe the terms of any such
sales in the prospectus supplement.

Delayed Delivery Contracts

If we so indicate in the prospectus supplement, we may authorize agents, underwriters or dealers to solicit offers from
certain types of institutions to purchase securities from us at the public offering price under delayed delivery contracts.
These contracts would provide for payment and delivery on a specified date in the future. The contracts would be
subject only to those conditions described in the prospectus supplement. The prospectus supplement will describe the
commission payable for solicitation of those contracts.

Subscription Offerings

We may also make direct sales through subscription rights distributed to our existing stockholders on a pro rata basis,
which may or may not be transferable. In any distribution of subscription rights to our stockholders, if all of the
underlying securities are not subscribed for, we may then sell the unsubscribed securities directly to third parties or
may engage the services of one or more underwriters, dealers or agents, including standby underwriters, to sell the
unsubscribed securities to third parties.

General Information

We may have agreements with the agents, dealers and underwriters to indemnify them against civil liabilities,
including liabilities under the Securities Act, or to contribute with respect to payments that the agents, dealers or
underwriters may be required to make. Agents, dealers and underwriters may engage in transactions with us or
perform services for us in the ordinary course of their businesses.

LEGAL MATTERS

Certain legal matters with respect to the shares of our securities offered by this prospectus will be passed upon for us
by Fleming PLLC, Rockville Centre, New York. Any underwriters, dealers or agents will be advised about other
issues relating to any transaction by their own legal counsel.
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EXPERTS

The consolidated financial statements and financial statement schedules incorporated in this prospectus by reference
from Workhorse Group Inc.’s Annual Report on Form 10-K for the year ended December 31, 2015 and 2014, have
been audited by Clark, Schaefer, Hackett & Co., an independent registered public accounting firm, as stated in their
report, which is incorporated herein by reference, and have been so incorporated in reliance upon the report of such
firm given upon their authority as experts in accounting and auditing.

INFORMATION INCORPORATED BY REFERENCE

This prospectus is part of a registration statement on Form S-3 filed by us with the SEC. This prospectus does not
contain all of the information included in the registration statement, certain parts of which are omitted in accordance
with the rules and regulations of the SEC.

The SEC allows us to “incorporate by reference” certain documents that we file with the SEC, which means that we can
disclose important information to you by referring you to those documents that are considered part of this prospectus.
The information incorporated by reference is considered to be part of this prospectus, and information that we file
later with the SEC will automatically update and supersede this information. We incorporate by reference into this
prospectus the documents listed below:

●our Annual Report on Form 10-K for the year ended December 31, 2015 as filed on March 25, 2016(File No. 001-37673),

11
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●our Quarterly Report on Form 10-Q for the quarter ended March 31, 2016 as filed on May 16, 2016(File No. 001-37673),

●current reports filed on July 1 , 2016 (File No. 001-37673), and

●

any future filings with the SEC pursuant to Sections 13(a), 13(c), 14 or 15(d) of the Exchange Act, including those
made after the date of filing the initial registration statement and prior to effectiveness of the registration statement,
until the termination of the offerings under this prospectus; provided that this prospectus will not incorporate any
information we may furnish to the SEC under Item 2.02 or Item 7.01 of Form 8-K.

You may request copies of these filings, at no cost, by writing or calling us at:

Workhorse Group Inc.

100 Commerce Drive

Loveland, Ohio  45140

513-360-4704

Attn: Julio C. Rodriguez, Chief Financial Officer

Telephone: 513-360-4704

Our SEC filings are also available on our website at www.workhorse.com. The other information on our website is
not, and you must not consider the information to be, a part of this prospectus.

WHERE YOU CAN FIND MORE INFORMATION

We file annual, quarterly and current reports, proxy statements and other information with the SEC. You may read and
copy any document we file with the SEC at the SEC’s Public Reference Room at 100 F. Street, N.E., Washington,
D.C., 20549. You can request copies of these documents by contacting the SEC upon payment of fees prescribed by
the SEC and paying a fee for the copying cost. Information on the operation of the Public Reference Room can be
obtained by calling the SEC at 1-800-SEC-0330. Our SEC filings are also available to the public from the SEC’s
website at www.sec.gov.

12
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PART II

INFORMATION NOT REQUIRED IN PROSPECTUS

Item 14. Other Expenses of Issuance and Distribution

The following table sets forth the estimated costs and expenses to be paid by Workhorse Group Inc. in connection
with the issuance and distribution of the securities being registered:

SEC registration fee $15,105.00
Legal fees and expenses *
Accounting fees and expenses *
Printing and mailing fees *
Miscellaneous *
Total *

*The applicable prospectus supplement will set forth the estimated aggregate amount of expenses payable withrespect to any offering of securities.

Item 15. Indemnification of Directors and Officers

Under Nevada law, a corporation shall indemnify a director or officer against expenses, including attorneys’ fees,
actually and reasonably incurred by him, to the extent the director or officer has been successful on the merits or
otherwise in defense of any action, suit or proceeding. A corporation may indemnify a director or officer who was or
is a party or is threatened to be made a party to any threatened, pending or completed action, suit or proceeding,
whether civil, criminal, administrative or investigative, against expenses, including attorneys’ fees, judgments, fines
and amounts paid in settlement actually and reasonably incurred by him or her in connection with the action, suit or
proceeding. Excepted from that immunity are:

●a willful failure to deal fairly with the company or its stockholders in connection with a matter in which the directorhas a material conflict of interest;

●
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a violation of criminal law (unless the director had reasonable cause to believe that his or her conduct was lawful or
no reasonable cause to believe that his or her conduct was unlawful);

●a transaction from which the director derived an improper personal profit;

●and willful misconduct.

Our bylaws include an indemnification provision under which we have the power to indemnify our directors, officers
and former officers and directors (including heirs and personal representatives) against all costs, charges and expenses
actually and reasonably incurred, including an amount paid to settle an action or satisfy a judgment to which the
director or officer is made a party by reason of being or having been a director or officer of Workhorse Group Inc. or
any of our subsidiaries.

Our bylaws also provide that our directors may cause us to purchase and maintain insurance for the benefit of a person
who is or was serving as a director, officer, employee or agent of Workhorse Group Inc. or any of our subsidiaries
(including heirs and personal representatives) against a liability incurred by him or her as our director, officer,
employee or agent.

Item 16. Exhibits

The exhibits to the registration statement required by Item 601 of Regulation S-K are listed in the exhibit index on
page II-6.
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Item 17. Undertakings

(a) The undersigned registrant hereby undertakes:

(1) To file, during any period in which offers or sales are being made, a post-effective amendment to this registration
statement:

(i) To include any prospectus required by Section 10(a)(3) of the Securities Act;

(ii) To reflect in the prospectus any facts or events arising after the effective date of the registration statement (or the
most recent post-effective amendment thereof) which, individually or in the aggregate, represent a fundamental
change in the information set forth in the registration statement. Notwithstanding the foregoing, any increase or
decrease in volume of securities offered (if the total dollar value of securities offered would not exceed that which was
registered) and any deviation from the low or high end of the estimated maximum offering range may be reflected in
the form of prospectus filed with the Commission pursuant to Rule 424(b) if, in the aggregate, the changes in volume
and price represent no more than 20 percent change in the maximum aggregate offering price set forth in the
“Calculation of Registration Fee” table in the effective registration statement;

(iii) To include any material information with respect to the plan of distribution not previously disclosed in the
registration statement or any material change to such information in the registration statement;

(A) Provided, however, that paragraphs (a)(1)(i), (a)(1)(ii) and (a)(1)(iii) do not apply if the information required to be
included in a post-effective amendment by those paragraphs is contained in reports filed with or furnished to the
Commission by the registrant pursuant to Section 13 or 15(d) of the Exchange Act, that are incorporated by reference
in the registration statement, or is contained in a form of prospectus filed pursuant to Rule 424(b) that is a part of the
registration statement.

(2) That, for the purpose of determining any liability under the Securities Act, each such post-effective amendment
shall be deemed to be a new registration statement relating to the securities offered therein, and the offering of such
securities at that time shall be deemed to be the initial bona fide offering thereof.
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(3) To remove from registration by means of a post-effective amendment any of the securities being registered which
remain unsold at the termination of the offering.

(4) That, for the purpose of determining liability under the Securities Act to any purchaser:

(i) Each prospectus filed by the registrant pursuant to Rule 424(b)(3) shall be deemed to be part of the registration
statement as of the date the filed prospectus was deemed part of and included in the registration statement; and

(ii) Each prospectus required to be filed pursuant to Rule 424(b)(2), (b)(5), or (b)(7) as part of a registration statement
in reliance on Rule 430B relating to an offering made pursuant to Rule 415(a)(1)(i), (vii), or (x) for the purpose of
providing the information required by section 10(a) of the Securities Act shall be deemed to be part of and included in
the registration statement as of the earlier of the date such form of prospectus is first used after effectiveness or the
date of the first contract of sale of securities in the offering described in the prospectus. As provided in Rule 430B, for
liability purposes of the issuer and any person that is at that date an underwriter, such date shall be deemed to be a
new effective date of the registration statement relating to the securities in the registration statement to which that
prospectus relates, and the offering of such securities at that time shall be deemed to be the initial bona fide offering
thereof. Provided, however, that no statement made in a registration statement or prospectus that is part of the
registration statement or made in a document incorporated or deemed incorporated by reference into the registration
statement or prospectus that is part of the registration statement will, as to a purchaser with a time of contract of sale
prior to such effective date, supersede or modify any statement that was made in the registration statement or
prospectus that was part of the registration statement or made in any such document immediately prior to such
effective date.

II-2
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(iii) For the purpose of determining liability under the Securities Act to any purchaser, each prospectus required to be
filed pursuant to Rule 424(b) as part of a registration statement relating to an offering, other than registration
statements relying on Rule 430B or other than prospectuses filed in reliance on Rule 430(A), shall be deemed to be
part of and included in the registration statement as of the date it is first used after effectiveness. Provided, however,
that no statement made in a registration statement or prospectus that is part of the registration statement or made in a
document incorporated or deemed incorporated by reference into the registration statement or prospectus that is part of
the registration statement will, as to a purchaser with a time of contract of sale prior to such first use, supersede or
modify any statement that was made in the registration statement or prospectus that was part of the registration
statement or made in any such document immediately prior to such date of first use.

(5) That, for the purpose of determining liability of the registrant under the Securities Act of 1933 to any purchaser in
the initial distribution of the securities:

The undersigned registrant undertakes that in a primary offering of securities of the undersigned registrant pursuant to
this registration statement, regardless of the underwriting method used to sell the securities to the purchaser, if the
securities are offered or sold to such purchaser by means of any of the following communications, the undersigned
registrant will be a seller to the purchaser and will be considered to offer or sell such securities to such purchaser:

(i) Any preliminary prospectus or prospectus of the undersigned registrant relating to the offering required to be filed
pursuant to Rule 424;

(ii) Any free writing prospectus relating to the offering prepared by or on behalf of the undersigned registrant or used
or referred to by the undersigned registrant;

(iii) The portion of any other free writing prospectus relating to the offering containing material information about
such undersigned registrant or its securities provided by or on behalf of such undersigned registrant; and

(iv) Any other communication that is an offer in the offering made by the undersigned registrant to the purchaser.

(b) The undersigned registrant hereby undertakes that, for purposes of determining any liability under the Securities
Act, each filing of the registrant’s annual report pursuant to Section 13(a) or 15(d) of the Exchange Act (and, where
applicable, each filing of an employee benefit plan’s annual report pursuant to Section 15(d) of the Exchange Act) that
is incorporated by reference in the registration statement shall be deemed to be a new registration statement relating to
the securities offered therein, and the offering of such securities at that time shall be deemed to be the initial bona fide
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offering thereof.

(c) Insofar as indemnification for liabilities arising under the Securities Act may be permitted to directors, officers and
controlling persons of the registrant pursuant to the foregoing provisions, or otherwise, the registrant has been advised
that in the opinion of the SEC such indemnification is against public policy as expressed in the Securities Act and is,
therefore, unenforceable. In the event that a claim for indemnification against such liabilities (other than the payment
by the registrant of expenses incurred or paid by a director, officer or controlling person of the registrant in the
successful defense of any action, suit or proceeding) is asserted by such director, officer or controlling person in
connection with the securities being registered, the registrant will, unless in the opinion of its counsel the matter has
been settled by controlling precedent, submit to a court of appropriate jurisdiction the question whether such
indemnification by it is against public policy as expressed in the Securities Act and will be governed by the final
adjudication of such issue.

(d) The undersigned registrant hereby undertakes that:

(1) For purposes of determining any liability under the Securities Act, the information omitted from the form of
prospectus filed as part of this registration statement in reliance upon Rule 430A and contained in a form of
prospectus filed by the registrant pursuant to Rule 424(b)(1) or (4) or 497(h) under the Securities Act shall be deemed
to be part of this registration statement as of the time it was declared effective.

(2) For the purposes of determining any liability under the Securities Act, each post-effective amendment that contains
a form of prospectus shall be deemed to be a new registration statement relating to the securities offered therein, and
the offering of such securities at that time shall be deemed to be the initial bona fide offering thereof. 
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SIGNATURES

Pursuant to the requirements of the Securities Act of 1933, the registrant certifies that it has reasonable grounds to
believe that it meets all of the requirements for filing on Form S-3 and has duly caused this registration statement to be
signed on its behalf by the undersigned, thereunto duly authorized, in the City of Loveland, State of Ohio, on August
11, 2016.

Workhorse Group Inc.

By: /s/ Stephen S. Burns
Stephen S. Burns
Chief Executive Officer and Director
(Principal Executive Officer)

POWER OF ATTORNEY

KNOW ALL PERSONS BY THESE PRESENTS, that each person whose signature appears below hereby
constitutes and appoints Stephen S. Burns and Julio Rodriguez, and each of them acting individually, his or her true
and lawful attorney-in-fact and agent, each with full power of substitution and resubstitution, for him or her and in his
or her name, place and stead, in any and all capacities, to sign any and all amendments (including post-effective
amendments) to this registration statement and to sign any and all registration statements, and any and all amendments
thereto (including post-effective amendments) relating to the offering of securities as this registration statement that
are filed pursuant to Rule 462(b) promulgated under the Securities Act of 1933, as amended, and to file the same, with
all exhibits thereto, and other documents in connection therewith, with the Securities and Exchange Commission and
any other regulatory authority, granting unto said attorney-in-fact and agent, full power and authority to do and
perform each and every act and thing requisite and necessary to be done in connection therewith, as fully to all intents
and purposes as such person might or could do in person, hereby ratifying and confirming all that said attorney-in-fact
and agent, his substitute or substitutes, may lawfully do or cause to be done by virtue hereof.

Pursuant to the requirements of the Securities Act of 1933, this registration statement has been signed by the following
persons in the capacities and on the dates indicated.

Signature Title Date
/s/ Stephen S. Burns Chief Executive Officer and Director August 11, 2016
Stephen S. Burns (Principal Executive Officer)
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/s/ Julio C. Rodriguez Chief Financial Officer August 11, 2016
Julio C. Rodriguez (Principal Financial and Accounting Officer)

/s/ Raymond J. Chess Director August 11, 2016
Raymond J. Chess

/s/ Gerald B. Budde Director August 11, 2016
Gerald B. Budde

/s/ H. Benjamin Samuels Director August 11, 2016
H. Benjamin Samuels

/s/ James E. Taylor Director August 11, 2016
James E. Taylor
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EXHIBIT INDEX

Exhibit Number Description
1.1  Form of Underwriting Agreement (a)
4.1 Specimen Stock Certificate (a)
4.2 Form of Senior Debt Securities Indenture (a)
4.3 Form of Subordinated Debt Securities Indenture (a)
5.1 Opinion of Fleming PLLC
23.1 Consent of Clark, Schaefer, Hackett & Co.
23.2 Consent of Fleming PLLC (included in Exhibit 5.1)
24.1 Power of Attorney (included on the signature page)

(a)To be filed by amendment or as exhibit(s) to a Current Report on Form 8-K and incorporated herein by reference,as applicable
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